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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 14 August, 2019 10:31 AM

To: Darla Balingit

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 08711118 - THIRD PARTY CLAIM // SLE5912S *LKK REF: 

CC4/LCR18022416/Upa3

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Darla, 

 

We refer to our below email. 

 

Please forward the LOD to us once available. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June, 2019 10:58 AM 

To: Darla Balingit 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 08711118 - THIRD PARTY CLAIM // SLE5912S *LKK REF: CC4/LCR18022416/Upa3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Darla, 

 

Further to our below email. 
   
** Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental 

receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 8:16 AM 

To: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 08711118 - THIRD PARTY CLAIM // SLE5912S *LKK REF: CC4/LCR18022416/Upa3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Darla, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

  

For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $1,400.00(before GST) with 2 repair days. 
   
** Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental 

receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
  
Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval. 

 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May 2019 7:51 AM 

To: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 08711118 - THIRD PARTY CLAIM // SLE5912S *LKK REF: CC4/LCR18022416/Upa3 
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Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sirs/ Mdm, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / 

under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above 

mentioned case. 

 

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of 

repair to your client’s vehicle. 

 

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the 

accident. 

 

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor. 

 

Please note that all finalisation subject insurer’s approval. 

 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

From: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 10:29 AM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Fwd: OUR REF: 08711118 - THIRD PARTY CLAIM // SLE5912S *LKK REF: CC4/LCR18022416/Upa3 

 

Dear Hsiao, 

 

Any update with the liability? 

 

Thank you 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg> 

Date: Tue, Mar 12, 2019 at 10:02 AM 

Subject: Re: OUR REF: 08711118 - THIRD PARTY CLAIM // SLE5912S *LKK REF: CC4/LCR18022416/Upa3 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
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Dear Hsiao, 

 

Any update regarding this matter? 

 

Thank you! 

 

On Tue, Jan 22, 2019 at 5:02 PM Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg> wrote: 

Hi  

 

As requested, please see attached accident photographs and SLT5202D driver particulars. 

 

 

 

On Tue, Jan 22, 2019 at 4:05 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Darla, 

  

Please be informed that our insured driver has yet lodge the accident report. 

  

Kindly advise if there is video footage of the accident or scene photos taken after the accident on this 

matter. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 18 December 2018 5:07 PM 

To: 'Darla Balingit' <darla@autoncars.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 08711118 - THIRD PARTY CLAIM // SLE5912S *LKK REF: CC4/LCR18022416/Upa3 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Darla, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that our insured has yet lodge the accident. 

  

We will get back to you asap. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

 

  

  

From: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 18 December 2018 5:01 PM 
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To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Fwd: OUR REF: 08711118 - THIRD PARTY CLAIM // SLE5912S *LKK REF: CC4/LCR18022416/Upa3 

  

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

  

Kindly update regarding the liability. 

  

Can we do direct settlement for this case? 

  

Thank you! 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg> 

Date: Mon, Dec 17, 2018 at 11:46 AM 

Subject: Re: OUR REF: 08711118 - THIRD PARTY CLAIM // SLE5912S *LKK REF: CC4/LCR18022416/Upa3 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

  

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

  

Any update on the liability? 

  

Thank you! 

  

On Fri, Dec 14, 2018 at 9:57 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Darla, 

  

We are pending for insured GIA report from AIG.  

  

We will get back to you once we receive GIA report. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

 

  

  

From: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 14 December 2018 9:48 AM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: OUR REF: 08711118 - THIRD PARTY CLAIM // SLE5912S 

  

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEHICLE SLE5912S AND VEHICLE SLT5202D ON 22/11/2018   

 

  

Kindly confirm liability and if we can do direct settlement 

  

Thank you! 

--  

Best Regards, 

Darla Balingit 
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Auto N Cars Services Pte Ltd 

  

m: +65 8499 3326 

o : +65 6555 2909 Fax : 6841 7181 

e: darla@autoncars.com.sg 

web site : www.autoncars.com.sg 

office: Auto Bay@ Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Blk 1 #01-04  

Singapore 417883 

 

 

  

--  

Best Regards, 

Darla Balingit 

Auto N Cars Services Pte Ltd 

  

m: +65 8499 3326 

o : +65 6555 2909 Fax : 6841 7181 

e: darla@autoncars.com.sg 

web site : www.autoncars.com.sg 

office: Auto Bay@ Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Blk 1 #01-04  

Singapore 417883 

 

 

  

--  

Best Regards, 

Darla Balingit 
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Auto N Cars Services Pte Ltd 

  

m: +65 8499 3326 

o : +65 6555 2909 Fax : 6841 7181 

e: darla@autoncars.com.sg 

web site : www.autoncars.com.sg 

office: Auto Bay@ Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Blk 1 #01-04  

Singapore 417883 

 

 

 

--  
Best Regards, 

Darla Balingit 

Auto N Cars Services Pte Ltd 

  

m: +65 8499 3326 

o : +65 6555 2909 Fax : 6841 7181 

e: darla@autoncars.com.sg 

web site : www.autoncars.com.sg 

office: Auto Bay@ Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Blk 1 #01-04  

Singapore 417883 

 

 

 

--  
Best Regards, 

Darla Balingit 

Auto N Cars Services Pte Ltd 

  

m: +65 8499 3326 

o : +65 6555 2909 Fax : 6841 7181 

e: darla@autoncars.com.sg 

web site : www.autoncars.com.sg 

office: Auto Bay@ Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Blk 1 #01-04  

Singapore 417883 

 

 

 

--  
Best Regards, 

Darla Balingit 

Auto N Cars Services Pte Ltd 

  

m: +65 8499 3326 

o : +65 6555 2909 Fax : 6841 7181 

e: darla@autoncars.com.sg 

web site : www.autoncars.com.sg 

office: Auto Bay@ Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
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Blk 1 #01-04  

Singapore 417883 


