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F IZES  Comunams

i i, . BB BB Pie Lid Company Registration No. 1996071980

S1URIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA URL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065 62364315

Your Ref: DIRDORTRIMESH Date: 13 December 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18022383/Asd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Lid

Dear SirfMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SJX 2857L .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 12/12/2018 at the premises of M/s MG Solution Pte Ltd and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8% 6,RR2.57
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 4.372.93
“Check” Items Amount 1 5%
Market Value 1 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 58
Nett Value : S8

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages

at the front n/s portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 4 Days

Yours faithfully,
Adrian Ling
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capltal Insurance Limited comeg. Mo, L350000060  GST Reg. he M2 00016769
B Raties Quay 421-00 Singapore DAB5E0

Tet [Bh) 6222 2311 Faw (B5) 6222 3547

Claims & Mater Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: {65) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3849
wiwnw msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
12-12-2018 Our Ref No. D18008783MF3H
10-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHB4611E Third Party Vehicle. SJX2857L

23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 AAS KAKI BUKIT CENTRE#02-03 VICOM INSPECTION
CENTRE

HONG

67444165/ 0 Fax No. 67444604

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc: Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD Attention. NIL
A TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is @ computer generated letter, no signature required.

r oot BT (NELEANCE GROUF




Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=
Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 4:50 PM

To: 'Sithara’; "CWS Maotor Claims'

Cc: SUR: Admin-D (LKKAuUto); assignments

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008789MFSH/1
Attachments: SJX 2857L - Preli Advise -.pdf

Dear Sithara,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIX 2857L.

Thank you,
Best Regards,
Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4085833)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 4:41 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008789MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 3:58 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008789MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS5 within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com
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12/13/2018

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner D Type:

Owner 1Dk
Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date;
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Maodel:

Primary Caolour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis Na.:

Maxirmum Power Cutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 13 Dec 2018

PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

Singapore NRIC
34817

SIK2B57L
Mo

13 Dec 2018
CITROEN

C4 5K 1.6L VTI AT ABS D/AB P-5R 50R 2WD

Sikver

2009

10FHBV0&81224
YFFLCSFWFIY 5928594
88.0 kW (118 bhp)
$16,065.00

31 May 2010

31 May 2010

2

$16,065.00

Yes
a0 May 2020
$8,835.00

30 May 2020

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$27.389.00

£4,005.00

$12,840.00

OK
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MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933

Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376
Reg. No: 201427944N

Email : mg3solutioni@ gmail.com

TO : FIRST CAPITAL DATE : 12112/2018
ATTENTION : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT JOB TYPE : T/P CLAIM
ESTIMATE REPORT

VEHICLE DETAILS

VEHICLE NO ¢ SJX2B5TL

MODEL : CITROEN C4 1.6MT

CHASSIS NO

ACCIDENT DETAILS DATE : 10-Dec-18

TIME : 20:00HRS

THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR | CONTACT JACK LI

CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS

SIN DESCRIPTION aQTy u';';t'éET TD;;:;:'EST
1|{FRONT BUMPER ?E‘H—‘—‘-—-A 1 5 151160 | % 1,.511.60 e
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER /e kM g | & 97.20 | 8 19440 | 1727
3|FRONT BUMPER PAD ibu 1 s 28890 | 5 28800 | —
4|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP AW - 5 15 320.50 | § 32050 | €
5|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH Cocl—<' | 1 |5 180.00 | & 180.00 | ©
6|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH CHROME “mat 1| 8 20350 | § 203.50 | 4.
7lHEaDLAMe G4 1 |s 182000|s  182000]|”
B|HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET pL 1 ] 12250 | & 12250 | A
9|FRONT FEDNER LH Q'TJ’ 1 |8 855.90 | § 655.90 |4

l TOTAL PRICE 5 5,287.30
LESS 10% $ 529.73
SUBTOTALPRICE §  4,767.57
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

SIN DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT S/NETT | TOTAL SINETT
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS{SET) /te~— 1 5 2500 | % 25.00 |7
2|HEADLAMP CLIPS(SET)  Mae 1 ]s 20.00 | § 20007 .

TOTAL $ 45.00



CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING (FRONT)

PANEL BEATING, REMOVING AND A1 40
1|REPLACING PARTS $800.00
2|SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA ssopd| T
3| TUFF COAT $20000,
4|WIRING CHECK $120,00 50

F
5|CONDUCT WATER LEAKAGE TEST $150.00|<
TOTAL $2,070.00
ESTIMATE REPORT
TOTAL PARTS COST  : § 4,812.57
TOTAL LABOUR COST : § 2,070.00
TOTAL REPAIR COST : § 6,882.57
APPROVED DETAILS
SURVEYOR
CONTACT NO : EAX

PART BY PART / LUMP SUM
NO OF DAYS | Adnin

k& Er/
[ el

0% ?07,-9 .



MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376
Reg. No: 201427944N

Email : mg3sohution@gmail.com

TO : FIRST CAPITAL DATE s 12/12/2078

ATTENTION - MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT JOB TYPE : T/P CLAIM

ESTIMATE REPORT

VEHICLE DETAILS

VEHICLE DETAILS s

VEHICLE NO . SJX2857L gt‘”( 4

MODEL « CITROEN C4 1.8MT .
VEILCSFNFTYS32874

CHASSIS NO

ACCIDENT DETAILS DATE : 10-Dec-18
TIME : 20:00HRS

THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR / CONTACT . JACK LI

CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS

SIN DESCRIPTION ol Tt | Sees™
1|FRONT BUMPER %'E‘-—-A 1 |s 1511605  15me0T™ 1=
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER Alfe R 2 1% 9720 | § 1940|172+
3|FRONT BUMPER PAD w T - 288.90 | 5 288.90 | ~—
4{FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP AL «~ 1 I's 32050 | $ 32050 | &
5|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH gl 1158 180.00 | § 180.00 | =~
5|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH CHROME "t 1 |5 20350 | $ 203.50 | 4.
7lveaoLave O 1 |§  1.82000]5 1520004 1632
8|HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET M€ a— 1 |3 12250 | § 22.50 | A
9|FRONT FEDNER LH Rﬂ-p_.r" 1 |3 655.00 | 8 655.00 |1
r3 “%7i/0 TOTAL PRICE $ 5,257.30
3 120-3 ? LESS 10% $ 529.73
SUB TOTAL PRICE  § 4767.57 1 1N
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
SIN DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT SINETT | TOTAL S/NETT
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS(SET) /le~ 1 |3 2500 | $ 25.00 | 7
2| HEADLAMP CLIPSISET)  Me~r 1 |s 20.00 | $ 20007 12,

%

{ TOTAL 3 4500 1<



Aa

CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING {FRONT)

o
PANEL BEATING, REMOVING AND
1|REFLACING PARTS EM LEM
[#
2|SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA ssopadd] TOO
£
3|TUFF COAT §200.00) X
4{WIRING CHECK s12006] 3°
Fd
5|CONDUCT WATER LEAKAGE TEST $150.00}C

TOTAL

ESTIMATE REPORT

TOTAL PARTS COST B 4 812.57
TOTAL LABOUR COST : & 2,070.00
TOTAL REPAIR COST 8 6,882.57
APPROVED DETAILS
SURVEYOR
CONTACT NO
PART BY PART / LUMP SUM
NO OF DAYS
i) Ay,
4+ g o0
- £lecd
..--'Q--\: ""_:'I __(";*;_r Jlllc
LKK Auto Consuyltants hence notify _ %-r,-_:.l. - {%
the Repairer of the following. RERT T gl
« To resurvey beforelafier spray painting = ..'-J"'": ‘:;,F\u 9
« To desplay damaged part(s) dusmg resurvey L
« Parts prices are subpect to conlrmalion
» Third party Survey 15 ona “Winout Prejudice” basis
« Mo ienal modification(s} 15 allowes
» Sypplemantary hemys| must De res eyt and
i subject ta final approval from Insurance Company
Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:

s207000 U



' Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9807158-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCIMB022383/Asd3n2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 088677 Ol SRR Nmunlwnl‘“"“
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 4611E Veh. Inspected SJX 2857L
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18008789MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 12122018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model CITROEN C4 c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. VFTLCSFWFIY 592894 Colour SILVER
Odometer 128118 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55R16 NEXEN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 NEXEN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 NEXEMN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 NEXEMN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  10/12/2018 |Inspection Date 12/12/2018
Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-03B
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,
SINGAPORE 415833
5a, Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMP\TED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 402933
TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No: 100B07108R GST Reg. No. 10-0607108-R Page Mo. 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJX 2857L
Qty Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 1,511.60 1,250.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @$97.20 N/S NECESSARY 194.40 97.20
1|FRONT BUMPER PAD DEFORMED 288.90 288.90
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP NOT NECESSARY 320.50 -
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH CRACKED 180,00 180.00
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH CHROME NOT NECESSARY 203.50 -
1|HEADLAMP cut 1,820.00 1,650.00
1|HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 122.50 -
1|FRONT FENDER LH TO REPAIR SEE 655.90 -
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -529.73 -346.61
4,767.57 3,119.49
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 2500 25.00
1|SET HEADLAMP CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 10.00
45.00 35.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING REMOVING AND REPLACING 800.00 400.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT FENDER
LH
SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA BOO.CO 400.00
TUFF COAT. NOT NECESSARY 200.00 .
WIRING CHECK 120.00 30.00
CONDUCT WATER LEAKAGE TEST, NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
2,070.00 830.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,882.57 3,984.49

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18022383/Asd3n2




1 74 7%

:J_J,_I_LQ
FPage No.:2 of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,100.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref Mo. CS/FCI18022383/Asd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $19,500.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $12,840.00=NETT VALUE: $6,660.00

r gI; i‘g‘
ADRIAN LING WA| PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
e liabllity of responsibility whatscever, in contact or ter, s accented to any third party who may reply on the R
Repori. in whale of in part. doas 80 at his or ber own fsk.




