Asher !‘mﬂ !LKI{Autn]

From: ONG Ul LI <llong®@lonpac.com>

Sent Monday, 23 September 2019 4:15 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving GU997E (Ol ; LPC -

18/18/18/VCO5/021200) and GBES&24S (TP : LKK REF - CCE/LPC1B022372/Kpa3) on
07/12/2018 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Asher

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Te!_: (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all "% lonpac.com.sqg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 1B September 2019 4:07 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cec: MT_Claim_5G; KKLau

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GU9S7E (Ol : LPC - 18/18/18/VC05/021200)
and GBE56245 (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC18022372/Kpa3) on 07/12/2018 [External General]

Hi Li Li,

We refer to your email below.

Third party estimator submitted the estimate consistent with the damages without inflating the repair cost.

Therefore the adjustment Is very minimal.



Thank You,

Best Regords

Asher Sng | Cosa Hancller

LKK Auto Consuliants Pte Lid

phone: $841-4051 | emalt: gsnemng@kkouio.oom | fox; 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industial Park. U Avenue |, #02.25 | 5/408923)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 September 2019 5:15 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto . com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; KKLau <kklau@®Ikkauto.coms

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GU9S7E (Ol : LPC - 18/18/18/VC05/021200)
and GBES5624S (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC18022372/Kpa3) on 07/12/2018 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Asher

The adjustment to the cost of repair is minimal. The overall deduction (after survey fee) for this
case is merely 2%.

This is not what we want to achieve for Direct Settlement which gives the workshops fast
settlement/payment.

Can you re-look into this case and see if you can increase the cost savings further?

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all "M lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto: AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2019 10:00 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Ce: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GUSS7E (OI : LPC - 18/18/18/VC05/021200)
and GBE5624S (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC18022372/Kpa3) on 07/12/2018




Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter

We nave highlighted to your good office on 14/12/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlemeant with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability

Summary to offer to repairer CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD Is as follows: -

Claimed Amount | Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (W/GST) $862398 $7971.29
2 Loss of Rental (w/GST)(8days x $85) | $ 72760 $ 72760 (Bdays x $85)
3. LTAJGIA Search Fee ] B.00 $§ BOO
Total | $9,359.59 $8.706.89

**5 days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herawith for your perusal and reference.
The above is for your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LEE Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 4841-4051 | emdl; aikenno@lkguic.com | fax 4741-4108
Bik 51, Poya Uol Industrial Pork, Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | ${408933)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.cams

Sent: Friday, 14 December 2018 4:42 PM

To: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@|kkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.coms>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GU9S7E (01 : LPC - 18/ 18/18/VC05/021200) and GBES56245 (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/LPC18022372/Kpa3) on 07/12/2018

Without Prejudice
Dear Mei Kwan
Please see attached for our Insured’'s GIA report.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706



_’ The all i#% . lonpac.com.sg

— N

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto: Meikwan @ |kkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 14 December, 2018 3:46 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ericwoo; ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GU9S97E (OI : LPC - TBA) and GBES624S (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/LPC18022372/Kpa3) on 07/12/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

We have inspected TP vehicle GBE 5624S at M/s Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun) and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settlement.

Kindly verify validity of our insured's policy and let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our necessary
action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
« TP's GIA report
+ estimated cost of repair
o preliminary advice.

Our case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 66742 3197.

To check avallability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | emall: MeiKwan@ Ikkguto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, £02-25 | S(40B937)



CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD

- -
Y, B ¢ Ul Blk 1019, Yishun Industrial Park A, #01-374/382, Singapore 768761
Tel : 67556142 Fax : 67557719

Email: chmotor{@singnet.com.sg

Date: /] £ JUL ZUMS

Lonpac Insurance Berhad

C/O LKK Auto Consutlants

Attn : THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. GBES5624S & GU997E ON 07/12/2018
ALONG MANDAI ROAD.

We are authorized by GBE5S624S for their above mattar.

Record reveals that you are the insurer of GU997E. We therefore wish to seek
compensation from you as below:-

1. Cost of Repairs S$§ 7971.29
2. Lossof Use S5 0.00
3. Hire of Vehicle (S$85 + GST /- x 8 days) S§ 72780
4. LTA Search Fee/GIA Reports S$ 8.00

TOTAL S§ B706.89

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.
Thank you.
Yours faithfully

fi




Re:

LETTEROF AUTHORISATION

| '
. ] : o i

Motor Insurance Claim GBE56245

in respect of the traffic accident on 1/12/2018
at/along Mandai Road

I'We, Group Industries Pte Ltd
NRIC 198601970R of 17 Sungei Kadut St 4 Singapore 729045

owner of motor vehicle GBE5624S | insured by Ergo Insurance

Pte Ltd under policy no. _ DMCV175020556
hereby authorise M/s CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD of Blk 1019 Yishun

Industrial Park A #01-374 Singapore 768761, to act as my/our representative in

my/our claim against the owner/driver of motor vehicle GU997E in respect of

the above-mentioned accident.

| further authonse that any payment due to me/us from the aforesaid claim is to be

directed to my/our abovenamed representative.

And I'We hereby indemnify my/our abovenamed representative against any claim

and/or damage which may arise from any action taken on my/our hehalf.




} LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : I8/18/18/VCO5/021200
DATE 130 OCT 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, GROUP INDUSTRIES PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner GU 997E the sum of Singapore Dollars
EIGHT THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED SIX AND CENTS EIGHTY NINE
ONLY. ($8.706.89) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all
property losses competent to mefus upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to
become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving. GBE
56248 on 07/12/2018 along/at MANDAI ROAD.

1 /We hereby agree o indemnify and keep indemnify (PEST-PRO MANAGEMENT
PTE LTD /LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you o pay the above settlement sum directly 1o
M/s CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured's recovery action.

)

W

Sngnmumnfwhbde'
Group Industries Pte Ltd
. As/azpo9
Name of vehicle owner/Date



Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Bk 1019, ¥ishun fndustral Park A 90 ] -379362, Singnpore 76878 |
FEL: 6T356142 1Y15) FAX: 67557710 (Y15) Emadl chmotorfisingne: com ag
GST:Z01007 1 38E  ROB NO201001 158

TAX INVOICE
M/S:  LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD
300 BEACH ROAD NO: CL8190335
#17-04/07 THE CONCOLURSE Date: 15 Apr 2019
SINGAPORE 199555 Policy No: DMCV 178020556
TEL; 62507388 FAX: 62063767 Veh Reg No: GBES624S8
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model: PEUGEOT PARTNER 1.6
HDI ETG LWG
WS Ref: TP-LONPAC Job No: JC1599547
Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date:  07/1272018
TP Veh Reg No: GU99TE
PAGE:]
Description | Quantiry | List Price Amount
S8 58
To Supply all replaced parts, all necessary and agreed labour & 1 PC S5 7.449.80 58 744980
miscellaneous charges.
{As recommended by your appomted surveyor]
Total 88 744980
Add GST (@ ™ 52149
Total Amount pavable S8 7.971.29

For Cheng Hoe Motor Pre Lid

e g

E &% O E AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



PERFECT DRIVING & SERVICE
38 WOODLANDS IND PARK E1
#05-05, SINGAPORE 757700

TAX INVOICE NO. -

180285

GST Reg No. : 530689270

TEL : 64585278
Bill to : GROUP INDUSTRIES PTE LTD DATE:  1B-Dec-18
S/NO. |DESCRIPTIONS UNIT | RATE |AMOUNTS
1) SGY8548U 8 $85.00 680.00
(10/12/18 TO 18/12/18)
NETT 680.00
GST (7%) 47.60
E&OE TOTAL 727.60




PERFECT DRIVING & SERVICE

38 WOODLANDS IND PARK E1 TEL : 64595278
~*05-05 SINGAPORE 757700 OPERATING HOURS -
ROC/GST NO. 53068927L) MONDAY TO SATURDAY
(9AM TO 6PM)

RENTAL AGREEMENT
fHirors Harmo [Date of Birth Nric No

Cive up [Ndustyies P4 | |

. Cecapaltion: Licerss Mo |[Dais ObimnedExpry
|+ S, et l<g dut Stzeridl

Phona No

Cooe ho
mfa wg | E3ER0OeD

Lgint Hirer'w'Guasaniors Name of Birth HricNe  |Nabonsiy

Su  Ning -Ju

|Driving Licanss No.  |Date Dbtained/Expiry

fragress J

Bk 9 Ythun <+t.H F (0-20)

Cooe [Comact No Mobée Fhane No
[Fioq q3520836

IVEHICLEND. Séay 8548U 1= 11455 6x59  MODEL
kﬂﬂ” I_REFURN “Exumaisg [ipie For Sciimi renim see CHECH (N
" _HECK OUT tohalis ™ (0:00ay~ [Mieage ....‘ E % % % F
CHECK IN <ol ™ 0:3cpnsy [Mieage al
[MPORTANT NOTES:- ' [UNT]_|RATE (S§) [TOTAL (S8)
1) This vecis m restricled 1 SINGAPORE use only S TE @

2] Onily Persons above 26 years of age with more than 2 yaars deang [DISEDUNT

AUINDNsed cAnse and Mgrng B sgreermnt My drve D ek ESTQE%

1) The hirer shall be liable to pay the first SE2000 insurance policy sxess TOTAL

for damage to vahich plus loss of samings while damaged wahichs @ undar repains |EXTENSION]|

} Third party Lesbiety m the first $2000 00 1n any scoident invaiving Third Farty Claims

] Hrer s responsibie for all parking hnes & traffc summan

| Vehicie should be relurmed at the same lime s colect:on exoept on Saturday

wihain mpturmn birme i before 1 2pm
| Hourly sstension & charged at 1/5 of the daily rete
8] As preventive MEIMENENce pleass Check water & engine oil daily
For the comBon of olfher users pleass refram from smoking eaing or carmyng of
pats n e car A Geanng chamge 55100 will be mposed for smoky of Sify vefe
10} Plesss check that you have nol lelt any of your personal belongings in ihe
wahicie Oul comparny and st will hol be responsibie 1or any s of balongings
11} The wahicle & NOT coversd by 8 motod imsursnce palicy covenng parsanal BcSident
insuranoe for the hires, s PASARNOEN O BUthonssd driver
12} Ne repecerment of vehacles in arny sccident

POSIT (refundable) 5§

OVER FROM VEH. DATE

e have read and agree o the lerms and conditions of the renta! agreement abowe Bnd ps sei overieal

o given on s lorm s irue and accurate { ,‘
\/( |

Joint Hirer's/ Guaranior's Signature




Vehicle Hub

Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. GU997E As At 07 Dec 2018/ 17:05:00)
Law Firm Search Detalls

Search Reason: Insurance claim in relation to traffic sccidemt
Law Firm Case Mo. CHM-GBES&24
Current Owner Details

Owner 1D Type: Company
Cwner ID: 201005550C
Owner Nama: PEST-PRO MANAGEMENT PTELTD

Registered Address Type:  Private Residential (Condo Apt or House) / Shopping / Office Complexes
Reglstered Block/House No.-31

Registered Street Name: WOODLANDS CLOSE

Registered Unit No.: #OB-15

Registered Bullding Name:  ‘WOODLANDS HORIZON

Registered Postal Code: 737855

Current Vehicle Details

Yehicle No. GUYSTE
Make Description/Model:  HYUNDA) / GRACE HI00M
Insurance Company Mame: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/la/vel/action/lawFirmDetail ?FUNCTION _ID=F1801071ET

Page 1 of |

10/12/2018



A.C. SYED & PARTNERS

ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS
COMMISSIONER FOR OATHS
101A UPPER CROSS STREET, #13-23 PEOPLE'S PARK CENTRE, SINGAPORE 058358
TEL : 6538 T411 & FAX : 6534 1011

TO : CHENG HOE MOTOR PTELTD BILL NO: B035/ 2019
'YOUR REF:

OUR REF : ACS.CH.LTA.2018 (MAR 2018} DATE : 16.4.18

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL CHARGES for acting for you In the above matter indluding whese necessary perusals,
lattenciancea preparaiion examination of documents relating therelo; conespondence, allendance, perusals, telephons
calls, searches and all other iIncidental works not specifically mentionad hersin lo enable us io carry out Iha work
jentrusted to us inclusive of all advice

CH 2018
SNO TP NO. CHM DoA

1 3312019 GBD84495 SKUA4858A 3/32019

12 57312019 SMIJ2989C SITWOSS0OE 1/3/2019

3 87372019 SIV6282D SJG3330Y 7372019

Bl 1273/2019 SIM4739F  SLT75353C 711072018

5 12/3/2019 XE3776P SKHIT743K 12/3/2019

6 13/3/2019 GY2384Pp SMDE359B 12/3/2019

7 15/3/2018 SFX9929P SMEW74Y 8/3/2019

8 15/3/2019 SLL7975K SLB421TM 2172019

9 15/372019 SKX5805U GBGESRIE 13/3/2019

10 20/3/2019 YNIOIID GBG6E911X 15/32019

11 20/3/2019 SIK9785H SIN2924D 15/3/2019

12 20/3/2019 SLS830D SLKI130BG 201372019

13 20/3/2019 SLS47365 SKT695S1E 20/372019

14 217372019 XEIB39E SLDI363H 197372019

15 25/312019 SLC4191Y SKQ3787Z 25/3/2019

16 26/3/2019 SIWS065R  SIP3TT9P 257312019

17 1071272018 GU99TE GBES6248 7122018

18 12/12/72018 SIW2677U SGG3I9S6C  11/12/2018

19 18/2/2019 XD2993R GBCS412Y 16/2/2019

20 217272019 EP48B9H  SGAIIEBY 17/272019

21 25/212019 SKE9633H SKC609TH 23/2/2019

22 1/3/2019 FLI728T GBHATIOT 27/22019

23 4/372019 GBEA4203E SGL9724P 47372019

24 117372019 SJK9331] SLB9605T 7732019

25 12/3/2019 GBB7225M SGP3280X 12/372019

126 227372019 SKA4476Z SLN5947U 21/3/2019

27 SKA451X SFCI22IK 211372019

28 SKB949Y  SD{Q3993C 28/3/2019 ] 224.00

28 searches [@S$8.00 per search ] 124.00

[M/s. ' C & PARTNERS

AD\’W& SOLICITORS

SINGAPORE

We reserved the right 1o forward a subsequent bill for any
disbursements omitied herein.
E&O0E

Page 1




