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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April, 2019 1:51 PM

To: Guan Hin Motor Workshop; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJC1186G    OUR RERF: S8M0169UMC/CL *** LKK REF: 

CC4/ASM18022354/Kha3

Attachments: CCF02019.pdf

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear LC, 

 

Thank you for your email.              

                

Please note that: -            

                 

LKK ref Officer in charge 

CC4/ASM18022354/Kha3 Vic – 6841 2096 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop <guanhinmotor@yahoo.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April, 2019 1:24 PM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: YOUR REF: SJC1186G OUR RERF: S8M0169UMC/CL *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022354/Kha3 

 

Attachment DOL 

 

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP. 

No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 

#02-03 Singapore 568047 

Tel: 64837111 

Fax:64837221 

L C NG 

 

 
On Wednesday, 12 December 2018, 2:43:07 pm SGT, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
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‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently pending verification for direct settlement. 

  

Fyi, OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 

  

 

  

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
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Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop <guanhinmotor@yahoo.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December, 2018 9:26 AM 

To: KUMAR Shailendra <shailendra.kumar@axa.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: YOUR REF: SJC1186G OUR RERF: S8M0169UMC/CL 

  

Kenneth Kong (LKK) 

  

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP. 
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
#02-03 Singapore 568047 
Tel: 64837111 
Fax:64837221 
L C NG 

  

  

On Wednesday, 12 December 2018, 8:56:52 AM SGT, KUMAR Shailendra <shailendra.kumar@axa.com.sg> wrote:  

  

  

Dear Sir,                                                                Without Prejudice 

  

We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your 
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list below to 
conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a Single Joint Expert. 

  

List of our motor surveyors:-            

1. Mohd Fadhilah Bin Osman/ Chris Ang  (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd) 
2. Stan See Chee Seng/ T. Thiyagarajan (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd) 
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3.    Sebastian Kong Wei Siang (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd) 

4. Ricky Teng/ Elgene Teng (RT Appraisal Pte Ltd) 
5. Michael Chong/ Elson Teng (RT Appraisal Pte Ltd) 
6. Simon Ho/ Mohammed Rasul (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd) 
7. Ma Chin Fook/ Adrian Ling/ Chua Weijie (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd) 
8. Kenneth Kong/ Marcus Chua/ Hendry Ng (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd) 
9. Philip Phoong/ Victor Seng (A-Pac Adjuster & Surveyors Pte Ltd)  
10. AXA in house surveyors  

  

  

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors 
as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the pre-
repair survey carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate quotation in order for 
our surveyor to complete the pre repair survey.  

  

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of one cause of 
action, save as to costs and expenses. 

  

  

Best Regards 

Shailendra 

  

  

  

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop [mailto:guanhinmotor@yahoo.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, December 11, 2018 5:03 PM 
To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg> 
Subject: Fw: PA8481Y (TPV) /SJC1186G (OIV) ON 11/12/2018 

  

please provide your survey list 

  

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP. 
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
#02-03 Singapore 568047 
Tel: 64837111 
Fax:64837221 
L C NG 
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----- Forwarded message ----- 

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop <guanhinmotor@yahoo.com> 

To: AXA SURVEY <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>; L C NG <guanhinmotor@yahoo.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018, 4:52:16 PM SGT 

Subject: PA8481Y (TPV) /SJC1186G (OIV) ON 11/12/2018 

  

SJC1186G Survey 

your vehicle PA8481Y 

Date of accident 11/12/2018 

date of survey 11/12/2018 

  

  

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP. 
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
#02-03 Singapore 568047 
Tel: 64837111 
Fax:64837221 
L C NG 

-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are not 
the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have 
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this 
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Singapore - Externals or any 
other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  


