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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December, 2018 8:58 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: SJS3492A / XE8080E   DOA: 7/12/2018   TP SURVEY & LIABILITY *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC18022327/ja3 

Attachments: 12122018085440.pdf

Categories: HMK

 
Dear Mei Kwan, 

 
Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.   

 
 
 

Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 11 December, 2018 8:39 PM 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; CS A Team; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: SJS3492A / XE8080E DOA: 7/12/2018 TP SURVEY & LIABILITY *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC18022327/ja3  

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

LPC ref: 18/18/18/VC00/021197 

LKK REF: CC4/LPC18022327/ja3 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter.  

 

Kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action. 

 

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 10 December, 2018 3:31 PM 

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SJS3492A / XE8080E DOA: 7/12/2018 TP SURVEY & LIABILITY 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed repairer agreed survey on 11/12/2018. 

 
BEST REGARDS,  

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 2:10 PM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; vonnlm.siow@hcspl.com.sg 

Subject: FW: SJS3492A / XE8080E DOA: 7/12/2018 TP SURVEY & LIABILITY 

 

 
Our Ref        : 18/18/18/VC00/021197 

 
Dear Catherine, 
 

Kindly proceed to survey and revert to them on liability.     
 

 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 

From: Vonn, LM Siow [mailto:vonnlm.siow@hcspl.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 10 December, 2018 1:30 PM 

To: CHEW BENG KEE; GERALD POH WEE BIN 

Cc: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim; JiongHow, Ng 
Subject: SJS3492A / XE8080E DOA: 7/12/2018 TP SURVEY & LIABILITY 

 

Dear sirs, 

 

We refer to the subject above and the attachment is for your reference. 
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Vehicle is IN workshop. 

 

Kindly arrange survey with us and advise on the liability.  

 

 

Thanks & Regards 

 

Vonn Siow 

Motor Claims Advisor 

Auto Servicing 

Total Vehicle Solutions Department 

 

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd. 

Jun Taiyo Service Centre (Automobile Leasing & Workshop) 

8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705 

DID: 6833 6274  Mobile: 96435107 

e: vonnlm.siow@hcspl.com.sg 

w: www.hitachi-capital.com.sg   

 

 

 

To help 
protect your 
privacy, 
Micro so ft 
Office 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 

this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet.
AVG logo

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

 


