Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 April, 2019 3:47 PM

To: peifang.ng@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: janice.syn@porsche.com.sg; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: FBK1083Y Our ref: SFM3636G DOA: 06/12/2018 (Porsche) LKK REF
CC4/EQI18022315/R1ha3

Attachments: 4077_001.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Pei Fang,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: peifang.ng@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:peifang.ng@eurokars.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 26 March, 2019 7:26 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: janice.syn@porsche.com.sg; Admin A

Subject: Your ref: FBK1083Y Our ref: SFM3636G DOA: 06/12/2018 (Porsche)
“Without Prejudice”

Dear Vic,

Attached is the covering letter, Repair Tax Invoice, GIA Search, Letter of Authority & Discharge voucher signed by
client for your perusal.

Await to hear from you with your offer of settlement as soon as possible.

Thank you very much.



Note : Documents sent by email only.

Best Regards,

Pei Fang

Insurance Claims Dept

EUROKARS SERVICES PTE LTD

27A Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

T: (65) 6331 0692 F: (65) 6331 0690
E: peifang.ng@eurokars.com.sg




