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Calculation for VaIuation:
Average MV

Calculation for LTA Rebate:
{a} COE Period:

As At;

(b) Balance tr4onths

{a} -{bI - =-112=-<
Register Before/After MAY 2OOZ

{e} PARf = {OMVi--X-*X
LTA Total Rebate Amount: {d}+{e}
Salvage Value(LTA Rebate - 36/a)'.

Calculation for Repossessed vehicle:

High demand vehicle: Yes / No

Paratfel lmPort vehicle: Yes / No

old: Yes / No

MV for RePoss*ssed'vehicle

Hiqhllow l- $

Eurgpe / Asia Car

Car ConOition: Good/F airJPod rlBumt

No. of transfer :

F.rc-d S"l-s Value derived : $

Additicnal lnformation:Action / lnstructlon



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

' Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 1 1 December 2018 1:30 PM

'KHONG Lynn'

CHIONH Hock San Christopher; HO VincenU matthew.nghj@axa.com.sg; SUR; KKLaU

RE: Assistance required: Effect MV for SGA5408L Volkswagen Golf 1.4 AT

Dear Lynn,

The market value of SGA 5408L is $23K (Estimated) as at Dec 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-43ts

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue t,#02-251 5(408933)

From: NG Matthew <matthew.nghj@axa.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesd ay, 'l.L December 2018 9:l-3 AM
To: LKKValuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; ricky@rta.com.sg; patrick.soo@a-pac.sg; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

<olivialau@lkkauto"com>; nick@lbs-auto.com; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>;
jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg; frankie@fta.com.sg; elson@rta.com.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg;
collin.wong@a-pac.sg; bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg; bernardong@ajaxinspection.com; benson@lbs-auto.com;
ad m in @a utopro be.com.sg
Cc: KHONG Lynn <lynn.khong@axa.com.sg>; CHIONH Hock San Christopher <chris.chionhhs@axa.com.sg>; HO

Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Assistance required: Effect MV for SGA5408L Volkswagen Golf 1.4 AT

Dear partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Lynn Khong with the market value for this case.

DOA:01/t2/201,8

Thanks
Matthew Ng
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Enquire PARF/COI Rebate for Registered Vehicle 5oQ I t lr>lt9

Owner lD Type:

Own*r lD;

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Fxforted:

lntended Deregistratio*
Dat€:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Modol:

Primary Colour:

Manufacturi ng Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

M*ximum Power Output:

Open Market Value;

Original Rcgistration

Date:

First Registration Oate:

Transfqr Count:

A,ctugl ARF Paid:

SGA54OBL

No

11 Dec 2018

VOLKSWAGEN

NEW GOLF 1.4 AT

sK13G5

Sald

2010

cAx296281

WVWZZZTKZAW35OSB3

eo.O kW (120 bhp)

$??,260,00

22 Sep 2010

22 Sep 2010

0

$22,260.O0

Et*{ rrv' $>gh

PARF Fligibility:

PARF Elisibitity Expiry
Dmte:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Yes

?1 Ssp 20?0

$12,243,00

C0il Expiry Date:

COI Category:

{0[ Feriod{Years}:

QP Paid;

{08 Rebate Am*unt;

Total Rebate Amounti

?t $ep 2020

A - Car (1600cc & below)

10

$33,08?,Q0

$5,882.00

$1S,X25.00

Ihe informalion contained herein is correct as at 11 Dec 2018
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