Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Seng Group, Singapore <kpsmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 1:53 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Damage parts for vehicle No: XE3947M

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Veron,

Please kindly be informed we accepted the repaired cost of $1429.00,
Thank you,
Best Regards

Mdm Tan

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 2:12 PM

To: Poh Seng Group, Singapore <kpsmotor@singnet.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
<Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Damage parts for vehicle No: XE3947M

Dear Mdm Tan,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Finalize amount $1429/ - @ 3 working days.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Poh Seng Group, Singapore <kpsmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 18 March 2019 8:39 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Damage parts for vehicle No: XE3947M




Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please kindly find the attached photos for the damage vehicle No: XE3947M, we had started to
Repair the Truck on Sat, The owner need the vehicle urgently , so we took the replace parts for
Your reference.

We had replace the new parts for it, we hope you could finalised the repaired cost,

Thank you, till wait for your reply.

Best Regards
Mdm Tan

From: Lian Huay Tan (Poh Seng Group) [mailto:lhtan@psgroup.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 18 March 2019 8:31 PM

To: kpsmotor@singnet.com.sg

Subject: Damage parts
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Koh Group Pte Ltd

Poh Seng Enterprises Pte Ltd

Ping Siong International Pte Ltd

Blk 3 Pioneer Road North #01-13 Singapore 628457 (HQ)
1 Tuas South Street 13 Singapore 637084 (Branch)

Tel: (65) 62657826 Fax: (65) 62665874
www.facebook.com/pohsengintl
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