
1

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 5:59 PM

To: 'Joyce Foo'

Cc: SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SKJ9245T 

Attachments: SKJ 9245T - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Joyce, 

 

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKJ 9245T 

Date of survey: 10/12/2018 

Number of days : 4 days 

 

We have authorise repair. 

 

 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 3:02 PM 

To: 'Joyce Foo' <joyce.foo@qbe.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SKJ9245T  

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 
BEST REGARDS,  

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@qbe.com>  

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 2:48 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SKJ9245T  

 

Our Ref.  VC012126 

 

Hi 

 

Please also assist to arrange for OD survey.  Policy excess - $1250.00. 
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Survey & authorise if in order. 

 

 

Thanks & Best Regards 

Joyce Foo 
Senior Assistant - Claims 
QBE Asia Pacific – Singapore 

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
Phone: +65 6477 1184   
Email: joyce.foo@qbe.com 
Visit us on the web at www.qbe.com.sg 
 

 

 

 

From: peiying@smemotor.com.sg <peiying@smemotor.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 11:21 AM 

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>; Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@qbe.com> 

Subject: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SKJ9245T  

 

Hi,  

   

Forward all relevant documents to you. Kindly arrange your surveyor to inspect our client’s vehicle.  

   

Thanks.  

   

Regards,  

Pei Ying  
  

From: ptr2@smemotor.com.sg  
Sent: Monday, December 10, 2018 10:04 AM 

To: SME Motor-Chia Pei Ying  
Subject: Attached Image 

  
 

----------------- 

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the 

intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is 

unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply 

email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced. 
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