Jia Le (LKK Auto)
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From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 11:50 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2B46G & SIV1355K ON 6/12/2018 [External

Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear lia Le,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tei:__(_ﬁﬁ] 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, 10 May, 2019 3:15 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Vic (LKKAutD)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2846G & SJV1355K ON 6/12/2018 [External Confidential]
Lonpac Ref; 18/18/18/VP05/021193

LKK Ref: CC4/1PCI18022134/Jha3
Dear Sirs/Madarm.
We refer fo the above matier.

We have highlighted to your good office on 10/12/2018 of Third-Party's request fo do Direct Seffiement with
our Principal, Lanpac Insurance Bhd.

This is o head-lo-regr collision. Ligbility is not in our driver's favour

Summary to offer to third party repairer. *CONNECT 3" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 7.350.00 $3.317.00
2. Loss of Use |3days x $150.00) $ 450.00 $ 450.00 {3days x $150.,00]




| Total | § 7.800.00 | $3.767.00

**03days recammendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith tor your perusal and reference.

{ approval

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava 1Thi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[4080573)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May, 2019 12:33 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; KKLau

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2846G & SJV1355K ON 6/12/2018 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

The third party is reminding us again.

Please revert to them as soon as possible.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all Cwew  Jonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May, 2019 12:29 PM

To: "Winnie Chai'; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2846G & SJV1355K ON 6/12/2018 [External Confidential]

Dear Winnie,

Thank you for the email.



Dear Vic,
Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/LPC18022136/lha3q2

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gasignmentsi@kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com|
Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 12:23 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@| .com>; admin-d@lkkauto.com
Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2846G & SIV1355K ON 6/12/2018 [External Confidential]

Hi Gerald

Till date no one from LKK advise me on the status/offer for this case.
Pls kindly assist.

Thanks

On Fri, Mar 15, 2019 at 10:06 AM Winnie Chai <connect3winnief@ gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Catherine

| have attached the LOD, LOA & Tax inv for yr ref.

Pls kindly revert on the offer for this case.

Thanks

On Thu, Feb 21, 2019 at 11:47 AM GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote:
Lonpac External - Confidential

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Winnie,

Please liaise with our surveyor on liability.



Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 195555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authonsed external parties only.

From: Winnie Chal [mailto:connect3winnie@amall.com]
Sent: Thursday, 21 February, 2019 11:44 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2846G & SIV1355K ON 6/12/2018

Hi Gerald

We ref to the mentioned accident.

Pls kindly advise on the liability for this case.

Thanks

On Mon, Dec 10, 2018 at 9:44 AM Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Winnie,

Appointment confirmed.

Best Regards,



Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte L

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com)

Sent: Saturday, B December, 2018 10:19 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Cc: GERALD BIN POH WEE <geral ac.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH28466G & SIV1355K ON 6/12/2018

Hi

We would like to arrange the survey on 12 Dec 2018 10:30am.

Pls kindly confirmed on survey appt.

Thanks

On Fri, Dec 7, 2018 at 3:55 PM GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpohf@lonpac.com> wrote:

QOur Ref : 18/18/18/VP05/021193

Dear Catherine,

Please see attached and proceed to survey accordingly.

Best Regards



Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Winnie Chai
Connect3

HP:9850-9666

Winnie Chai
Connect3

HP:9850-9666

Winnie Chai
Connect3
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Connect3
HP:9850-9666

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
Www.avg.com



c3connect3
566 Woodlands Rd ( Mandai Estate ) Singapore 728697

UEN no: 533600611
HP: (+65) 9850-9666 Email: Connect3winnie@gmail.com

Your Ref : Pls advise
15 March 2019
Lonpac Insurance Bhd
100 Beach Road
#19-00 Shaw Tower
Singapore 189702
Dear Sir,

TO PROPOSE A CLAIM OF AN ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2846G & SJV1355K
ON 06/12/18.

We refer to the above, we are authorized by owner Khim Seah Enterprise Pte Lid of vehicle
no PH2846G 1o negotiate and settle the claim on his behalf.

We hereby quantify our claim as follows:-

1) Repair Cost inc 7% gst S$ 3,317.00
2) Loss Of Use @ $150 X 03
days S$ 450.00

Total SS 3,767.00
We enclosed a copy of each of the following for your consideration:

1) Repair Bill inv: 567

2)  Motor Accident report of vehicle no. PH2B46G

3)  Letter Authorization (original available upon request)

4)  Insurance Certificate

5)  Vehicle registration card

6)  Pre repair inspection (done by Hwee Jie LKK on 12/12/18)

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents and hope to receive your
favourable reply ASAP.
Thank you.

Yours sincerely p-
\ -
Wiy )9
Winnie Chai ,
HP: 9850-9666
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¥ j LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : IR/IS/IR/VPOS02]193
DATE : 28 JUNE 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, KHIM SEAH ENTERPRISE PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of SIV 1355K the sum of Singapore
Dollar Three Thousand Seven Hundred Sixty-Seven Only (53,767.00) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all propenty losses competent to me/us upon
the smd M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all propeny losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter o become manifest, arising ¢ither
directly or indirectly from an accident involving PH 2846G and SIV 1355K on 6
December 2018 along JURONG TOWN HALL RD TWDS JURONG EAST ST 11,

| /‘We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD AND/OR HENG LAl LEE) aganst all claims and any claims whatsoever
made by any person/persans on our behalf in respect of the said accident,

I'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to CONNECT3.
I'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action,

S Steh | Enipiee e QA
Mame of vehicle owner /Date

Jialg



coconnect3
56t VWoodianos Hoad
Singapore 728697
Tel: (+65) 0850-9666 Email: connect3winnie@gmail.com
UEN No 533600611
GST No : 53360061L

BILL TO:
TAX INVOICE NO.: 567
Lonpac Insurance Bhd DATE . 15-Mar-18
100 Beach Road D/O ND % e
#19-00 Shaw Tower PIO NO. <
Singapore 189702 VEHICLE NO PH2846G
TERMS : COoD
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Repair cost to accident damaged vehicle to PH2846G $ 3,100.00
Accident date 06/12/18
SUB-TOTAL | § 3,100.00
7% GST | § 217.00
TOTAL :| § 3,317.00
E AOE
* | no discrepancy is reported within 7 days from Connectd
the date of this statement, the account will be
considered as comect

* A 1% Late Paymeni Charge will be imposed on
any oulstanding balance in the next slatement. if
no paymanl is received

* All cheque(s) should be crossed and made

payable 1o " Connectd "



