Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 10 May, 2019 2:12 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2846G & SJV1355K ON 6/12/2018 [External
Confidential]

Attachments: 567 - PH2846G jpg; LOD.jpg; LOA.pdf

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com>

Date: Fri, Mar 15, 2019 at 10:06 AM

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2846G & SJV1355K ON 6/12/2018 [External Confidential]
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh @lonpac.com>, <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Hi Catherine

I have attached the LOD, LOA & Tax inv for yr ref.
PIs kindly revert on the offer for this case.

Thanks

On Thu, Feb 21, 2019 at 11:47 AM GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh @lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - Confidential

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Winnie,

Please liaise with our surveyor on liability.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd



300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 21 February, 2019 11:44 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2846G & SJV1355K ON 6/12/2018

Hi Gerald

We ref to the mentioned accident.

PIs kindly advise on the liability for this case.

Thanks

On Mon, Dec 10, 2018 at 9:44 AM Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Winnie,

Appointment confirmed.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com]

Sent: Saturday, 8 December, 2018 10:19 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Cc: GERALD BIN POH WEE <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH2846G & SJV1355K ON 6/12/2018

Hi

We would like to arrange the survey on 12 Dec 2018 10:30am.

Pls kindly confirmed on survey appt.

Thanks

On Fri, Dec 7, 2018 at 3:55 PM GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh @lonpac.com> wrote:

Our Ref : 18/18/18/VvP05/021193

Dear Catherine,

Please see attached and proceed to survey accordingly.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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