Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 February, 2020 5:16 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Request of Survey report-your ref no: AAD1812-046/ our Ref:
D18008678MFSH;accident involving SHC7044S and SHD9910Z on 06-12-2018

Attachments: image005.wmz; SHD9910Z 06.12.2018 - IIL.PDF

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic
Amount confirmed $ 15,500 (before GST).

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 23 January, 2020 2:25 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request of Survey report-your ref no: AAD1812-046/ our Ref: D18008678MFSH;accident involving
SHC7044S and SHD9910Z on 06-12-2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Wai Yin,

We refer to the subject matter.

Please be informed that our surveyor had recommended adjusted COR at L/S $15,500.00 with 16 repair days.

Thank you.

o wishiﬂg you a Happy and Frosperous Lunar New Yeﬂr"
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Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

RLERER WWT Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 16 January, 2020 10:19 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Request of Survey report-your ref no: AAD1812-046/ our Ref: D18008678MFSH;accident involving
SHC7044S and SHD9910Z on 06-12-2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Mei Kwan

Enclosed is the estimate marking for your action.
Net Book Value : $ 50,052.23

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January, 2020 7:53 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request of Survey report-your ref no: AAD1812-046/ our Ref: D18008678MFSH;accident involving
SHC7044S and SHD9910Z on 06-12-2018

Dear Wai Yin,



Please provide finalised estimate.

« Wishing you a Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeg, »

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January, 2020 5:50 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Request of Survey report-your ref no: AAD1812-046/ our Ref: D18008678MFSH;accident involving
SHC7044S and SHD9910Z on 06-12-2018

Dear Wai Yin,
This case is under Mei Kwan.

Dear Mei Kwan,

CC3/TP18022130/Ka3

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 5:44 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Request of Survey report-your ref no: AAD1812-046/ our Ref: D18008678 MFSH;accident involving
SHC7044S and SHD9910Z on 06-12-2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir
Can we check the survey report send to FCIL?

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
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TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 26 December, 2019 4:48 PM

To: 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request of Survey report-your ref no: AAD1812-046/ our Ref: D18008678MFSH;accident involving
SHC7044S and SHD9910Z on 06-12-2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir
Please send a copy of the survey report to FCIL.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 26 December, 2019 1:48 PM

To: waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg; claims@transcab.com.sg

Cc: Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: Request of Survey report-your ref no: AAD1812-046/ our Ref: D18008678 MFSH;accident involving
SHC7044S and SHD9910Z on 06-12-2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir,

We refer to your letter of claim dated 13-12-2019
Please let us have survey report for this case

Thanks & Regards,

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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