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Consinltants
PteLid Company Registration No. 193607198R

-" "rl’{'ﬂ' Auto

S1URLAVE 1 #0225 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPURE 408933 TEL { (105) 62563561 FAN : (65 6254315

Yourref:  DIR0O0RGE2ZMESH

Our ref: CS/FCI18022067/Avd3 Date : 10/1/2019

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SJN 8639M

We thank you for your instruction on 7/12/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
10/12/2018 at the premises of M/s SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount : 5%5,601.45

Revised Estimate Amount : §$3.750.00 (LUMF SUM)
"Check” Items Amount 8%

Market Value : 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value 158

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI
Licansed Appraiser



Ms @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Csfeg Mo 1550000060 GST Reg o M2 00016769
& Raifles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tek (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (B5) 6222 3547

Chals & Mator Undenwriting Dept: 36 Rabinson Road F16-01 City House Singapore D58877
Tet (85) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3849
wiww.msfirsteapital.oom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location

Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

07-12-2018 Our Ref No. D1800B6EZMFSH
05-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SH7558S Third Party Vehicle. SJN8635M

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 #01-59
KHIM

67455783/ 87666672 Fax No. 67449582

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE
LTD

MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindiy submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

A Member of EIRTRIE INSURANCE GROUF




Job Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/246681) .{; PRI Documents gl Close ¢

PRI Header Details

Claimant
Claim No D1800868ZMFSH Policy No D-1BOBE936MFSH S.No & 1 & SIN HWEL
Name

Workehog | SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE f“”fi':n BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 #01-59
i Pl &“::ntact Mobile: 97666672 , Phone: 67455783 , Fax: 6744958,

(Contact Person @ KHIM) Detalls Emailld: SINHWEEMOTOR@GMAIL.COM
Our LKKAUTO CONSULTANTS | Instructions |\ ioi0 i1 pREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM *
Surveyor PTE LTD To Surveyor

COMFORT TP
Insured

TRANSPORTATION PTE ansured SHY753595 Vehicle SINBE63OM
Name Vehicle No

LTD Mo
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 07-12-2018 05:12:23 PM Appointed 07-12-2018 03:46:31 PM Accept 07-12-2018 0
Date Date Date

Survey Report Upload
i Surveyor :E :::3 S
Inspection T Report Date 07-12-2018 Report _Chausa File
Date *: L s *.
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make ¥ | Model f[__e}xﬁe_ﬁelect Model ¥ | Year ISE_Igct_‘r-'ear_ v
Chasis No | | Engine No | | Mileage |
Sl I Cubic . I
Capacity
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents I

File Name

Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks

Save ‘




Date Job Remarks Action

FINAL SUMMARY

Surveyor
Final Surveyor

R k
Adjusted | Fees emarks

Amount L = = = R

l Submit Assessment

Copyright © 2015 MS First Capital Insurance Limited (http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/). All rights reserved.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 January 2019 3:55 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Serene Ler'; SUR

Subject: RE: SUBVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008682MFSH/1, SIN 8639M
Attachments: SJN 8639M PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIN 8639M
Date of Survey: 10/12/2018
Number of days : 6 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 7:50 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Ce: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008682MFSH/1, SIN 8635M

Dear SirfMadam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIN 8639M on 10/12/2018

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 4:08 PM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008682M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed repairer agreed survey on 10/12/2018.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 3:47 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>
Subject: PRI; SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008682MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
) WWW.AVE.COM



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

;

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 7:50 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Ce: 'Serene Ler’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMEMNT - D1800868B2MFSH/1, SIN BE39M
Dear Sir/Madam.

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIN 8639M on 10/12/2018

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phene: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 4:08 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@misfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008682MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed repairer agreed survey on 10/12/2018.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 3:47 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008682MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

' AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
i . WwWW.aVvEg.com



5-yr COE}

Wel Maintained With Excellert Running Condition, In Griginal Stock Condition, Practical Car For Daily Use, Economical, And Low Maintenance Come
With Brand Mew Coat OF Paint, View To Believe, Drive Wi...

Accardore Autolution Pre Lid
M Bt (B Deepnyy OB dal et 2 e =, Hy o Inyurvdai avants, Hy f
AT, U
[[] Hyundal Avante 1.64 (Mew 8-  $24,800 £4,560 fyr 14-Mar-2009 1,591 et £9,000 kom Scdan Availalibe
yr COE)

£0 Down Payment Availabla, We Ondy Select The Best Unit Ta Sell, All Qur Car Coma With Mew Painbwork Ta Engure U Drive & Mice Car For Anather 5
Or 10 Year Dovn The Road, Trade In Welcomed, Buy With A .,

lanis
[[] Hyundai Avante 1,64 S (New $28,500 45,780 jyr F3-Mar-2001 1,591 ¢ 46,000 ke Sedan Available
S-yr COE)
1 Dreinership, 100M% Accident Free, With New 5 Year COE, Low Depreciation Per Day Only $20, Low Milcage Done 45, 000Km,Smooth And Powerful
Engine, Fuel Efficiency, High Loan Available Up Te 0%, Please Ca... (EoAmawen )
T M Hyunds dearde, 2009 hylsudal avantn, Hyanddl Svaits, § wital
. Lisatl
[1 Hyundai Avante 1.64 5 $10,000 HA 26-Mar-2009 1,591 ¢ - Sadan Avallable

Cheapest! Ioeal Fer COE Renewal. Reliable And Law Cast To Mairtain Sedan! Popular Cheice By Many! Do Not Wait! Call Naw To View, High Loan Arg
Trade In Most Welcomed!

I Accurale Auto

Save this search critena, to get emad aberts whenever a match is found, H save Search

For old advertisements, view Expired ads = Back (123 ) Next »

20 ¥ results/page

Home | Mew Cars | Used Cars | Sell My Car | Directory | Products | Insurance | Article | Forum | Resources

GET T ON

4 Dowrdoad on the
Follow sgCarMart.com [§ 4 LI B & Appstore J| P> Google

About Us | Careers | Contact Us | Sitemap ‘Terms of Service | Priva_:_:vmbﬂ Personal Data Protection Statement
{E/2004-2018 sgCarMart. All rights reserved. )

sE FLETED HMATOR T

Compare §)



sGCARMART.COM Login | Signup (Gl

VISIT US AT VENUE ypr

SGCM Carnival @ Downtown East ~
1 Pasir Ris Close Singapore 519599 “"“? TYREPAC "ﬁ'}'
15- 16 December 2018 AL Aok

10 am to & pm

FOH'E Post an Advertisement VALUE FOR MONEY
LT el yourse Advertise & at just =) 2 : v VALUE FOR TIME
e 1*_ [ .
O bostonad BN pdvertiser Lagin 0 oy of Selling = - Sxarad ylews our Carg

o o123 v e
a5 vetices | Search Proacisea | > (=]
. ] B B~ Bjoes Ol Bl B Hjom B

Search Selection  Avante Arry Ay 2009 Any Any Aoy Available
D Hyundai Avante 1.6A 5 (New $28,8E8 85,770 fyr 27-Mar-2009 1,591 cc 133,000 kem Sedan Available
S=yr COE)

Wigwi] Artractive 100% Full Loan Package Deals Awallzole, 1 Year Warranty For Engine And Gearbox, Free Servicing. Comes With Syr COE At $268,888
Or 10yr COE At 48 85, Bank And In House Loan, Smoaoth And...

[[] Hyundai Avante 1.64 0,600 HA 28-Mar-2009 1,591 e - Sedan Avatlable
Rocket Auto Trading.
L2018 Tage 00 Hyundol Asante, 300% eandel svarnte, -Hyundas Averte, byundal avante, Hyuneer, Avarnba
|:| Hyundai Avante 1.6A (New 5- $24,800 §4,960 fyr 30-Mar-2009 L5581 o 94,000 km Sadan Available
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50 Down Payment Avaiable, We Only Select The Best Un To Sell, All Dur Car Come With New Painbwaork To Ensure U Drive A Mice Car For Another 5
Or 10 Year Down The Road, Trade In Welcomed, Buy With A ...
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= [[] Hyundal Avante 1.6A (New 5- $25,800 §5,160 fyr 30-Mar-2005 1,501 et - Sedan Available
L yr COE)
el Waell Take Care By Pravious Owner, Good For Shart Term Driving Or Renew COE, High Bady Vaule For Scrap, Bank Loan Or In House Loan Avallable,
Strictly Viewing By Appointrment Only, Please Kindly Call O, T

Henly Enterprises Co

Pt it KHF Hpunds fwanie, 2009 yunds) avante, Heandal Avanke; hyundes eedale, Fpmdai, Avants

118

GETYOUR Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!

COE Getting your COE renewed |5 easy, fast and affordable. We'll help you renew your COE and get & loan for it, Get the cheapest loan in town and an
REMEWAL approval in 2 days without effort! Enguire today,
LOAN
£ [[] Hyundal Avante 1.6A 5 528,800 $5,760 Jyr 31-Mar-2008 1,591 cc 82,000 km Sedan Available
Sunroof (OPC) (New 5-yr COE)
Naw Paintwork, Very Well Kept Intarior, Original Colour According To Log Cand, A Make With Minimal Istue Good For Renewal! Healthy Engine And
Gearbox, Coupled With Dur In-House & Months Warranty, STA Or.., [ FREnma
none  ToOUs! 2008 M enpibe, 200G winle, Hyledal Avante, Meandal avence, Hyueda, A
D Hyundai Avante 1.6A 5 [New $28,800 §5,760 fyr 31-Mar-2009 1,591 ec - Sadan Avallable
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1 Orurser Only, Low Mileage, Excellert Condition, Good To Renewed COE, Down Payment From 10%. Trade In Welcome, Car Available In Showroom
For Viewing Now, Contact For More [nformation,

moansmee simen [T yyundai Avante 1,6A S (New $41,800 4,180 fyr 28-Ape-2000 1,591 ¢ - Sedan Byallable

ot 10-yr COE)
i



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner D Type: Singapore NRIC
COwner ID: 4202C
AL 0 T 20 s S 5 R B A e B A S S MR H BN |
Vehicle No.: SINBEIYM
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 10 Dec 2018
Vehicle Make: HYUMDAI
Vehicle Model: HD AVANTE 1.6 4
Primary Calour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2009
Engine Mo.: GAFCRUA15185
Chassis Mo.: KMHDUA1BRYUTOT7S74
Maximum Power Qutput; 897 kW (120 bhp)
Open Market Value: $11,868.00
Original Registration Date: 03 Mar 2009
First Registration Date: 03 Mar 200%
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $11,5888.00
Bt ehded PR R D e e e e L e e ey
PARF Eligibility; Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 02 Mar 2019
PARF Rebate Amount: £5,944.00
Elitended SO R Rk D e e T e e ey
COE Expiry Date: 02 Mar 2019
COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period{ears): 10
3P Paid: $4.460.00
COE Rebate Amount: $100.00
Total Rebate Amount: $6,044.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Dec 2018

oK



SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE LTD

*4% Main Workshop ***

ESTIMATE

5 A : | DATE 7/12/2018
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-39 S(408717) - |
EE g r 1 I 1 K
Spray Paint Workshop @ Autobay VEHICLENO: | SIN8639M|
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #01-25 S(417883)
REG NO: 201327079M TP 15 (e e M kg
- MODEL: AVANTE
CHEN LIU 8Y Vg A s .
LMK &ite Consuliant & nofify
the Repair
* QUANTITY' - st " DESCR!FTION UNIT AMOUNT
FP@oerentary 1o BOOTHHD Gt 966.90 966,90
1 PEubject o nal spr o BORTII TOCK Pl 4 134.58 134.54 —
If!’[.' ~ WEATHER STRIP, I7¢ H5.11 5.1 %
fipowietged by REpANEIND PANEL H63,40) £63.90
Prgture: END PANEL TOP GARNISH RM 76.72 7672V
rpe REAR BUMPER =~ 42 — 3 4610 481.55 481.55—
TPCE "AR BUSIPER SIDE RETAINER 7~ & 32.60 65.20 —
10 PCS BUMPER CLIP  feu 450 4500 T
I PC REINFORCEMENT Cf*~‘-d 210736 282.60 282,600
1 PC BUMPER SPONGE  flaac (¢ 145.25 14525 —
e SUBTOTAL 1.976.81
o0 ———_ - LESS 20% -20.00% -595,36
| PC BUMPER LOWER SPOILER - nett £ £ 380,00 380.00
. [0 SUPPLY FITTINGS AND INSTALL/ALIGN LOWER SPOILER 150,00 150,00 4
I SET REVERSE SENSOR By d 280.00 28000 LoD
2 TO INSTALL AND CALIBRATE REVERSE SENSOR 60.00 60005
" TO REMOVE AND REFIX INNEE TRIMS AND BOARDS TO FACILITATE Ly
REPAIR WORK k2040 i R
= TO TRANSFER BOOTLID MECHANISMS, FITTINGS AND TRIMS TO NEW S i 5
BOOTLID Z
: TO SUPPLY FITTINGS AND INSTALL REAR BOOTLID SPOLIER £0.00 80.00 &
- TO REPLACE END PANEL INCLUDE KNOCKING, CUTTING AN WELDING A
[0 REPLACE. INSTALL ANFD ALIGN ABOVE ITEMS TO SYMMETRICAL 900,00 apa-00° Z) -
SPEC
- TO SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER, BOOTLID AND END PANEL Qq*' 0 900.00 Q060 5
- TO CARRY OUT WIRE CHECKING £0.00 ga-00 =~
§ TO SUPPLY AND TUFF KOTE 120,00 120,007 5

oa|q ol

468736

Mo, (Mo 370
_ BN -
Tel: 6745 5783 Fax: 6744 9582 o6 p aﬂ

Email: sinhweemotor@gmail.com
Website: www.sinhweemotor.com

)

TOTAL

$5,601.45




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607193-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCN8022067/Avd3n2

RO

36 ROBINSON ROAD

© 14-01-201
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Doy 012070

Code : FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 75585 Veh. Inspected SJN BE3SM
Policy No. D-18088936MFSH Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18008682MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From SERENE Assign Date 0722018
vl Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAIAVANTE c.c 1591
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. KMHDU41BROUTOT7STE Colour GREY
Cdometer 242408 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 HABILEAD 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 HABILEAD & mm
R/H Rear Tyre 225/45 R17 HABILEAD & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R17 HABILEAD 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/12/2018 Inspection Date 1122018
Survey held at SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE LTD
BLE 3023-A UBI ROAD 1 #01-58 SINGAPORE 408717
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

sb. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

6 Working Days




N4

e

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No; 139607198R GST Reg. No. 18-3607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJN 8639M

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

Page Mo.:1of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | =SLiece :gn ‘;‘H
REPLAGEMENT OF PARTS
1|8COTLID BUCKLED 966,90 966.90
1|BOOTLID LOCK DAMAGED 134 58 134 58
1|WEATHER STRIP NOT NECESSARY 11511 -
1|END PANEL DENTED 663.90 663.80
1|END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 7872 T6.72
?| REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @332 60 NECESSARY 65.20 65.20
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 481.55 481.55
10|BUMPER CLIP @%4.50 MECESSARY 45.00 30.00
1|REINFORCEMENT CRACKED 282 60 282.60
1|BUMPER SPONGE CRACKED 14525 145.25
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -595.36 -569.34
2,381.45 227736
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|BUMPER LOWER SPOILER (SN) DEFORMED 3B0.00 380.00
1|SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN) DAMAGED 2B80.00 200.00
660.00 580.00
LABOUR
TO SUPPLY FITTINGS AND INSTALL/ALIGN LOWER NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
SPOILER.
TO INSTALL AND CALIBRATE REVERSE SENSOR, £0.00 40.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX INNER TRIMS AND BOARDS TO 120.00 &60.00
FACILITATE REPAIR WORK
TO TRANSFER BOOTLID MECHANISMS FITTINGS AND 150.00 50.00
TRIMS TO NEW BOOTLID.
TO SUPPLY FITTINGS AND INSTALL REAR BOOTLID NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
SPOILER.
TO REPLACE END PAMEL INCLUDE KNOCKING, CUTTING a00.00 800.00
AMND WELDING TO REPLACE, INSTALL AND ALIGN ABOVE
ITEMS TO SYMMETRICAL SPEC.
TO SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER,BOOTLID AND END 900.00 B00.00
PAMNEL.
TO CARRY OUT WIRE CHECKING B0.00 30.00
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: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) $)
TO SUPPLY AND TUFF KOTE 120.00 50.00
2,560.00 1,830.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,601.45 4,687.36
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMF SUM REPAIRS 3,750.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18022067/Avd3n2
MARKET VALUE: §9,800.00 (EST)-PAPER VALUE: $6,000.00=NETT VALUE: $3,800.00

% g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client nama<d on the frond page of this Report,




