Must be a Friday joke. $15.00 difference??7?
I suggest you send me your principle in-charge email address.
TGIF

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (g o 10002371wy

55 Ubi Road | Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 1. +65 6841 1183

e claimsipremiumaulo COM.SE  W. WWww a1 di.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road  Singapore 159938

p. +63 6836 2223
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Email Disclaimer

Iris email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged
If Wi have received it in ermor, please notifi us immedistely by reply email ind then delete this message from your system
Please do nan copy 11 of use it for any purpose, of disclose its contents or any attachment 1o amvy other person. Thank you

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 6 September, 2019 5:36 PM

To: Premiumauto Claims <claims@ premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kee Siang,

We have our principal instruction to re-offer MAX amount of $18,375.00 (all-in).
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LEEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
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From: Premiumauto Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2019 9:53 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@ lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>; Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.se>
Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Hi Cecilia,
Rush your principle please................... !

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd rreg wo 1990227190

55 Ubi Road | Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 o, +65 6768 9911 £ +65 6841 1183

e. claims@@premiumauto. com.sg  w. www audi com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938

. +63 6836 2223

WELCOME TO THE==
8TH DIMENSION,

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

Email Disclaimer

Thes email, including any anschment. is confidential and may also be privileaed
IF wou have received it in error, please nonfy us immediately by peply email and then delete this micssage fom your system
Please do not copy of or wse it for any purpose, of disclose it contents or any attachment 1o any other person. Thank Vo

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong/a lkkauto.com)|

Sent: Monday, 9 September, 2019 2:07 PM

To: Premiumauto Claims <claims/@ premiumauto.com.se>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

HELLO KEE SIANG.

My principal still reviewing.

Will get back to you once they give us their instruction.
Thanks

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
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From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong (@ lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 20 September, 2019 12:49 PM

To: Premiumauto Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Ce: Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com_sg>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Kee Siang,

As per our principal’s instruction. we are pleased to re-offer total amount of $18,942.07 (max all-in).
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

*Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Premiumauto Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.con.se
Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2019 10:47 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@ premiumauto.com.sg™>; Claims <glaims(@ premiumauto.con, se=

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Cecilia,

Our client Is driving a luxury model Lexus E250A 2.5¢e, We regret to inform that our client is not agreeable
with your offer. We counter propose strictly follow by our LOD.

Kindly inform OIC to expedite on this.

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Lid ireg e 10moaz7wn
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
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M v have received 1toin error, please mobify s simmedustely by reply cmail amd then delens this Mg rom your 5y518m
Please do nit copy it or use i1 for any purpoese, or dischose its contels or any attachmen o any other person, Thank vou

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong/@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 26 September, 2019 2:08 PM

To: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai(@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kee Siang,

Our principal has revert back to us and was instructed to maintained our offer at MAX $18.942.07 (all-in).
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with vou is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Repards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408993)

¥ RIS ~

SLERER =T Suve the Farth Print only when necessary-

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 September 2019 4:27 PM

To: Claims <claims{@ premiumauto.com.sg>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.so>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kee Siang.

We are still pending for our principal instruction.

We will revert back to you once our principal reply to us,

Thanks
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Save as to Costs

Dear Kelvin,

The claim for Loss of Rental rate per day is strictly based on the benchmark. As your vehicle is ES250, hence the rate is
$150 per day.
We regret that we are unable to accede to your request. Our offer remains therein.

Thanks & Regards

Winnie Ho, Senior Admin Assistant, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email: winnie.ho@axa.com.sg
Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 / Fax: (65) 6880 4838

.IEL. #1 GLOBAL INSURANCE

BRAND FOR 1D
50 Years
in Singapone

CONSECUTIVE YEARS

Please consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited, If you are not the
intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately

From: Claims <claims@@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2019 7:00 PM

To: HO Winnie <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora khai@ premiumauto.com.sg>; claims@premiumauto.com.sg
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED
SKK5455A DATED ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Winnie,

We regret to inform that our client is not agreeable with your offer. Our client was driving a luxury model
Lexus E250A 2.5¢c.

We counter propose strictly follow by our LOD.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims(@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 28] Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223
12



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p- +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f.+65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223
b L e e ST R ——

Find out more |

Email Disclaimer
This emal, including any atachment, is confidential pnd mav also be privikeaed

It vou have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then debete this message From vour svstem
Phease da not copy it or use 1L for any purpose. of disclose its contents er any attachment 1o any other person. Thank vou

From: HO Winnie [mailto:winnie.ho@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 1 October, 2019 3:20 PM

To: Premiumauto Claims =claims(@ premiumauto.com.sg>

Ce: Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED ON
06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Save as to Costs

Dear Kelvin,

We regret that we are unable to accede to your request. Our offer remains therein.

Thanks & Regards

Winnie Ho, Senior Admin Assistant, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email: winnie.ho@axa.com.sg
Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 / Fax: (65) 6880 4838

nlgk

GLOBAL INSURANCE
# BrAND FOR 10
50 Years CONSECUTIVE YEARS

in Singapore

Flease consider the environment before printing this message
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From: Premiumauto Claims <claims@ premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, October 3, 2019 1:06 PM

To: HO Winnie <winnie.ho/@axa.com.sg>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khaii@premiumauto.com.sg>; Claims <claims( Wpremiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED
SKK5455A DATED ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Winnie,
As spoken earlier just now, we regret to inform that our client is not agreeable with your offered rate.

Based on NIMA protocol benchmark rates for rental, they generally refer to vehicle with OMV of $35,000 and
above on first registration. The rates for luxury vehicle is $220 or more.

We refer to our client’s vehicle that the OMV of $36,191.00 on first registration, which falls under the category
of luxury car.

We are of the view that our client’s proposal is reasonable and in line with the protocol. Nevertheless. our client
is willing to compromise and suffer the loss. For fast and amicable settlement, we counter propose rental
$170.00 per day.

We confirm full final settlement as below,

Cost of Repair : 5 16,693.07

Loss of Use :5 2,890.00 ($170.00 x 17 days) , From First day of Loss
LTA 15 2.00

Total :519,585.07

Kindly send us your final DV.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w., www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audt Centre ESI Ale‘(andra Road Smgapnre 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

..........

| Find ot lr more |
I.—,_.

Email Disclaimer



Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183
e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alex&nﬁ Road Singaj

=

ore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

| Find out more |

Email Disclaimer

This email., including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If" you have received it in error. please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from
your system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose. or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person.
Thank you

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg
Sent: Monday, 7 October, 2019 11:57 AM

To: 'HO Winnie' <winnie. hof@axa.com.sg>

Cc: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>; claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK35455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Winnie,

Attached is the rental agreement for your perusal, kindly send us your Final DV.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223



Please cansider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately

From: Claims <claims/@ premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, October 10, 2019 9:07 AM

To: HO Winnie <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>

Ce: Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>; claims/@premiumauto.com.se
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED
SKK5455A DATED ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Winnie,

Kindly be informed, our client does not agree with your offer. He maintains with LOU $1 70/day x 17 days, as
per follow our LOD,

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims(@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

| Find out more |

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from
your system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose. or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person.
Thank you

From: HO Winnie [mailto:winnie.ho/@axa.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 8:45 AM

To: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <pora.khaif@premiumauto.com.sg>




Save as to Costs
Hi Kelvin,

Our surveyor recommended 10 days for repair.

Accident on 06.12.2018,

Vehicle surveyed on 07.12.2018

10 days recommended from 7.12.18 to 20.12.2018 (10 working days) and overlaps 2 Saturday and Sunday (4 days)

Our offer of 15 days has included 2 Saturday & Sunday and 1 additional PRI of which is deem is fair and reasonable,
hence we will not increase our offer therein.

Thanks & Regards

Winnie Ho, Senior Admin Assistant, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email: winnie.ho@axa.com.sg
Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 / Fax: (65) 6880 4838

i

1 GLOBAL IHSF;.E“M
BRAND FOR

50 Years # CONSECUTIVE YEARS
in Singapore

Flease consider the envirenment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, October 10, 2019 10:27 AM

To: HO Winnie <winnie.hof@axa.com.sg>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>; claims@premiumauto.com.sg
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED
SKK5455A DATED ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Hi Winnie,
Our client does not agree 15 days. He given instruction to settle at below 2 option :

1. 5165 x 17 days = $2,805.00
2. $180x 16 days = $2,880.00

This is the final concession that he able to compromise.
Best Regards,

Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor



