Cecilia Chnng (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2019 3:49 PM

To: 'HO Winnie'

Cc; '‘Morazima Khairuddin'; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); claims@premiumauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKKG455A DATED

ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM1 8022054/Afa3

Dear Winnie,

Our client has agree your offer $165 x 15 days, please send us your Discharge Voucher asap.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. 465 6841 1183
e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Pl

on the road
The new Audi A i

1 Find out morns I

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If vou have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from
your system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person.
Thank vou

From: HO Winnie [mailto:winnie.ho@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 11:47 AM

To: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=>

Ce: "Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg=; claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED ON
06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d.+65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183
e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg  Ww. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 ﬁlex&ndm]{paﬂ Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

=

Find out more |

Email Disclaimer

This email. including any attachment. is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from
your systen.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person.
Thank vou

From: HO Winnie [mailto:winnie.ho/@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 9:22 AM

To: Claims <claims(@premiumauto.com.sg=>

Ce: Norazima Khairuddin' <nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED ON
06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Save as to Costs

Hi Kelvin,
We are prepared to revised our final offer for loss of rental @ $165 x 15 days.

Thanks & Regards

Winnie Ho, Senior Admin Assistant, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Fmail: winnie.hodaxa.com.sg
Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 / Fax: (65) 6880 4838

GLOBAL INSLHANCE

BRAND FOR 10
50 Years CONSECUTIVE YEARS
in Singapore




Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED ON
06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Save as to Costs

Hi Kelvin,

Strictly without prejudice and admission of liability, we are prepared to revised our offer for loss of rental @ $165 x 14
days being full and final. We are of the view that it is fair and reasonable.

If agreeable, our Discharge Voucher will as follow.

Please be informed that the above proposal is deemed to be a full and final settlement of any and all claims, loss and/or
damages, both directly and/or indirectly incurred by your client against our client(s) and their motor insurance policy with
AXA.

Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorized driver.

Thanks & Regards

Winnie Ho, Senior Admin Assistant, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email: winnie.ho/@axa.com.sg
Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 / Fax: (65) 6880 4838

- £l
*

JEL #1 GLOBAL INSURANCE

50 Years
in Singapare

pRANG FOR 10
CONSECUTIVE YEARS

Please consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately

From: Claims <claims{@ premiumauto.com.sg=>

Sent: Tuesday, October 8, 2019 9:41 AM

To: HO Winnie <winnie.hof@axa.com.sg>

Ce: claims/@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED
QKK5455A DATED ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Winnie,

Attached is the Rental Agreement for your perusal.



Your closest corr
on the road.
The new Audiﬂ. 5

Find out more |

e — e e

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from
your system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person.
Thank you

From: HO Winnie [mailto:winnie. ho(@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 3 October, 2019 5:02 PM

To: Premiumauto Claims <claims(@premiumauto.com.sg>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora khaif@premiumauto.com.sg=>

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK35455A DATED ON
06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Save as to Costs

Hi Kelvin,
Please furnish the rental agreement. Tks

Thanks & Regards

Winnie Ho. Senior Admin Assistant, Motor Claims Department

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: winnie.ho@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 / Fax: (65) 6880 4838

GLOBAL TNSURANCE

BEAND FOR 10
coNsECUTIVE YEARS

Plzase consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, Is prohibited, If you are not the
intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately

7



his emil, mcluding any attichment, 1s confidential and may also be privileged
IT vou have received 110 eror, please notify us immediately by reply eminl and then delite this message from vour s3siem
Please do ol copy 1L or use i for any parpose, OF disclose ils contems oF any ntachment 1o any other person. Thunk vou

From: Premiumauto Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 3 October, 2019 10:34 AM

To: 'HO Winnie' <winnie. ho@axa.com.sg=>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khaif@premiumauto.com.sg=; Claims <claims/@premiumauto.com.sg=
Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Winnie,

Based on the Benchmark rates for rental is as follows:-
- Luxury cars are dependent on make and model and OMV of $3 5.000 and above on first registration.
- Above 1.600cc or 97kW (130bhp) [Category B of COE] - Rental (Per day) $120-5180

Since our client's vehicle is LEXUS ES250 A/T S/R Engine Capacity 2,494 cc and 135.0 kW (181 bhp) OMV
$36.191.00, from One Motoring PARF rebate our client’s vehicle under Category B of COE - Car above
1600cc or 97kW (130bhp). Our counter proposal of $180.00/day is of an acceptable and equitable rate.

TOYOTA

LEXUS CT200H CVT EXECUTIVE HYBRID--1798cc
t ] [ S/R PETROL--2494cc o

LEXUS ES250 AUTO PETROL--2494cc

LEXUS ES250 LUXURY A/T S/R PETROL--2494cc

LEXUS ES250 LUXURY AUTO PETROL--24%94cc

LEXUS ES300H CVT HYBRID--2494cc

LEXUS ES300H LUXURY CVT HYBRID--2494cc

LEXUS ES300H LUXURY CVT S/R HYBRID--24%4cc

LEXUS NX200T CLASSIC PETROL--1998cc

LEXUS NX200T EXECUTIVE PETROL--1998cc

LEXUS NX200T LUXURY S/R PETROL--1998cc

LEXUS NX300H EXECUTIVE HYBRID--2960cc

LEXUS NX300H LUXURY S/R HYBRID--2960cc

Average OMV 5$36,191

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor



This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, gither whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not tha
intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately

From: Premiumauto Claims <claims@ premiumauto.com.sg=

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 1:43 PM

To: HO Winnie <winnie.ho/@axa.com.sg=>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khaif@premiumaulo.com.sg=; Claims <claims(@premiumauto.com.sg=
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED
SKK5455A DATED ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Winnie,

We counter propose.

Cost of Repair 05 16.693.07

Loss of Use ¢ 2,890.00 ($170.00 x 17 days)
LTA b 2.00

Total : 4 19.585.07

Best Regards,

Kelvin Khoo

Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +635 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims/@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p.

A =

+65 6836 2223

on the road.
The new Audi

E Find out more |

Email Disclaimer

[his emuail including any attachment, 15 confidential and may also be privileged

If vou have received it n erod, please natify us immediately by rephy email and then delete this message from your system
Plesse do not copy il of use it for any purpose, or discloss its contents o &y Eachment o an) other person. Thank you

From: HO Winnie [mailto:winnie.ho/@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 27 September, 2019 8:54 AM

To: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

Ce: Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai(@premiumauto.com.sg=

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED ON
06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM1 8022054/Afa3

11



Find out more |

Emall Disclaimer

This erail, including any attachment, is confidential and may also ke privileged

11 vou havie received it in ecror, pleasc notify us immediately by reply email and then deterc this message from vour system
Please do wot copy it of use it for any purpase, or disclose its conents or any aftchment o any other person. Thank you

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 26 September, 2019 2:53 PM

To: 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <CeciliaChong/@lkkauto.com=

Ce: Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>; claims/@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Cecilia,

We regret to inform that our client is not accept with your offer. We counter propose strictly follow by our
LOD.

Kindly let us have your principle in-charge email address.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f.+65 6841 1183

e. claims(@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223
Your closest companion

The new At_xrii"ﬁ

] Fl;n_:lmmll tn;u -i

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any anachment, is contidential wnd may also be privileged.

13



“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice

engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be hinding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Claims [mailto:claims/@premiumauto.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 September 2019 2:36 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong(@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <pora.khaif@premiumauto.com.sg>; claims(@/premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Cecilia.

Kindly let us have your new offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p- +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims(@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Rna_d +_...-' IQ‘ES . +65 6836 2223

Your closest

The new Audi h o

Find out more

Email Disclaimer
This email. inctuding any attachment, is confidential and mayv also be privileged
I wou have roceived it in ervor, please nodify us immoediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system

Please do nod copy it or use it tor any purpose. ar disclose its contents or ury attachment 10 any ather peson. Thank you

15



p. #63 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 £ +63 6841 1183
e._claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w. Www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938

WELCOME TO THE=
8TH DIMENSION.

"

. +b5 6836 2223

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

LFIND QUT MORE I
e b i

____vl—l'—-_._-
S o ——
Email Disclaimer
This email, incleding any attachiment, 15 contidential and may also he privileged
I wou harve pecesved it ervor, please notify s immediately by reply email and then delete this message from vour system
Please da ot copy 1Lar use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attichment o any other person. Thank you

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong/@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September, 2019 9:21 PM

To: Premiumauto Claims <claims@ premiumauto. com.sg>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK3455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Kee Siang,
We are pleased to re-offer Global Sum of $18,490.00 (all-in).

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver, The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LEK Aulo Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

Se=RmER NET Sqve the Earth Print only when necessary:

17



LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Premiumauto Claims [mailto:claims/@ premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 9 September 2019 10:08 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong/@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>; Claims <claims(@ premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Hey Cecilia!
Hope your Friday weekend is good.

Any update from your principle ?

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd ime v imosomiw

35 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. 65 6388 2323 d. +65 67689911 £ +656841 1183

e. claimsi@ premiumauto. com.se  w. www audi, ;

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

WELCOME TO THE== &
8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

{ FIND OUT MORE

A ——

Email Disclaimer

Thiz email, Including any attachment. is confidenyial and may also be privilegad
It you howe recerved it i error, please notity us immaedistely by reply ematl and then debete this message from vour svstem
Please da not copy it or use 1t for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any antachment 1o any other person. Thank vou

From: Premiumauto Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 6 September, 2019 5:58 PM

To: 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Claims <claims@ premiumauto.com.se>; Norazima Khairuddin <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Cecillia

19



Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408023)

From: Premiumauto Claims [mailto:claimsi@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 6 September 2019 11:10 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong/@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Claims <claims/@premiumauto.com.sg=>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

Dear Cecilia,
Our client is not agreeable with your offer. For Amicable settle we counter propose follow by LOD.

Your early reply is well appreciate.

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd ireg ro o7 1wy

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 £ +65 6841 1183
e. claimsappremivmauto. com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

WELCOME TO THE
8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

|

FIND OUT MORE

Email Disclalmer

This email, including any attachment, is confdential and may also be privileged
I yiu have received it in arror, please netily us immediately by reply emuil and then delete this message from vour system
Please di nat copy i1or use ik foe any purposeor disclose s contents or any attachment s any other person. Thank vou

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong/@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 6 September, 2019 10:54 AM

To: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2310 K AND YOUR INSURED SKK5455A DATED
ON 06/12/2018 (VEHICLE IN) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Kelvin,

We are pleased to offer Global Sum of $18,360.00 (all-in) as per our principal instruction.

21



-" UV Autc

- aawm Consulfants
Sl BA B Ple Lid

51 UBIAVE 1, #01-23 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (D631 62564315

15" December 2018

SUBRAMANIAM S/O MUNEYANDI
25 Choa Chu Kang North 6,

03-12,

Singapore 6B9580.

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18022054/Afa3

YOUR REF : SKK 5455A

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING NOS. SKK 5455A AND SKX 2310K ALONG
INTERNATIONAL BUSINESS PARK ON 06.12.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party
Property Damage claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s Premium Automobiles, acting on behalf of the owner
of SKX 2310K against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had
collided into Third Party vehicle SKX 2310K. As such, liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the
claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to pohkin@Ikkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter_if not provided
at AXA's reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may
be required:

* Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim



! '[U Aute

= Consuitants
Sl BA B Pre Lid

51 UKL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 625635361 FAX : (003) 62564315

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
seftlement without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2132 or email us
at pohkin@lkkauto.com.

Flease quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

A
gL
PohvKin, Chong

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@lkkauto.com

cc.  AXA Insurance Ple Lid (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)



Letter of Authorization
Your ref: SKK5455A

Our ref: PA/TP/1401/2018/1E
21 December, 2018

Mr Quek Boon Chuon

Blk 13 Ghim Moh Road
#25-35

Singapore 270013

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
B Shenton Way

#27-01 AXA Tower

Sineapore (68811

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

Accident involving SKX2310K / SKK5455A

On International Park At 06 December 2018.

[ am the registered owner of SKX23]10K.

I confirm that I will be claiming for Rental Charges / Loss of Use and

hearby authorize your esteemed company to settle Rental Charges / Loss of Use

and repair bill directly with Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd.

Your kind attention will be greatly appreciated.

Yours faithfully,

Mr Quek Boon Chuon

Copy to Norah Khai, Premium Automobiles Ple Lid



AXA THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

 Vehide No: ] sk sas5m _(imsdveh)
) SHX 2310K (TP veh] Model: TOYOTA LEXUS ES250 A

| Date of Accident/ Time: 06/12/2018 . —
| Rapa.:_[:mrﬁ_m; o 5 | ,_i"IJ, 6.?_5- EE B o

Final Repair Cost [-lui"nfl'li'H G_S?} ¢ | 1669307 . . S

Loss of Use o 5 — S days at & per day

Rentallifany) | s | 2.475.00 |15 days a1 5165.00 per day
| L1A/ GIA Search Fee ) 2.00 ]

Othert: B o

N 5
Final Settiemantsam REIETT

Fayee Name : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD

is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [%] Yes5 [ | WO (Kindlyindicate below)

Al For Mon GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liabiliry (%} o
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: BOLA Applicable; dee' No  BOLA Scenario Moo NIL
BOLA Liabillity: _ £0F  u) Assessed Liability (). - _ (%)
* Assessed Linbility (o be filted only for choin tolinons and for coses where BOLA does nol apgiy.

Remarks

MNOTE:
1. PLEASE EXPRESSLY RESERAVE YOUR CLIENT'S RIGHTS IF 50 REQUIRED IN THIS SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT.

THIS SETTLEMENT 15 ON & WITHOUT PREJUDICE BASIS AND SHOULD NOT CONSTRUED AS AN ADMISSION OF

LIABILITY ON AXA AND THEIR CLIENT/TORTFEASOR IN ANY MANMER WHATSOEVER.

3. AMA RESERVES THEIR RIGHTS UNDER THE POLICY TERMS & CONDITIONS AS WELL AS THEIR RIGHTS IN LAW,

Only applicable to rental claim - Al document are to be submitted with this settiement confirmation. . In the event, rental
agreement / invoices are not received within 7 doys cf this signed confirmation, we will automatically revert to lass of use claim

per the NIMA rates

wefl canfirmed that this Is a full and final settlement that we and or our chent have/had/has against you (AXA and their

policyhalder/eutharised driver tortfeasor] for any and all losses (pasy/present/future] arising from this accident,

Name of Witness:

Date: f-‘/.tﬂl."_f?

Name of Representative:

Date ”Iff.:?/f‘f ___'_h:"'w._ 3
¥))
EnTatiy ’j

~ e E
Signature of workshop repre;entatTﬂBr{:hup stamp Signature of Witneds I'#urhhnp stamp (if applicable)

A1

-~

(
Signature of AXA'S surveyn rfrewr
Name of AXA"S surveyor fRepresentative:

S it

A¥A Ingurance Pre Ltd [Company Reg. No. 193503512M)
E Shenton Way 824-01 AKA Tower Singapore 068811

AXA Custommer Centre #01-21/22

Telephone: +65 GBE0 4EEE - axe com.sg




Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Audi Centre Singapore Alexandra Service Centre Ubi Service Centre Customer Service
261 Alaxandra Road 281 Algwanura Road 55 Ui Road 1 Sarvice Agpointment E36S 2323
Singapore 150033 R Singapora 15B636 Singapare 406599 Z4-hour Breakgown Service SE28 1233
Main Talephane 6836 2223 Main Telaphone B3B8 2223 Main Telaphdne 5368 2323 Email Custamer careEoremium Ut com sg
Main Telafax  Bd471 3733 Main Talasfax  B4TE 1023 Main Telafax G841 1183
CASH TAX INVOICE
Page 1 19:12 Company Reg. No., 18%%02271W
GET Reg:. No. 199302271W
B Bh.fudk _ Invoice: s1242246 Account: coo01 (T 726
Blk 13 Ghim Meh Road
k25-35 T
Date 03/0%/201% CASH SALES - SERVICE SALES
Singapore 270013
Order SK¥2310K
Term 0o
Regn No: skxz3tox (v 4066%) Regn Date: 30/10/2015 Mileage: &3z87 WIP No.: 11p3s
Model: TOYOTA LEXUS ES250 A/T S/R Chassis: JTHBI1GG002087402 Engine: zarr101864 Dept: o
You have been assisted by - ve-Tony Foong [ 23 )
Details Qry Unit Price Amount
(0] QOTHEERS M: A0e0 .00 1,00 3,060.00
ARRANGE RERTAL CAR (S1HO/DAY X 17 DAYS)
Parts .00 Sub-Total 3, 060.00
Labour 3;080.00
Sublaet 0,00 ) 51420
Menus 0.00 794 GST 214320
Lubricant C.oo
3 TR
Grand Total Sir= e
Received by For & on behalf of

Premium Automobiles Pre Ltd



12/6/2018 Invaice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore D48580
INSURANCE Frone: +65 6224 0010 Fax. +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating_ Hnu_rs: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration Mo M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-189305

Date of Request: 06/M12/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Premium Automabiles Pte Lid

55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408699

Dear Sir'Madam),

Enquiry Date 06/12/2018

Enquiry By Tony Foong Chin Fong

TP Vehicle No. SKK54554A

Accident Date 0822018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SKK54554, AXA Insurance Ple Ltd 28/03/2018-27/03/2019 6338 7288
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of

Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of

of In cannection with the reparts or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

hitps./lsingapore. merimen com/claimsiindex cfmPusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp _geninvipérefid=19967 364 CFID=4408 14304 CFTOKEN=22,

112



12/6/2018 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Dur Ref MNo: GR-18-189305
Date of Request: 06/12/2018 Your Ref No: Cnline Purchase
Premium Automebiles Ple Lid
55 Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408694
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 08122018
Enquiry By Tany Foong Chin Fong
TP Vehicle No. SKK54554
Accident Date 061212018
DESCRIPTIOMN AMOUNT (S§)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[¥X] GIRC [ ] Cash [ ] Cheqgue

hitps:isingapore r'nerimen.mm."{:laims-’inde:-c.c:rm'?fusebnx=MTRsasafuseantion=dsp__genin-.-!p&reﬁd=1ESETSB&CFID=149$1439&CFT0KEN=522 piis il



