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Your ref: To Be Advised
Our ref: CO6/EQLIBO2204%/T 1 pb3 Date: 07.12.2018

The Motor Claims Department

Mis EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, GBGYT73H
We refer to the above mutter,

Plcasc be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 06.12.2018

ar the premises of M/s_Cheng Auto Bodyworks _and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% B,986.21

Revised Estimate Amount ] 4,826.92

"Check” ltems Amount : 5§ -

Marker Value : 53 -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 58 -

Nent Value : §§ -

Description of Damage: r————

The vehicle sustained damages at the o i B

Front O/S Portion e )
e

Comments/Present Status:

Dramages Consistent

Estimated normal period for repairs: 3 days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser
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THIRD PARTY / EQ INSURANCE

A gree femmswmame st (CHENG AUTO
———————— ) Spewyyewtng | 1006 ios JrerL A08-41 Porser Comire. SIgeprt S17HS 3555777E /
AT g W AESEETT L "."“' L T =~ e i e e L ]
DATE: 4/12/2018 ’—\
REPAIR DETAILS \ L %
REFERENCE ) El ' G
Vehicie Reg No. GBGAT73 ,'1/ ~—"
Make & Model - HIACE VAN TURBO SDR MT
Chassis No. ITFHTO2P200234443
Engine No. - 1KD2741514
Manufactured Year - 2017
Labour REPAIRER'S
TP Vehicle Reg No. = YP4204Y
DOA & Location 30/11/2018 ALONG 150 SILAT AVENUE CARPARK
Our Ref - GBGHTTIH /  DOTS TECHNOLOGY & TRADING
ESTIMATES OF PARTS (*price 10 BE ADVISED)
No. @ty  Description Part No. Price
1 1 DOORRH $ 144236 b
2 1  DOOR HINGE UPPER 5 7168 K
11 DOOR HINGE LOWER $ 7169 Ly
4 1  DOORRUBBER S 25350 Akl
5 1  DOORLOCK ASSY S 58422 X "
& 1 DOOR CATCH 5 37.45°% s
7 1 WINDOW REGULATOR RH 5 253,594
8 i SIDE MIRROR ASSY RH 5 69122/
q 1 HEADLAMP RH 5 TS B0
10 1 FRTRH PANEL COVER s 1msa bl
11 1 CENRREGRILLE *FBO S 135531 ferier—
12 1 HEADLAMP BRACKET RH $ 39.59 A"
13 1 FAT BUMPER § 48685 ol
14 1 BUMPER RETAINER RH 5 13589 a4
15 1 BUMPER RETAINER LH § 13589 & AN
16 1  APILLARRH $ 45010 R
17 1 CENTRE PANEL s 1320 K
Sub-Total (SS) §  7,62161 40274
SAAA List Itemn Discount 25% [55) § 190540 =
Leoie 6C
Sub-Total [58) & 571621
LABOUR
No. Description Price
LABOUR $ 120000 boo
2 SPRAYPAINTING 1,200.00 ?'5“'3‘
3 DISCONNECT & CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING, HARNESS, WIRE SOCKETS, ETC, REMOVE & REINSTALL s 10000 £
DAMAGED PARTS, TEST & RECTIFY FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING
4 REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT/REMIWINDSCREEN s 1s000 X"
REMOVE AND REPLACE DOOR MECHANISAM s w000 BO

Total Labour [55) 5

285000 |1 s [0



THIRD PARTY / EQ INSURANCE

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
No. Description Price
H BUMPER CLIPS 1 SET § 100,00 'g o
2 GRILLE CLIPS 1 SET 5 10000 J e~
3 DOOR INNER BOARD CLIPS 1 SET $ 10000 20 A —
e FRONT WINDSCREEN SEALANT $ 12000 i
Total Miscellaneous items (55} § 420.00 5
Total Parts (S5) §  5.716.21
Total Labour (S$) §  2,B50.00
Total Miscellaneous (55) 5 420.00
Total {S5) § #98521
GSTT% (S8) §  629.03
Grand Total (S5) § 961524
3 0l ikl T 1 }LF‘lﬂ'%b)
140 Wl
"__‘__'"" y {,{? =
W | 63 ¢sop
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Justin Wong <justinwong@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 10:06 AM

Ta: Shu Pel (LKKAuta)

Cc Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKRAUtO)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YP4204Y (OI - EQI - TBA) AND GBGYT73H (TP
: LKK REF - CCE/EQI18022048/T1pb3) on 30.11.2018

Attachments: Ol GIA - YP4204Y PDF

Dear Shu Pel,

Please find our insured GIA report as attached

Liability is clear hence kindly proceed with direct settiement
Thank you

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

7

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110 _—
dic 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190 [=]
WWW.BgINSUrance.com.sg

Hh= |

Privileged/Confidential infarmation may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@|kkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, December 7, 2018 6:55 PM

To: lustin Wong <justin.wong@eginsurance.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.coms

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YP4204Y (Ol - EQI - TBA) AND GBGS773H (TP : LKK REF -
CCR/EQUI1B022048/T1pb3) on 30.11.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Justin,

We refer to the above matter.



We have inspected TP vehicle GBG 9773H at M/s Cheng Auto Bodyworks on a WP hasis and TP repairer proposed
for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal 1s:
- TP's GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
. Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admn

LKK Auto Consultants Pe Ltd

Phone: 6366-005% | email: shupeliElkkauts.com | faxc 67414108
fik 51, Paya Ubi industral Park, Ut Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(908933)



*Report Remarks Entry

Report Remarks Entry - CCO/EQIIS022048/T1wh3

Page | of ]

Remarks
Remarks
Add !
Remarks 1 N N ¥y I‘?“ [
71122018 | |
[]|GBG 8773H ; YP 4204Y LSP [3:22:58
PM
TH2R2018
[1|EST - §-— SUR : MTH — WKSP CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS LSP g:ZE'BE
M
Dear Shu Pei, Please find our insured GIA report as attached . Liability is clear hence kindly 1111272018
] |proceed with direct settlement. Thank you. Regards, Justin Wong Executive | Claims EQ  [LSP [8:28:26
Insurance Company Limited M I
| 111122018
[]IFILE PASSTO CHT LSP A::'ﬂ 33 I
1332018
0 CALL OI IN CHARGE (JASON) NOT IN OFFICE. HIS STAFF WILL NOTIFY HIM AND cpL |319.30
GET HIM TO CALL BACK " :
14372018
[]|IN CHARGE{JASON) NOT AVAILABLE - TO SEND OUT LETTER ICPL |10:32:46
AM
16/32018
[ ]|SEND LETTER TO Ol - FILE PASS TO VIC TO CHECK CPL |10:42:55
LAM
|6re2019
[1|FILE WITH TAUFIKH FOR FINALISE CHT [10:00:03
AM
19
[ 1] TRANSFER TO VIVIAN CHT [9:18:41
A
Rec'd email from TP: Dear Mr Taufikh, We accep! the offer of 553,550 .00 & 05 days 20/8/2010
[ ] |Please advise if the Letter of Demand Is to be submitted to LKK or directly to EQ. Thanks & |CHT [7:47:24
Best Regards, Claims Depariment AM
31/8/2018
[]]*TP LOD IN VIA EMAIL ICHT |1:20:23
PM I
hutp://www.init.com.sg/VIEWS/entry/ReportRemarks Entry aspx?nid=289660 24/10/2019
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- Pre L Company Regisiration Mo, 12980718388

1 LI AVE L A02-25 PAYA UREINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563501 FAX : (065) 62564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 19/11/2019
DIRECT S ME
. YP 4204Y (insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DMCFHQ18-000034
Vet te: | GBG9773H (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CCH/EQI18022048/TThbda2
Date of Accident 30711172018
Liability 100% B
Final Repair Cost  |'$ 3,798.50 B -
LogsofUse -$ | due B o
Rental (If any) :$ ~ B56.00 8 days - o
Others: Ll 3 _2_9__!'}[} B o
4 683.50
Final Settlement Sum |: § 4 680.00 |GLOBAL SUM

Remarks ===
nt | ion: P 's Breakdown
1) [CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS B E 5 4 680.00 |
JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libl &ve 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg MNo. 19-9807188-R

“AHlliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Aulomabile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCB/EQI18022046/T 1hb3q2
S ToWR B NN
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 18-11-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP 4204Y Veh. Inspected GBG 89773H
Policy No. DMCFHQ18-000034 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 0&/12/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE VAN c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JTFHTO2P200234443 Colour WHITE
Odometer 42364 Steering IN ORDER
Brakas IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[185R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. I ‘General Information
Accident Date  30/11/2018 Inspection Date DaM122018
Survey held at CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
1 SOON LEE STREET
#06-41 PIDNEER CENTRE
SINGPORE 627605
S5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. | Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR 5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubli Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 8258 2881 FAX. G256 4315

Reg No: 188607188BR GST Reg. MNo. 18-9807198-R Page No.'1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBG 9773H
aty ~ Description of Parts | condition | Estimate By EPW%'-IM:
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|DOOR RH BENT 1,442 36 1.44236
1|DOOR HINGE UPPER TO REPAIR SEE 71.69
LABOUR
1|DOOR HINGE LOWER TO REPAIR SEE 71.69
LABOUR
1|DOOR RUBBER NECESSARY 253.58 253.59
1|DOOR LOCK ASSY NOT NECESSARY 584.22
1|DOOR CATCH NOT NECESSARY 37.45
1|WINDOW REGULATOR RH NOT NECESSARY 253.50
1|SIDE MIRROR ASSY RH TO REPAIR SEE 691.22
LABOUR
1|HEADLAMP RH CRACKED 753.28 753.28
1|FRT RH PANEL COVER BENT 135.88 13588
1|CENTRE GRILLE CRACKED 1.255.11 780.00
1|HEADLAMP BRACKET RH NECESSARY 39.59 3959
1|FRT BUMPER DEFORMED 486.85 486 85
1|BUMPER RETAINER RH CRACKED 135.88 13580
1|BUMPER RETAIMER LH NOT NECESSARY 135.88
1|A PILLAR RH TO REPAIR SEE 460.10
LABOUR
1|CENTRE PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 813.20
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,805.40 -1,006 .86
57168.21 302058
ISPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 30.00
1|SET GRILLE CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 10.00
1|SET DOOR INNER BOARD CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 20.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 120.00
420.00 60.00

Report Ref No. CCE/EQI1B022048/T1hb3g2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

15— 51 Ubi Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

I8 74 74

TEL. 6256 3581 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 199607 198R GST Reg. No. 19-8807188-R Page No.-2 of 2
Description of Parts Condition T iy
] P Workshop ()| ()

LABOUR

LABOUR .INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF DOOR HINGE 1,200.00 600.00

UPPER ,DOOR HINGE LOWER,SIDE MIRROR ASSY RH.A

PILLAR RH AND CENTRE PANEL

SPRAYPAINTING 1,200.00 T00.00

DISCONNECT & CHECK ELECTRICAL 100.00 30.00

WIRING HARNESS WIRE SOCKETS ,ETC,REMOVE &

REINSTALL DAMAGED PARTS , TEST & RECTIFY FOR

PROPER FUNCTIONING

REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT WINDSCREEN. NOT NECESSARY 160.00

REMOVE & REFLACE DOCR MECHANISM 200.00 60.00
2.850.00 1,290.00

GRAND TOTAL 8,986.21 4,470.59

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS | "' ~ 3,550.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) o i

Report Ref No. CCE/EQI18022048/T1hb3q2
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN

MMATAI AMSAE-A
Automotive Assessor

DISTLAIMER OF LIABILITY 70 THIRD PARTIES:- This Rapon is macds solely for ihe use snd bensfii of the Client namod on the front pege of his Reporn

Automolive Assessor




