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! {r l/ Auto

o Consuitants
Bada BA B Pie Lid Gompany Regisiration No, 193607198R

2] UBTAVE 1, #02.25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (5 H2563501 FAX @ ((h5) 62564313

Your ret: GBB 7195R/5L/pl
OQur ref: CS/EGI18022030/Avd3 Date : 4/1/2019
The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice

M/s: ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.GBF 387D

We thank you for your instruction on 7/12/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
vehicle on 7/12/2018  at the premises of M/s NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5%14,750.10

Revised Estimate Amount : $$3,200.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” ltems Amount (8%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value . 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
front ofs portion.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAL PING
B.Eng AMSOEAMIRTE AMSAE-AMMATAI
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 January 2019 11:48 AM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.)’

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GEBT195R / TP : GBF387D/LKK / DOA : 05/12/2018
Attachments: GBF 387D PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBF 387D
Date of survey: 7/12/2018
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 9:50 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: GBB7195R / TP : GBF387D/LKK / DOA : 05/12/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBF 387D on 7/12/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 12:46 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBB7195R / TP : GBF387D/LKK / DOA : 05/12/2018




Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408037)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com sg]
Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 12:04 PM

To: 'admin-d@Ikkauto.com' <admin-d @lkkauto.com=>
Cc: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Ol : GBB7195R / TP : GBF387D/LKK / DOA : 05/12/2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD,

ADDRESS 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#01-43 BLK C AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT : REENA /SUKYl @ 6747 9241

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain
estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in_writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before
vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop

Please fillup the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards.
Yea PaiLi
Claims Assistant (Molor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntee Tower Five
Singapore 0383835

DID.: +55 6B29 9194

Tel. . +B5 6825 51589

Fax : +55 6828 8247

WIWW 0. GO 53 E R G O



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 9:50 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GEB7195R /TP : GBF387D/LKK f DOA : 05/12/2018
Dear Pei Li,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBF 387D on 7/12/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bl 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 12:46 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <5Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@|kkauto.com=>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: GBB7195R / TP ; GBF387D/LKK / DOA ; 05/12/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignmentsi@lkkauto.com | lax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 12:04 PM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Ol : GBB7195R / TP : GBF387D/LKK / DOA : 05/12/2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
bath TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the "Single Joint Expert”.



Please assist to conduct this survey from NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6

#01-43 BLK C AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT :  REENA /SUKYI @ 6747 9241

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain
estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before
vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report({@ergo.com.sg.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee Pei Li
Claims Assistant (Mator)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

DID.: +55 6825 9194

Tel = +65 6820 9199
Fax +B5 6829 9247

WWW 20 COm. 50

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe Worldwide. ERGO is representad in more than 30 countries and concentrates
on Europe and Asia, ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk cariers

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
; WWWL.aVE . COm



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments;

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Friday, 7 December 2018 12:04 PM

‘admin-d@lkkauto.com'

SUR (sur@Ilkkauto.com)

Ol : GBB7195R / TP : GBF387D/LKK / DOA : 05/12/2018

GBF387D - PR5 FORM.pdf

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be

the "Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD,

ADDRESS

PERSOMN TO CONTACT

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6

#01-43 BLK C AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

REENA / SUKYI @ 6747 9241

STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain
estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before
vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee Pei Li
Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

2 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038985

DID.: +556820 9194
Tel. - +55 6829 9199
Fax: +65 6829 0247

WWW. Brg 0. Coum. 50

ERGO

ERGO Is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in mare than 30 countries and concentrates
on Europe and Asia, ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers
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s 07.12.2018 Sent via fax
67417278
our neferente:  SBB T185R/EL/pl or
Your Melerence; 'GEF 387D
Emall

To: NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD
Pre-Repair Survey [PRS) Acknowledgemant
Vehicle For Inspection: GBF 387D
Insured's Vehiche: GBB T135R
Date Of Accldent: 05,12.2018
We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS sn: 06.12.2018
In campllance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendm ent No,1 of 2016", do select an assessor from
the list below and Indicate your selection In the box marked *, * LKK

Al§ Jautomabile Inspection Services Ple Lid L8s LB.5 Aulo Consullants Pie Lid

FTA [FormTeam Consullancy pie Ltd LK LKK Auta Consullants Ple Ltd

A5 Infini] Appraisal Service ] Priority Services

IPK IF Knights Ple Lid VAL Wicam Lid

V_fvour request for Inspection does not have your ciient's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy.
Vo veur requast for inspaction doas not have your cllent's GIA rapery, kindly forward 3 copy.
We schnowledge your Interest for direct sottle ment, we will assess & revert soon upon receipl of estimate.,

v Our Insured's deiver has nol reparted the acclde sl (o us tadste,

V |otheist  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE
Prepared by: PelLi 6E20 9134 1
‘ Q_é ~_.. claims@ergo.com.sg
Slgnature; FAX : 6829 9247
EBES o Werk 18 onlv:
Artacsor allend shep an:
Assignment Date: Dale:
Aszignment Time: Time
Inspeclor:
Remarks: [ vehiclenot avallzBlaat the appointad date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor prasence for the above ek,

Werkshep Acknowledgement & Stamp,
Note: Our lnspection s on o withour sdmirion ra Nability bosis,



ke
dur Reference

Your Beference

07.12.2018

GBB 7195R/5L/p!

GEBF 387D

NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD

Pre-Repair Survey [PRS) Acknowledgement

ERGO

Sent via Fax
6741 7276

ar

Email

Vehicle For Inspection: GBF 387D

Insured's Vehicle: GBB 7195R

Date Of Accident: 05.12.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on: 06.12.2018

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

|

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked =. * .__II;\ B
Als Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd LES LB.5 Auto Consultants Ple Lid
FTa FormTeam Consultancy Pte Lid LKK LKK Auto Consulants Ple Lid
As infiniti Appraisal Seivice Ps Prionty Seivies
IPK 1P Knights Ple Lid VAL WVicom 11d

Your request for inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kndly forward a copy
Your request for inspection does not have your client’s GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

We aclmowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of estimate.

v Cour Irsured s doiver has not reported the accident to us todate
vV |others OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE
Prepared by: E‘_ t:'lf : Paili BET 9154 claims@argo.com.s
Signature: N FAX : 6829 5247
Assessor use anly; Workshop use anly:
Assessor attended workshop on:
Assignment Date Date
fesignment Time Tirme
Inspecton:

Remarks:

[ vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Waorkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp,
Note: Our nspection Is on o without odmission to llobility bosis.




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

1ofl

> Back to OneMotoring

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 10:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Ma.:

vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Yehicle Make:

Vehicle Maodel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year

Engine No..

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amaunt:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Perind|Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Enqﬁire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Campany
3345M

GBF3E7D

Mo

06 Dec 2018
MIS5AN

NV 200 1.6 A
Grey

2015
HR140558870
VM20088220

$16 683.00
26 May 2016
26May 2016
1

$835.00

Mo

$0.00

25 May 2026

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$5,378.00

5401600

$4,016.00

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 06 Dec 2018

OK

hitps: vil.lta.gov.sg/lta vl 'action/enquireRebateByPublicBetore..

612/ 2018, 6:06 PM
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YOU ARE LICENSED TO DRIVE VEHICLES IN THE FOLLOWING CLASS(ES)

EFFECTIVE DATE

Class 3C Motor cars with uniaden welght =< 3000kg with =<7 18 Sep 2017
passengers, exclusive of driver

I [

“ Licence Nu:Gﬂ3433ﬁi

(R

MNP 428A

Page 5 of 11
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"EQ Insurance Company Limited (1]

5 Mucssl] Rpad #7700 Tower Black MND Comple Singepors RETI0
Lol BE G223 5437 | lux 66 6224 3903 | wwwagindursioe. com.ag ﬂns‘ Irol Ice

rag ro, 1870-00490-H
Mwtew G Treodle
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

ROAD TRAWSPORT ACT 1387 {MALAYSIA)
THE MOTOR VEWICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) AULES, 1959 (FEDERATION OF MALAYSIA)
TME MOTOR VEMICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPEMSATION) ACT (C4P, 185 OF THE REVISED EDITION)
(REPUBLLIC OF SIMGAPORE)
THE MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY AISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1996 EDITION{REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE)
O, ANY AMENDMENT, ACT OR ACTS PASSED IN SUBSTITUTION THEREOF.

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE PRIVATE (SCH I )

Comprehensive
certificate No.: ODMCPHQ18-8@3162 Form; LCWRL
Ficess:
1, Index Mark and Registration Number of Vehicles Section 1 SG1508 ., 8
GRF3E7D YEID-aC  Additional 560328800
3. Mams of Palicyholder
) HI HUE PTE LTO
3, Effective Date of the Cormengement of Insurance for the purpese of t

I6/85/1818

, bate of Expiry of Insurance
26/85/2815

. Person or Classes of Persens entitled to drive*

Goods carrylng - (MZ302) Authorised Driver. Any of i
1. The Pclicyholder

1. &ny person on the order or with the permisglt
sprovided that the person driving is permitt ance with the licensing or other laws or
regulations to drive the Moktor wehicle has*ipen pereitted and 1s not disqualifiad by order of

a Court of Law or by reason of any en or Fadulation in that behalf from driving the Motor
vahiela. and provided further that the vehicle is registered under the Read Traffle Act has
not been cancelled at the time ofyfitlident

. Limitations as to use®
1juse in connectilon with
passengers (other than ford)
pusiness. 3juse for soclal ™ % and pleasure purposes.

THE POLICY DOES NOT COMER il

1juse for hire or reward or for racing pace-making peliability trial or speed
testing, 1)Use whilst dra<ing @ greater nunber of trailers in all than is
permitted by Law. 3)use for tha carrlage of passengers for hire or reward.
ajLiabllity arlsing from or in cennection with the carriage of hazardous
materials, high explosives, inflammable liquid or pases including LPG in
cylinders.

dig business. ?)Use for the carrlage of
eward) In connection with the Insured's

slimitarions renderad inoperative by Section 8 of the Motor vehicles (Third-Party Risks and
Compensation) Act (Chaptsr 189) and Section 35 of the Read Transport Act, 1987
{Malaysia), are not to be included under these headings.

I'\WE HEREBY CERTIFY that the Poliry to which this certificate relatas 45 issued in accordance with the
previsions of the Motor Vehlcles (Third-Farty pisks and Compensation) &ct (Chapter 189} and Fart IV
of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia) or and Amendment, Act or Acts passed in substitution thereof.

Uniwsbh/HO/ ABRRLE3/ Instrade Manggement surthorised Signatory

A Memb f Cityst EQ Insurance Company Limited
‘h‘ ember of Citystate

Page & of 11
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NHT ) New HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD,
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C #01-43 Autobay@HKaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Email; admin@nhtmotor.com Website: www.ghtmetor.com
Tel 6747 9241 Fax; 67417276
UEN: 201718370K
06/12/2018
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-43 :
Singapore 417883 [f Ecyo
Accident date: 06/12/2018
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: GBF387D NISSAN NV200 1.6 A'16
CHASSIS: VIM20088220
s/n Qty Items U/price Amount
1 1 Front Bonnet $782.00
2 1 Front Bonnet Lock $74.00~
3 1 Front R/H Fender 5544 80
4 1 Front R/H Fender Inner Panel $237.00~
5 1  Front R/H Fender Cowling $207.10
6 10 Front R/H Fender Cowling Clip $6.50 $65.00
7 1 Front R/H Head Lamp $618.00
9 1 Front R/H Head Lamp Lower Cover $329.60 -
11 1 Front Bumper 10 $548.60
12 8 Front Bumper Clip r¥ $6.50 $52.00 %7 -
13 2  Front Bumper Side Retainer $34.00 $68.00
14 1 Front Bumper Inner Sponge $291.00 -
15 1  Front Bumper Reinforcement .1 $559.00
16 1 Front Grille cadle $383.00
17 8 Front Grille Clip #+7* $6.50 $52.00 ~
18 1  Front Support Panel $362.00 ~
19 1 Front R/H Hub Cap $186.00
20 1 FrontR/HRim $650.00 ~
21 1 FrontR/H Tyre N s $380.00 -
22 1 Front R/H Lower Arm $242.00
23 1 Front R/H Knuckle Arm $357.00 ¢
24 1 Front R/H Knuckle Arm Bearing $329.00 '
25 1 Front R/H Shock Absorber $292.00 ~
26 1 Front R/H Drive Shaft $961.00 4
27 1 Front Steering Rack -J $1,670.00 -~
Subtotal :- $10,240.10




Labour charges

To remove & refit air-condenser, radiator, fan motor $380.00 _»
& top up gas

To remove & refit drive shaft & steering rack 5450.00 ~

To remove & refit front R/H undercarriage $380.00
To check wheel alignment $150.00 -
To check wiring ) 30 $100.00

Towing fee $100.00 <
Tuff kote $150.00 ©
Panel beating 51,@.45’[11 809

Spray painting 51,4(,},9766 500

Subtotal :- $4,510.00

Total:- $14,750.10

oted 402259
ik Auike h E‘*f-’.-’if-“w"";r' " 22 0 |

'.II'f-.' Repairel : 1 ' -~

T+ rmeurey belerelatier spray paintng
.. 3 | samaged partis| during resuNVey ' 0 g Ve M3
mh el a d

Supplementary g el DE TESL rveeved and
a5 gmenid e .

oo feaen (e rance Company
s subject o final approval rom Ingurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Diate:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

adm m - 51 LJbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. No: 199607 198R G3T Reg. No. 19-8607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref ©  CS/EGI18022030/Avd3n2

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

LI

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date . 14-01-2019
SINGAPORE 038885
Code . EGI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBB 7195R Veh. Inspected GBF 387D
Policy No. Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. GBBET195R/SLp Excess (%) Q.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 07/12/2018
&l Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model  NISSAN NVZ00 c.c 1597
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. VM20088220 Colour GREY
Odometer 78405 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification MIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre 185/70 R14 HABILEAD & mm
L/H Front Tyre |18570R14 HABILEAD 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre 18570 R14 HABILEAD & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/70 R14 HABILEAD & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/12/2018 1Inspsctian Date 07/12/2018
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A'WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBF 387D

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Page No.1 of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BONNET TO REPAIR SEE 782.00 .
LABOUR
1|FRONT BONMNET LOCK MOT NECESSARY 74,00 -
1|FRONT R/H FENDER DISTORTED 544 BO 544 80
1|FRONT R/H FENDER INNER PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 237.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT R/H FENDER COWLING DEFORMED 207.10 207.10
10|FRONT R/H FENDER COWLING CLIP @$6.50 NECESSARY 65.00 30,00
1|FRONT R/H HEAD LAMP CRACKED 518.00 £18.00
1|FRONT R/H HEAD LAMP LOWER COVER DEFORMED 329 60 320,60
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 548 60 548 60
B|FRONT BUMPER CLIP @$6.50 NECESSARY 52.00 30.00
2| FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @$34.00 0/S DAMAGED 68,00 3400
1|FRONT BUMPER INNER SPONGE CRACKED 291.00 2591.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 559.00 55900
1|FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 383.00 -
B|FRONT GRILLE CLIP @$6.50 NOT NECESSARY 52,00 -
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 362.00
LABOUR
1|FRONT R/H HUB CAP NOT NECESSARY 186.00 3
1|FRONT R/H RIM NOT NECESSARY 650.00 .
1|FRONT R/H TYRE NOT NECESSARY 380.00 e
1|FRONT R/H LOWER ARM NOT NECESSARY 242.00 -
1|FRONT R/H KNUCKLE ARM NOT NECESSARY 357.00 -
1|FRONT R/H KNUCKLE ARM BEARING NOT NECESSARY 329.00 -
1|FRONT R/H SHOCK ABSORBER NOT NECESSARY 292 00 -
1|FRONT R/H DRIVE SHAFT NOT NECESSARY 96100 -
1|FRONT STEERING RACK NOT NECESSARY 1,670.00 x
LESS 10% DISCOUNT . 31921
10,240.10 287289

Report Ref No, CS/EGI18022030/Avd3n2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.Z of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::?;;-'T;H Ot ‘"i;ﬁ"’md

LABOUR

TO REMOVE & REFIT AIR-GONDENSER RADIATOR,FAN |NOT NECESSARY 380.00 |

MOTOR & TOP UP GAS

TO REMOVE & REFIT DRIVE SHAFT & STEERING RACK. |NOT NECESSARY 450.00

T REMOVE & REFIT FRONT R/H UNDERCARRIAGE. NOT MECESSARY 380.00

TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -

TO CHECK WIRING 100.00 30.00

TOWING FEE. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 =

TUFF KOTE. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 :

PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 1,400.00 600.00

BONNET FRONT R/H FENDER INNER PANEL AND FRONT

SUPPORT PANEL

SPRAY PAINTING 1,400.00 500.00

4,510.00 1,130.00

GRAND TOTAL 14,750.10 4,002.88

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,200.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18022030/Avd3n2

KR

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:: This epart is mate soledy for the use and benefit of the Clent named on the front page of this Repont.
Sl 5 capied Lo amy third packy s o .

on ihe Beper wiwily or in par riy Bl s




