Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Dear Veron,

We confirm the finalize.
Thank you so much
Your sincerely

Michelle Fang

92394128
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd

Michelle <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Friday, 14 December 2018 2:12 PM

Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A
taxiscs@stengg.com; ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG;
Carlor.chan@dingauto.sg

Re: 50111183/SHB4588P - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo

On 14/12/2018 10:42 AM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) wrote:

Dear Jing Feng,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm finalize Amount $2149.06 @ 3 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: taxiscs@stengg.com <taxiscs@stengg.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 4:58 PM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

<AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG; ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG; Carlor.chan@dingauto.sg

Subject: 50111183/SHB4588P - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo

Dear Officer ,

Please see below for the finalize according to our conversion to finalize for SHB4588P
Kindly check the attach after paint .



Total Repair - 03 Days
P/P REPAIR

Labour - $700.00
Special Netts - $40.00

Parts After 20 % discount = $1409.06
Final Amount L+S+P =$2149.06

Finalize Amount $ 2149.06

Please help to close this case ASAP

Thanks

Best Regards

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Jing Feng

Hp :97335832

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed to our main office
address

BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645

[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please
delete it and notify us immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its
contents to any other person. Thank you]

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed to our main office address
BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645
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