Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 5:05 PM

To: '‘Ng, Hai-Chuan'

Cc: ‘Yong, Ivy-AV'; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau
(LKKAuto); chew.mun.kam@sg.pwc.com; SUR

Subject: RE: AIG REF: 0610071955SG

Hi Hai Chuan,

This case unable to proceed private settlement with TP owner/repairer due to TP has pass the case to Lawyer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 3:56 PM

To: Ng, Hai-Chuan <Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com>; chew.mun.kam@sg.pwc.com; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Yong, lvy-AV <lvy-AV.Yong@aig.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG REF: 0610071955SG

Dear Hai Chuan,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Shirley,

Kindly assist CS/AIG18022019/Asb

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng, Hai-Chuan [mailto:Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 11 December, 2018 3:50 PM




To: chew.mun.kam@sg.pwc.com; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Yong, Ivy-AV <lvy-AV.Yong@aig.com>

Subject: AIG REF: 06100719555G

Importance: High

Dear all,

The hirer would like to have a private settlement with TP owner/repairer.
Please revert if it is possible.

Thank you.

Ng Hai Chuan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65)6419 1994

Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com | www.aig.sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.

Click here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies
or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or
other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for

any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



