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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18008627MFSH Date: 09 January 2019

Our Ref® CS/FCI18021969/Aqb

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SKV 45367 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 06/12/2018 at the premises of M/s ZERO GRAVITY. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :8% 926529 .

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2.900.00 (Lump Sum) .
“Check” ltems Amount : 5§ - ;

Market Value : S8 E

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% B

Nett Value e -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the o/s portion.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WA] PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, MMATA!

Licensed Appraiser



i i M5 First Capital Insurance Limited CoReg ho 1950001060 GST Reg Wo. M2-0001676-9
Ms . F.rStcaplta] B Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580

Tel |65) 6222 2311 Fax: {G65) 6222 3547

Claims & Motor Underwsiting Dopt: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 Gty House Singapore 06BE77
Tek (65) 6507 3048 Fax: (65) 6507 3849

www.msTirstcapitaloom.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 05-12-2018 Our Ref No. D18008627MFSH
Accident Date 04-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHB3237J Third Party Vehicle. SKV4536Z
Survey Location 2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #01-25 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
Contact Person. TIFFANY
Contact No. 67412845/ 67477100 Fax No. 67412170
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
Appointed

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD FPARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop ZERO GRAVITY Attention. MIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA
Officer Incharge JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated |etter, no signature required.

A Memper of ERERRIEY INEURANCE GROUP




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

#

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 January 2019 5:44 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc 'Joanne Yong Lai fong’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008627MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18021969Agb.pdf

Dear Joanne,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SKV 4536Z.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-35 | S{408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 10:34 AM

To: 'CWS Mator Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong Lai fong' <loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008627MFSH/1

Dear loanne,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKV 4536Z on 06/12/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sipwse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent; Thursday, 6 December 2018 10:02 AM

To: 'CWS Mator Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'loanne Yong Lai fong' <loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1800BE27MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consullants Ple Ltd

Phone; 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

1



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 10:34 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Ce: ‘Joanne Yong Lai fong'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008627MFSH/1

Dear Joanne,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKV 45362 on 06/12/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan {(Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 December 2018 10:02 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong Lai fong' <loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008627MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 6 December, 2018 5:44 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong Lai fong
<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008627MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.
Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,



ZERO GRAVITY

Tel: +6i5 67412048 Fax No: +85 6741 2470
Ernail: zaro_gravity@singnel.com.sg
Buss.Reg.No. §23B88867X

P';H' n- Ddrian

QUOTATION

[ M8 FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED i

6 ROBINSON ROAD

EE————

2 Kaki Bukit Avenue 2, #01-25 Kaki Biukit Autohub, S ngapore 417921

Mo : QT-000155

Your Ref.
Vehicle No.

Maks & Model

SHB32371

v SKEV45357
. NISSAN SYLPHY

#16-01 CITY HOUSE Chasls o MNTBBABL 720024358
SINGAPORE 068877 Engina Na. HR1GS7T18660
attention: Motor Claim Department Accidert Date 04/12/2018
|_'|'EL . GE073548/68545466 FAX 65073849 | Policy Mo, D-1809161 1MVPC
ot - Diate : 0&/12/2018
Thank you for your inquiry. We are pleased ta submit our quote as follows: Page 1of3
Ttam Description Oy 07 Frice Armocnt
&s &4
1 DOCR (R/H/R) Deaded - 11 pce 01720 917.20
3 DOCR STICKER (FRAME) M’ 3.0 PCL 310,30 s 90.50
3 DOOR ANTI SPLASH PLASTIC 53AL At fies 1.0 PCH 33.M X 3370
4 DOOR INNERTRIM BOARD CLIp M3 Flw 120 PCY 5.70 8220
s DOOR GTOPPER RUBBER  pxt = 1.0 FCS 27.00 L 22.00
6 DOOR INNER LOCK (RiH/R) De—d 10 FCS 18370 o 183.70
7 DOOR CATCH (RAHIR) pirt re” 10 PCS 55.00 X 55,00
§  DOOR FRAME BEADING ptf 1.0 FCs 21430 v 214,30
9 DOOR WEATHER STRIP (R/H/R) NV 1.0 FC3 117.40 117.40
10 DOOR HANDLE (OUTER) 1.0 PC3 26990 | 2€9.90
11 DOOR HANDLE (INNER) 10 PCi 5800 A EBG0
12 DOOR HINGE (R/H/R UPFER) 10 BC3 €210 7 €210
13 DOOR HINGE (R/H/R LOWER) Lo PC3 e210 A €210
14 STEP GARNISH (R/H/R) L0 PCs 75.00 & 7500
15  WINDOW RESULATOR (R/H/R) iPwod L0 PGS 115,80 v 115.80
16 WINDOW REGULATOR MOTOR (R/H/R] Nk p 10 PCS 577.40 3 577.40
17 SWITCH (DOOR) 20 réer Ll %S 46,60 x 49,80
18 pumperclp pet el g2 X5 2,80 X, 22.40
16 Discount 10 % -301.71
20 SubTotal () 2,715.39
21 SPORT RIM (R/H/R) LT L0 RS 43000 430,00
23 TYRE(R/HIR)  NH o~ 1.0 ™S 22000 ¢ 220,00
73 SHOCK ABSORBER (F/H/R) i“’ 5 o 1.0 RS 17850  , 17850
24 WHEEL BEARING (R/H/R) 1.0 PS 47150 4 47150
35 SIDE SKIRT (R/H) w”:\lx.,-. L0 ms §30.30 4+ 680BD
26 MUD PLAG (R/H/R)  piFf pa- .0 PUS 5830 - 5880



ZERQ GRAVITY

2 Kaki Bukit Avenue 2, #01-25 Kkl Elu

Emall zero_gravity@s/ngnet.com.sg
Buss.Reg.No. H2338867X

kit Autohub, Singapore 417921

Tel: +65 67412345 Fax No: +65 67412170

: QT-000155

QUOTATION No
[ 145 FIRST CAPTTAL INGURANCE LIMITED T Your Ref. . eHR3237)
Vehicle No. © SKVA5352
36 ROBINSON ROAD Make & Mcdel : NISSAN SYLPHY
#16-01 CITY HOUSE Chass No, MNTBBAB1770024358
SINGAPORE 068877 Engnz No. . HR169718688
Attention: Mator Claim Department Accicert Dite  ; 04/12/2018
| TEL  :65073648/68543466  FAX ;65073649 | Pl DSOS i
em— Date + 06f12/2013
thiank you for vour inquiry. We are pleased to sUbmit our quofe & follows: P92 :20f3
T ltem Descrption o R 7 firce Amount
L 55
37 DOUR FROTECTER (R/H/R)  pliar o f T Roe 00 W70
2@ FENOER (RIHR)  Bepd” [ (’Jq7 1L PCS R54.80 2 694.60
20 BUNFER SIDE Rfmmén [R/H/T) JT } 5 1“}‘- 20 1L PO 13.60 Ao 1960
30 REAR BUMPER e £ 4 ' e 1.0 FCS 3&3.90 A 343 90
31 WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL (REAR) E A ON AL 1.0 FCH 95.0) » 95.00
32 SEALANT (WINDSCREEN) Nt~ 1.0 PGS 35.00 v 1500
33 SubTofl (S) 3,549.90
54 PANEL BEATING & REPLACING OF THE ASCVE 10 X 607 Lend
35 TO PUTTY AND RE-SPRAY AFFECTED PORTION 10 X €0 1,00e0
26 TO PROVIDE UNDER TURFCODE X X 150.00
47 TO REMOVE AND REFTT COMPONENTS / FACILITATE THE REPAIR 10 X _ 40 15€750
99 TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM & ENSURE FUNCTION OF COMPONENT 10 ¥ ! {f 0. o wpdo
39 TO REMOVE AND REFTT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS 10 X e 150,00
43 TO HEMOVE, TRANSFER B INSTALL RELATZD COMPONENT 16 % £ 120.00
41 TO COMPUTERISE ADIUST WHEEL ALIGNMENT 15 /7 e
42 SubTofzl (LABOUR) 3,000.00
T O S SR Ao 2361730
ik ' |
o T " ,! C g G‘ L
17 3V i basi I
s IJ; I|. i and W g ¢
Is subject o approval fron inpe Company \
Acknowiedged by Repaire _ s
!‘i?;ﬁ'.ure. t:!' q Ic



ZERO GRAVITY

Tel: +65 §74120456 Fax No: +65 67412170
Email: zero_gravity@singnet.com.sg
Buss.Fug.No.: 526E8887X

2 Kaki Bukit Avenua 2, #01-25 Kakl Bukit Autohub, Singi pos 417321

QUOTATION Mo : QT-000155
| M5 FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITEL T Your el SHB3237]
Vieshicds: 1o, SIKF45367
36 ROBINSON ROAD Make B Macel : NISSAN SYLPHY
£16-01 CITY HOUSE Chasis No : MNTBEBA31770024358
SINGAPQRE Q68377 Engine Mo, : HR1E971B63B
Attention: Motor Claim Department hecldent Dae @ 04/12/2018
| TEL  :€5073948/68543466  FAX  : 65073843 B Felicy No. D-18091h 1IMVPC
— = Date : 0B/12/2018
Thank yau faor your inquiry. We are plaased o submit our quote as follows:  Fage 2ot
“Ttem o " Descripfion . R T U/ Price T Amount
3% 5%
SINGAPDARE DOLLAR NINE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED SEXTY FIVE AND CENTS TWENTY
MIMNE ONLY
E.%0.E Tetzl 5% 9,265.2:9
Cdscount S8 0.co
— Netlotel 54 g,265.29
Lamdy
' 5? 4\‘._.__._.__ Terms: C.0.D.
Customer's Slgnature/Co, Stamp ZERO GRAVITY

Any claim for faulty workmanship 8 mited sciehs to the ssctification fres of cest of such veork, nt clalm for loes
congaguential or othenwiza being admiasibie. firy objecions to tha validity of these charges must be made gown (7)
days fram the date of this invoice otharisa if in assurned thet this bl is accaptad &3 cormest.




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 109607188R G5T Reg. No. 18-0607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CSIFCI8021969/Agbn2
:?EF::E?IBIEJT'I'EE ESS;EDSINGAPORE 088877 cociilbic i ”IIMMII"IH”NM
Code : FCIZ
1, Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHE 2237J Veh. Inspected SKV 4536Z
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18008627MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 061212018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN SYLPHY c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. MNTBBAB17Z0024358 Colour BROMZE
Odometer 52372 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Meodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/60 R1& Y¥OKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/60 R16 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/60 R16 YOKOHAMA, & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/60 R16 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 04/12/2018 Inspection Date DE/12/2018
Survey held at ZERO GRAVITY
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-25 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
A1 Uhi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKV 45362
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§)) ()

REPLAGEMENT OF PARTS
1|DOOR (RIHIR) DENTED 917.20 917.20
3|DOOR STICKER (FRAME) @330.30 NECESSARY 90.90 90.80
1|DOOR ANTI SPLASH PLASTIC SEAL NOT NECESSARY 38.70 =
12|DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP @8%6.70 NOT NECESSARY 80.40 -
1|DOOR STOPFER RUBBER NOT NECESSARY 27.00 -
1|DOOR INNER LOCK (R/H/R) DAMAGED 183.70 1B3.70
1|DOOR CATCH (R/H/R) NOT NECESSARY 55.00 -
1|DOOR FRAME BEADING NOT NECESSARY 214,30 =
1|DOOR WEATHER STRIP (R/IH/R) NECESSARY 117 40 117 .40
1|DOOR HANDLE (OUTER) NOT NECESSARY 269.50 -
1|DOOR HANDLE (INNER) NOT NECESSARY 58.00 -
1|DOOR HINGE (R/H/R UPPER) NOT NECESSARY 62.10 -
1|DOCR HINGE (R/H/R LOWER) NOT NECESSARY 62.10 -
1|STEP GARNISH (R/H/R) NOT NECESSARY 75.00 -
1|WINDOW REGULATOR (RIHIR) DAMAGED 115.80 115.80
1|WINDOW REGULATOR MOTOR (RH/R) NOT NECESSARY 577.40 -
1|SWITCH (DOOR) NOT NECESSARY 49,80 -
8|BUMPER CLIP @$2.80 NOT NECESSARY 22.40 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -301.71 -142.50
2,715.39 1,282.50
1|DOOR PROTECTOR (RH/R) MECESSARY 272.00 272.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -27.20
272.00 244 80

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

1|SPORT RIM (R/H/R)(SN) cut 480.00 480.00
1| TYRE RIM (RIH/R){(SN) MOT NECESSARY 220,00 -
1|8SHOCK ABSOREBER (R/H/RI(SN) NOT NECESSARY 178.50 -
1|WHEEL BEARING (R/IH/R)SN) NOT NECESSARY 471,50 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18021965/Aqbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Rag. No: 199607T1898R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R FPage No..2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qi Description of Parts Condition
ty Workshop ($)) (s)
1|SIDE SKIRT (R/H)(SN) TO REPAIR SEE 680.80 -
LABOUR
1{MUD FLAG (RIH/R){ SN} NOT NECESSARY 58.80 -
1|FENDER (R/H/R/)SN) TO REPAIR SEE 694 80 -
LABOUR
1|BUMPER SIDE RETAINER (R/H/R}SN) NOT NECESSARY 19.60 -
1|REAR BUMPER (SN} TO REPAIR SEE 34380 -
LABOUR
1|WINDSCREEN INMER SEAL (REAR)(SN) MOT NECESSARY 85.00 -
1|SEALANT (WINDSCREEN)(SN) NOT NECESSARY 35.00
3,277.90 480,00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING & REPLACING OF THE 1,200.00 500.00
ABOVE. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR GOF SIDE SKIRT
(R/H),FENDER (R/H/R)} AND REAR BUMPER.
TO PUTTY AND RE-SPRAY AFFECTED FORTION. 1,000.00 750.00
TO PROVIDE UNDER TURFCODE NOT NECESSARY 150.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT COMPONENTS/FACILITATE THE 180.00 B80.00
REPAIR.
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM & ENSURE FUNCTION OF 80.00 50.00
COMPOMNENT
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
TO REMOVE TRANSFER & INSTALL RELATED 120.00 50.00
COMPONENT
TO COMPUTERISE ADJUST WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 120.00 80.00
3,000.00 1,610.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,265.29 3,617.30
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,900.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FC118021968/Agbn2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor is made solely for the use and benedit of the Client named on the front pags of this Repon.

Eeport, in wiole of in part. does S0 at his or her own KEk.

O park, Aoy Cherd Do




