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Shirtez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 918 AM

Teo: ‘Jeshurueben Rac Thomas'

Cc 'Liew Thye Wui'; SUR

Subject: RE: Pre-Invoice Of Vehicle Mo: SFPB313P For Finalising

Hi Thomas,
Confirmed final fig of $1,334.15 (part by part) @ 3 days of repairs.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Jeshurueben Rao Thomas [mailto:jeshurueben@honda.com.sg)
Sent: Saturday, 19 January 2019 10:50 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Pre-Invoice Of Vehicle No: SFPE313P For Finalising

Dear Shirley,

Please refer the attached photos as required.
Thank You.

Warmest Regards

Jeshurueben Rao Thomas (Rueben)
Bodyshop Service Advisor

Kah Motor Body Repair Centre

15, Ubi Road 4

Singapore 408610

Tel : 68465672

Hp : 90721766

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Friday, 18 January, 2019 1:20 PM

To: Jeshurueben Rao Thomas <jeshurueben@honda.com.sg>

Ce: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Pre-Invoice Of Vehicle No: SFP8313P For Finalising
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Hi Thomas,

Any update?

Thank you,

Best Regards,

shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.corn | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 11:03 AM

To: jeshurueben@honda.com.sg
Cc: twliew@honda.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Pre-Invoice Of Vehicle No: SFP8313P For Finalising

Dear Thomas,

Kindly send us the before paint photo.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933}

From: Jeshurueben Rao Thomas <jeshurueben@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January, 2019 3:15 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-B <admin-
b@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>

Subject: Pre-Invoice Of Vehicle No: SFPB313P For Finalising

Dear Guo Qiang,
We enclosed the total final repair costs of...

Vehicle No. SFPE313P

Final Repair Costs (include G5T) 51,427.54

Repair Period*(Working Day) 3 days

*Note: Repair period does not include Sunday And Public Holiday.
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Please examine the above information carefully, If no discrepancy is reported within 7 days (exclude Sunday and
Public Holiday) from the date of this email, the information will be considered as correct. Thereafter, no adjustment
will be made.

Thank You
Warmest Regards

Jeshurueben Rao Thomas (Rueben)
Bodyshop Service Advisor

Kah Motor Body Repair Centre

15, Ubi Road 4

Singapore 408610

Tel : 68465672

Hp : 90721766

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.



Catherine Chana (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear LKK oic

- Without Prejudice —

We refer to the above reference,

Catherine Thia <catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>

Wednesday, 5 December, 2018 5:28 PM

assignments

Lucas Lee; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow

FW: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SFPE313P AGAINST SLQ5172Y
ACCIDENT DATE: 02/12/18 - SNM18D05610C02/2

2280_001.pdf

Kindly assist to survey the vehicle an without prejudice basis. We will create in Merimen shortly

Dear Lucas

Please assist to create case in Merimen

Thanks

Catherine Thia

Senior Executive
Motor Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Direct (65) 6389 6193
www sa.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
In Simpapare sinee 1938

Discluimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement berween you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Lid. Any unautharized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,

please motifi the sender immediatefy.



From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December, 2018 9:22 AM

To: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee @sg.cntaiping.com>; Catherine Thia <catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>;
twliew@honda.com.sg

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee @sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SFP8313P AGAINST SLQ5172Y ACCIDENT DATE: 02/12/18 -
SNM18D05610C02/2

Dear all
Mr Liew of Kah Motor called to remind the PRI,
Please assist to look into the matter.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +656389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh(@sqg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
In Simgapore sinee 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notifi the sender immediarely.

From: Liew Thye Wui [mailto:twliew@honda.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, December 03, 2018 4:35 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SFP8313P AGAINST SLQ5172Y ACCIDENT DATE: 02/12/18 -
SNM18D05610C02/2

Dear Officer-in-charge,

Kindly refer to the attachments for third party direct settlement.
Vehicle is not in our workshop. Please call for the arrangement.
Meanwhile, kindly get back to me once liability has establish.

Thank you very much.



Best [lagards

TW LIEW

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.
15 Ubi Road 4

Singapore 408610

DID: 6514 5687

Fax: 6748 0770

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 8354Z
ERYES e E L] P o e s el s s it i St s |
Vehicle No.: SFP8313P
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 10 Dec 2018
Vehicle Make: HONDA
Vehicle Model: ODYSSEY 24 EX-SCVT
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No.: K24W72400424
Chassis No.: JHMRC1880JC201026
Maximum Power Qutput: 129.0 kW (172 bhp)
Open Market Value: $26,982.00
Original Registration Date: 14 Jun 2018
First Registration Date: 14 Jun 2018
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $29,775.00
Eintended PARERe bt Do e T e e e ]
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 13 Jun 2028
PARF Rebate Amount: $22,331.00
EfIntended.COE REDaTe Details B - o L e
COE Expiry Date: 13 Jun 2028
COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $37,605.00
COE Rebate Amount: $35,756.00
Total Rebate Amount: $58,087.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Dec 2018

OK

nipsiivrlita. gov.sgitanvriiacbon/enquireKabatedyFublicEetereDereginputl Y EUNL 110 N_IL=F (VI TRRER

m



BAKMT 181 55116 { Kan Motor o Sdn Bha - Ubi

ENTRY DATE & TIME: 03122018 1412
SUBMITTED BY: Liew Thys Wi

IMPORTANT NOTICE

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

1. Please report comactly the detads of the accident to speed up the clams process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder andfor the Authorised Driver,

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of meaterial facts may allow insurance compenies to
A

repudiate policy liability,

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liabfity on the part of the insurance companias.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for

archiving and thal copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interesied parties,

7. By the lodgement of this report fo the insurers, you hereby consent lo the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the repon being mada available

aloresaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date OFf Report
Date OF Accident

Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

Yehicle Reqgistration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Wame Of Registerad Cwner
MNRIC No

Email Address

Mabile Phone No

Alternative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your awn insurance palicy

for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Mumber

Cover Note Number
Driver

MName of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Mumber

Contact Number
EMail Address

03M12/2018 14:12
0212/2018 16:40

EAST COAST ROAD (NEAR 137E EAST COAST)

SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

SFPB313P

PEK SIN GAY
573283547
PEKSG@HOTMAIL. COM
(LOCAL) +65-98416777
OTHERS-NOPHOME

HONDA
ODYSSEY-2.4 (A)

PERSONAL USAGE

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

AVIVALTD
COMPREHENSIVE
NO

80001230

FPEK SIN GAY

573283542

15/08/1973

INDOOR

08/0715934

24 YEARS AND 4 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-98416777

OTHERS-MOPHONE
PEKSGE@HOTMAIL COM

Page 1of 10



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured
Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own

Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident
Weather Conditions
Foad Surface

Other Information

Was any forelgn vehicle involved in this accident?
Murnber of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/affering accident claims assistance,

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reporied to the police?
If Yes, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intanded Prosecution given?

If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

PLEASE REFER TO ATTACHMENT REPORT.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was there any audio recorded?

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category

Mame of Driver
MNRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Fostcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

BLK 147 TAMPINES AVE 5
#06-230

521147
p1e]
OWNER

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
CLEAR
DRY

NO
2
NO

NO
YES

NO

MO

YES
NO
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

SLAQSITEY
MERCEDES f 5250 / BLACK

PRIVATE CAR

CHEW CHOON KWANG
5180315841

Q2706256

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPCORE) PTE. LTD.

Page 2 of 10



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1
2.
3.

Please report coerectly the detsils of the accident to speed up the clalms process.

This Form must be tompleted by 1he Policyholdar smdfor the Authorized Driver.

Infarmation provided must be as truthful and aceyrate as pogsible. Any wilful misrepresentation ar withholding of material facts
may allow Insurance companies to repudiste : policy lishility,

» The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy lability on the part of the insurance

coMmpanics.

- Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for Inwestization.
- The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Contra established by the General Insurance

Asseciation of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made availabie upon application by
interested parties,

- By the lodgment of this report to the Insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to coples of the

repart belng made available afaresaid.

. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA) | understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

{a} My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore [“GIA") mayfare permitted to collect, use,
disclose andfor process my personal data/personal information set out In this [form] and any other personal infarmation
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (coflectively the “Personal Information®) and disclose and transfer such Persanal
Informiation to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident {all insurerfs) wha have insured vehicle(s)
Involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers"), the Insurers' lawyers/law firme, the Monatary
Autharity of Singanore and any relevant government agencyfautharity (such as the police), for the purpose(s) of :

(i} processing, handling and/or dealing with my ciaims including the settlement of the daims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

[if} Trvestigating the accident andjor my daims:
(ili) carrying aut and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquirics by me;

{iv} administering my daims {including the railing of correspandence, statements, invoices, reports o notces to e, which
could invohe disclosura of certain personal data about me to bring abeut delivery of the same as well as on the external
covier of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

] complying with applicable law in administering, processing. handling andfor dealing with my claims. [collectively the
“Purposes”)

(b} all insurer{s) who have insured vehicle{s) involved in this accident and the Insurers” lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted to
collect, use, disclose andfor process iy Persanal Information for one er more of the above Purpases; and

(] my Personal Information may/can be disclozed by any of the Insurers and/for GIA to thelr third party service providers or
agents{including thelr lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the shave Purposes,

(d]  my Personal Information will alsa be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and al future clalmns.

(e} theinformation so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(i} to all insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, Investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulstors, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonahly required for the purposes stated, or

(it} for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

%%_____“ L
Palicyhol ignature Dehver's Signature quﬂiwﬁmm Personnel's Signature

Date & Time: ‘.3 M2 (g 4T e " (IF driver is nat the palicyhalder) Mame:

Date & Time: NRICSFN No.:

Page 3 of 10



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAM
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{/'We declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect.

Fnil:-,-hoider:s Signature Diriver's Signature
e B Tirme: ‘I{.e’fl,.-" i,g 1T e {if driver is nat the policyhalder]
£ Date & Time:

" Reporting coftre Personnel’s Signature
Marne:
MAIC/FIN Mo,
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| HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
{4 Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)
Service and Body Repair

Tel: +55 6841 3838

Waebsite: www.honda.com.sg

For 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 98203838

QUOTATION

GET Reg Mo M200050223
Company Rel. No. S60FC13805

Customer - CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE Document No. « 5QT18005180 Page 1
3 ANSON ROAD #16-00 Date : 3 Dec 2018
SPRINGLEAF TOWER Customer No. : WZC008
SINGAPORE 079909 Svc Advisor : LIEW THYE WEI
Registration No - SFPB313P Engine No . K24WT72400424
Chassis No - JHMRC1880JC201026 Date | Time + 3 Dec 2018 3:43.57 PM
Model - ODYSSEY 2.4 EX-S 18YM (EURO 6) Surveyor Name
Owner's Name . PEK SIN GAY Survey Date .
Ins Policy Mo. . ——Authorisation-Date—: _
Date of Accident  : 2/12/2018 B s hence nouty
; ’ PRt o0 0%GST Amount
e Hesenptian Quy. . UnitPrice - Disc% .. émount Afount incld O37
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT [J/INC: ) | - a5 are sublect 1o confirmation
OWNER: PEK SIN GAY yjutice™ basss
OWNER INSURER: AVIVA LTD ;
ACC DATE: 021218
SURVEYED BY: Dy e
DATE: M '
REF NO .
TP INSURER: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SPORE) FTE
L
TP VEH: SLO5172Y
04711-TEA-900ZZ  FACEFRBUMPER ¢ e 1 700.00 75 52500 3675 561,75
91505-TMB-003 CLIP BUMPER 7 C 14 2.30 25 24,15 1.69 7584
BO-NUM-COMP-8  NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING-S(N) " (}T 1 4500 45.00 3.15 4815
Sum ltem 594.15 41.59 635.74
BOSUN SUNDRIES WEC 1 wom (O 30.00 2.10 32,10
BKBUDIR REMOVE & RENEW FR BUMPER. 1 560,00 Q,Qa 56000 3920 569.20
R ﬁi?w PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS. e ({-Sa s oo &45.00
/_M SumLabor 119000 8330  1.273.30
- LS
o g (p- [ o
Date & Time Y, ‘.rz,/ [ Q | th Total Amount 178415 12489 190904
Extess we e Total (inclusive of GST) 1,909.04
Status
Signature .179 5&15 4

befer  oined phae s

Printed on 722018 10:50:20 AM
This & & compuber generalad imoice Mo signature is requires

Part priciss ane subgected o change withoul netice
Thia atove astimated cosi of repair do nat melude any unicnseen 05Mages

GST Amounl 5 calculaied from sdivdual Inggs|



L HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)
370 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408651, Tel: +65 6841 3883 Fax: +65 6741 5022

IS rrl I‘,’_.ﬂrﬂ :

Cag V|

(<) SERVICE PRE-INVOICE
KTV Glao Qiavy .

GST Reg No.: M200050223
Company Ref. No.: SE0FC1380G

.
255 Alexancra Road Singapore 155837, Tel: +85 6471 5458 Fax: +65 6471 5460 e = n ﬂ.‘--f _aj' ,

Customer: WZC008 / CHINA TAIPING Document No: SV018075090

Chassis No: JHMRC1880JC201026 Printed By: JESHURUEBEN

License No: SFP8313P Order Date: 17. Decamber 2018

Mileage: 15410 Order Time: 10:15:42 AM

Engine No: K24WT2400424 Service Advisor: RUEBEN THOMAS

TEM DESCRIPTION Ty UNIT DISCY% AMOUNT aeoot AMOUM e

TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT (JNO: T1842)

OWNER: PEK SIN GAY

OWHMNER INSURER: AVIVA LTD

ACC DATE: 021218

SURVEYED BY. GUO QIANG (LKK)

DATE: 071272018

REF NC: SNM18D0SE10C0212

TP INSURER: CHIMA TAIPING INSURANGE (SPORE) FTE L
TP VEH: 5LG5172Y

04711-TBA-800ZZ FACE FR.BUMPER 1 700.00 25 525.00 38.75 561,75
51505-TMB-003 CLIP,BUMPER 14 230 25 2415 1.69 25.64
BO-NUM-COMP-§ MHUMBER PLATE WITH CASING-5{N}) 1 45.00 45.00 15 48,15
SUM PARTS: 584 15 41.59 §35.74
BOSUN 0760 1 10.00 10.00 Q.70 10.70
SUNDRIES
BKBUOIR EXT-YJ 1 280.00 260,00 19.60 295,60
REMOVE & REMEW FR BUMPER.
BPOIR EXT-YBH 1 450,00 450.00 31.50 481.50
SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR
REPLACED AREAS.(TP)
SUM LABOUR: T40.00 51.80 791.80
TOTAL SGO 1,334.15 83.39 1,427.54

Taotal Payable (SGD)

AT Amounl is calculated from individual Bneda}

1,427.54
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co.reg no:1ses07198R;

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CS/CTI180218687/CSEBN2

Date: 211012019
REFERENCE
Handling China Taiping Insurance H ik R DMPCSN3065301801
Insurer: (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. :
Claimant Insured Vehicle
Vehicle No : SFP8313P Nt SLO5172Y
Date of Loss:  02/12/2018 Nature of Claim: TP ﬁ'::"" SNM18D05610
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SFP8313P
Make & Model: HOMDA ODYSSEY, 2.3 (A) Engine No: K24WT2400424
Reg. Date: 14/06/2018 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: JHMRC1880JC201026
Colour: Silver Odometer: 14739 km
Engine Capacity: 2356 cc
Mquet Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes

Handbrake (Serviceable): No Pre-accident Condition:

CONDITION OF TYRES

Y¥es Engine Modification:

Front Tyre Size: 215/55R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/55R17
Front Left Side: Dunlop 8 mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop 8 mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop 8 mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop 8 mm
The above valugs represent the remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 624 15 604 .15 20.00 320
Mizscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,160.00 730.00 430.00 3r.07
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 1,784.15 1,334.15 450.00 25.22
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 124 89 93.39 31.50 2522
Nett Amount (5%) 1,909.04 1,427.54 481.50 25.22
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 1012/2018
Date Inspected: 07/12/2018  Inspected At: Kah Motor Co Sdn Bhd (Ubi)

15 Ubi Road 4
Singapore 408610

Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager: Hiew May Fung

NGTE: This report reprasents our findings at the fime and place of inspection stated herein Such inspection has been carmed out fo the best of our
knewledge and abilty buf any other liability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded,

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/ind ex.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 21/1/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-55G wversion: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 21 Jan 2015}

Parts: M1-MPV HONDA ODYSSEY 2.3 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SFP8313F)

Walidity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an  asterisk °.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FACE.FR BUMPER Deformed 525.00F5  *525.00FS
2 1 *CLIP,BUMPER Mecessary 24 15FS *24 15FS
114 Pcs)
3 1 *NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING-5 Bent 4500FS *45 00FS
4 1 *SUNDRIES MNecessary 30.00FS *10.00FS
F=Franchise part. 5=Spcett
Total Parts (5%) 624.15 604.15
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/ index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 21/1/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.
Recommended Labour
Mo  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Items
1 REMOVE & RENEW FR BUMPER MNew 560.00 280.00
2z SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS MNew 600,00 450.00

(1P)
Gross Labour Cost (5%) 1,160.00 730.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES =

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm? fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 21/1/2019



