Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Pte Ltd A-Tec Automotive <atec_automotive@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 10:24 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: GBD 3889M-DOA: 2/12/2018 (CHINA TAIPING OD)
Attachments: 16042019100744.pdf

Dear Veron,

Please find attached of signed DV.
Thank you and have a nice day.

Peggie Woo

A-Tec Automotive Pte Ltd
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
Premier #04-20

Singapore 415875

Tel: 6384-5206

Fax: 6384-5205

On Monday, 15 April 2019, 1:20:32 pm GMT+8, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Peggie,

Refer attach insurance DV.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pte Ltd A-Tec Automotive <atec_automotive@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 12:43 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBD 3889M-DOA: 2/12/2018 (CHINA TAIPING OD)

Dear Veron,

Need you help.

Original document of final bill and satisfaction voucher already mail out to China Taiping office on 25
February 2019,until now we haven't receive any payment .And we sent email & call them to chase
also no response.

Please help to check.

Thank you very much.
Peggie Woo

A-Tec Automotive Pte Ltd
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
Premier #04-20

Singapore 415875

Tel: 6384-5206

Fax: 6384-5205



On Friday, 11 January 2019, 5:32:18 pm GMT+8, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Peggie,

Confirmed Lump Sum $7500/- before excess $500 @ 10 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE

OIC-Catherine Thia, email: catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 January 2019 3:31 PM

To: 'atec_automotive@yahoo.com.sg' <atec automotive@yahoo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBD 3889M-DOA: 2/12/2018 (CHINA TAIPING OD)

Dear Peggie,

Please refer surveyor’s marking.



Lump Sum $7200/- before excess $500 @ 10 working days.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 4:29 PM

To: 'atec_automotive@yahoo.com.sg' <atec automotive@yahoo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: GBD 3889M-DOA: 2/12/2018 (CHINA TAIPING OD)

Dear Peggie,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle GBD 3889M on Lump
Sum Basis (Excess $500/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at
Tel: 6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance
company before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.



Note: Please arrange after repair photo showing the damaged sliding door beside the vehicle.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



