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FAKELUE Hehate Enguiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Wehicle Owner Particulars
Crwener 1D Type

Chener |

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Ij‘eregisrratlnn Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Frimary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo,

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Cpen Market Value:

Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actisal ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility;

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amaunt:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE PeriodiYears}):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 Dec 2018

Singapore NRIC

38192

SLK28EBS

Yes

04 Dec 2018

B.MW.

523125 AT ABS DVAB 2WD 40R GAS/D NAV
Black

2011
02737831N52B25AF
WBAFPI20XOCRATA3T
1500 kW (201 bhp)
$48,565.00

27 Dec 2011

27 Dec 2011

3

$48.565.00

Yes
26 Dec 2021
£31,547.00

26 Dec 2021

B - Car [1601cc & above)
10

$70,003.00

$21,414.00

$52,981.00

OK

htps: vl tagov.sglin'y rl‘action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereginput? FUNCTION _ID=F0304009TT

Page | of |
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U2 SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD

Block 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4, #06-43 Synergy @ KB Singapore 417800

HP: 96583371

NICLOZ CHEW HOCK HAI ' T2 thing ,
Bk 25 Kaki Bukit Rd 4 F

# 06-43 SYNERGY @KB Ache O
Singapore 417800

Accident date: 01* DECEMBER 2018

04" December 2018

Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SLK28885 BMW 5231 XL 11

sin aty Items/Nett Ulprice - Amount
1 1 Frontbonnet -,-JH Al $2,250.00 L
2 1 Front R/H fender $995.00
3 1 FrontR/H fender cﬁﬁr?g:_"be ‘[-'.-.-J  %215.00 w
4 10 Front R/ fender cowling clips $5.00 $60:00- > 0
5 1 Front RIH headlamp ( rlf-ct’ c! $2,350.00
6 1  Front R/H headlamp panel »/ . 5 $185.00 -,
7 1 Frontfog lamp -RH r"-q [ced ~ $285.00 s
8 1 Frunt_fu_g__l_a!'nﬂ cover _'____ o $125.00
9 1 frontsupport panel $725.00
10 1 _frnnt support panel side lock HIH $155.00 %
111 Front bumper wiper nizzer M $188.00
12 1 Front bumper wiper motor $195.00"
13 1 Front Grille $420.00 A
14 1 Front bumper Ky —~—  _e23%000r /0 &
15 2 Front bumper reverse sensor FBR _3 $210.00 $420:00—+' 0
16 10 Front bumper clips  /“l4  $5.00 $50.00~"
17 1 Front bumper reinforcement -/ st~ $610.00 *
E 2 Front bumper inner sponge ~a.d $80.00 §160:00 &0
19 2 Front Bumper Side Bracket inner PP D¢ $68.00  $13600-(F
20 1 Frontrim-RH = $950.00.+
21 1 Fronttyre -RH _ N e, $800.00.4
22 1 Frontshock absorber-RH | ~7 ~ $780.00%
23 1 Front knuckle arm-RH ~- $580.00 »
24 1 Front knuckle arm bearing ) $480.00 -
25 1 Frontlower arm ] T $450.00 &

Subtotal :- $15,904.00

A
Page 310 540
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Sheet1

meﬂx R/H undercarriage $380.00
To check wheel alignment computer $120.00 4
To Check Wiring System w 2 5 i
Tuff Kote $120.00 A -
Towing charges /03 O ' $100.00 -

I I~
To Panel Beating W >0
s1,n)m(

To Spray Painting S 0 0 A

Subtotal :- $2,770.00

Total:- $18,674.00

dotid ; 625CHO
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~ Jia Le (LKK Auto)

#

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com=

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2019 10:27 AM

To: Jia Le (LKE Auto)

Subject: Re: SLK2888S DOA 01.12.2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI18021950/Aea3
Attachments: CCF07082019.pdf

Dear Jia Le

Enclosed is the DV .
Original will send via post by today , once receive let us have your payment soon . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLle@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, July 29, 2019 9:11 AM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com=>

Subject: RE: SLK28885 DOA 01.12.2018 *** LKK REF: CCB/CTI18D21950/Aea3

Without Prejudice

Dear Chris,

DV attached.

Please return ariginal DV to us. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5702 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe @hotmail.com]

Sent: 5unday, 28 July 2019 11:38 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: 5LK28885 DOA 01.12.2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI18021950/Aea3

Dear Jia Le ,

Accept . DV please . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@|kkauto.com>
Sent; Friday, July 26, 2015 11:42 AM



To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
* ‘Subject: RE: 5LK28885 DOA 01.12.2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI18021950/Aea3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/sdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows:-

1. Cost of Repdir % 5,000.00
2. Loss of Rental (édays x $100.00) $ &00.00
TOTAL &00.00

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without partics resorting to legal proceedings, No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Carlor Chan | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 10:52 AM

To: chan pick yuen; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLK2888S DOA 01.12.2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI18021950/Acal

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Jia Le,

Kindly assist.

Thank You.

Best Regards,



Asher Sng | Case Handler
" “LKK Auto Consuttants Ple Lid

phone: £841-6051 | emnail: gshersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe(@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 10:50 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng(@lkkauto.com=

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com=

Subject: Re: SLK2888S DOA 01.12.2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI18021950/Aca3

Dear Asher,

This case more than 3 month but still no offer yet ? Pls check all my case over than 2 month ( no only ur
case , other Incharge case too) no offer or no payment yet . Pls give me a list with your insurer OIC contact
or email . | want liaise with them directly . I don’t think direct settle can go through in future if every case
wait more than 3 month . Please let me have your reply by today . Don’t send me standard email said
pending approval!!!Thanks

Get Qutlook for 108

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Sunday, May 26, 2019 11:26:17 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Subject: Re: SLK2888S DOA 01.12.2018 **+ | KK REF: CC6/CTI18021950/Aecal

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Chris,

We refer to the email below.
We are still pending approval from our principal.

Shall revert once our principal approved.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 5841-6051 | email: ashenna@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blic 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe(@hotmail.com=
Sent: Sunday, May 26, 2019 1:06 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SLK2888S DOA 01.12.2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/CTII8021950/Aea3

3



‘Dear Asher ,

Final Reminder

Case submitted more than 2 month , but no offer yet ?
Please let us have your offer in next 3 days . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Asher Sng (LKK Auto) <AsherSng(@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, May 6, 2019 12:16 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Subject: Re: SLK2888S DOA 01.12.2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/CT118021950/Aea3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Chris,
We refer to the email below.
We are still pending approval from our principal.

Shall revert once our principal approved.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKE Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: B41-4061 | email: ashensnag@lkkauto.com | fox: 4741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe(@hotmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, May 5, 2019 5:35 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SLK2888S DOA 01.12.2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/CT118021950/Aea3

Dear Asher,
2ND REMINDER

Case submitted 1 month , no receive your offer yet ?
Please let us have your offer & reply in next 3 days . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen



From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan(@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday. April 9, 2019 2:02 PM

To: chan pick yuen; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE;: SLK2888S DOA 01.12.2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI18021950/Acal

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/CTI18021950/Aea3 Asher - 6841 6051

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@|kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 9 April, 2019 9:59 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SLK28885 DOA 01.12.2018

Dear All,

15T REMINDER

case submitted 1 month , no reply who OIC ? or all case need wait 3-4 month then your side reply ?
Please let us have your offer & reply soon . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe @hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, March 4, 2019 5:44 AM

To: admin-a@lkkauto.com

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SLK2888S5 DOA 01.12.2018



Dear Sir / Mdm,

Enclosed is our client's GIA , rental bill with agreement , LOA & invoice .
As request following :

1. RC $5000 ( AS AGREED )
2. LOSS OF RENTALS1300 ( 5130 X 10 DAYS)
@100% ( car park case )

Total $ 6300/-.

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen

U2 SPRAY PAINTING PTELTD
HP: 92712214

From: chan pick yuen

Sent: Tuesday, December 4, 2018 11:54 PM
To: assignments@|kkauto.com

Subject: S5LK28885 DOA 01.12.2018

Dear Catharine ,

claim CHINA TAIPING
Enclosed is our client's GIA report & estimate .
Mr Adrian already survey .

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen
U2 SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD

Virus-free. www avg.com




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

-
::’;_-—‘—l
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607158R GS5T Reg. No. 19-B607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref : CCE/CTNE021950/Ada3n2
3,33 |§1%TE§AT?:>EE FggiNGA PORE 079909 Holo:  2a-AaR H mmummmm
Code: CTI
13 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  GBHE827B Veh. Inspected SLK 28885
Policy No. DMCWVSN1826371800 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM1BD05612C02/7 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 04112/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW 523 c.c 2497
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. WEBAFP320X0C867437 Colour BLACK
Odometer 117516 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |255/40 R19 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |255/40 R19 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |255/40R19 DUNLOP 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |255/40R18 DUNLOP & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/5 PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 01/12/2018 Inspection Date 04/12/2018
Survey held at U2 SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD
25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#06-43 SYNERGY @ KB
SINGAFPORE 417800
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. S5LK 28885

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B258 4315

Page No.-1 of 2

. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition [, =LA {:n “J}

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1IFRONT BONNET NOT NECESSARY 2.250.00 -
1|FRONT R/H FENDER DENTED 995.00 995.00
1|FRONT R/H FENDER COWLING DEFORMED 215.00 215.00
10|FRONT R/H FENDER COWLING CLIFS @%$5.00 MECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1IFRONT R/H HEADLAMP CRACKED 2,350.00 2.350.00
1|FRONT R/H HEADLAMP PANEL MOT MECESSARY 185.00 -
1|FRONT FOG LAMP -RH CRACKED 285.00 285,00
1|FRONT FOG LAMP COVER DEFORMED 125.00 125.00
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL MOT NECESSARY 72500 -
1|FRONT SUPPORT PAMEL SIDE LOCK R/H MOT NECESSARY 155.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER WIPER NIZZER NOT NECESSARY 18B.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER WIPER MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 195.00 -
1|FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 420.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 2,350.00 1,388.00
2|FRONT BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR @$210.00 DAMAGED 420.00 210.00
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIFS @$5.00 MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 610.00 -
2|FRONT BUMPER INNER SPONGE @3%80.00 CRACKED 160.00 B0.00
2IFRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET INNER @$BB.HD o's DAMAGED 136.00 68.00
1|FRONT RIM-RH MOT NECESSARY 950.00 -
1|FRONT TYRE-RH NOT NECESSARY 800.00 -
1|FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER RH NOT NECESSARY 780.00 -
1|FRONT KNUCKLE ARM -RH NOT NECESSARY 580.00 -
1|FRONT KMUCKLE ARM BEARING NOT NECESSARY 480.00 -
1IFRONT LOWER ARM MOT NECESSARY 450.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -580.60
16,004 .00 R.225 40

LABOUR

TO REMOVE & REFIX R/H UNDERCARRIAGE. MNOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT COMPUTER. MOT NECESSARY 120.00 -

Report Ref No, CCE/CTI18021950/Ada3n2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ui Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607128R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Oty Description of Parts Cendition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Workshop ($)) ($)
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 50,00 30.00
TUFF KOTE. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TOWING CHARGES. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
TO PANEL BEATING. 1,000.00 500.00
TO SPRAY PAINTING. 1,000.00 500.00
2,770.00 1,030,00

GRAND TOTAL 18,674.00 6,255.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,000.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC6/CTI18021850/Ada3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE, AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benafit of the Client named on the front page of this Repart.
b it ey feply on the Repart who i




