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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE*®

VEHICLEND @ SHAS096P DATE: 4. Dec. 2018

MAKE : HYUNDAI

MODEL : 140 DOA:  3.Dec. 2018 CHINA

Q Unit Price Amount

i|Rear Door—LH  xX/yp™ . $2,201.10
1[Rocker Cover Garnish — LH * s i $341.10
1|Rear Bumper 7= $544.50
10|Rear Bumper Clips »— $2.20 $22.00
1|[Rear Wheel Cover—LH ~— $107.10
SUB TOTAL $3,215.80
LESS 20%| 5643.16
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $2,572.64
1|Rear Door APP sticker < 580.00 [Nett
1|[Rear Bumper Rubber Mat s $50.00 |[Nett
$130.00

Labour Charge iise Lo
1|Panel Beating . $680.00
1|Spray Painting Charge o SW F’ﬂ‘“
1|Tuff Kote " 553‘.‘06
1|Remove/refix reverse sensar ° SIMJ'
1|Transfer of Door ' $120.807 >

Kalot(1%)

__TOTALLABOUR[ | $1,790.00
gfeft joret
7 ﬂ;; ESTIMATE TOTAL $4,492.64

- /ﬂ»ff = ot

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will

be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.




COMFORIDELGRO

ENCINEERING
Our Job Reaf Mo N £5245T5E
Date _ 6.Dec.2018 O e s Srndas
Fax E54E B158
FINALIZATION FORM
To LEKK Fax
Attn KALVIN
Vehicle Reg No SHAQ9026P Date of Accident: 3. Dec. 2018

The survey and eslimates of tha repairs of the above-meantioned vehicle are as follows:-

1. The repair job shall bill to: CHINA GP700X

2 The finalized amount shall be
{a)  Spare Pans after Lis| discount

(b} Lebour Chames
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost

(c) Lumpsum Repair (if applicabla)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:

Final Lumpsum Repair cost $1,500.00
3 Estimated normal pariod for repairs 3 warking days.
4 We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed If there I8 no reply from you
within T working days
5 Thank you for your assistance We confirm the estimates and
finalized amount
2 1 S
Signature - Signature ;
Name LBy NG Nams ,Eﬁﬁ"‘
Tal 8214 8316 Date s_é" 4
Fax 6546 B156
For Official Use Only
E“DGLIWIBTI[
[tem Amount Attached Fg;ﬂ::'ﬂ Remarks
Yes or No
1. Rental Rate P/'Day YES
2  Loss of Incoma Paid
1 Survey Fees
4. LTA Search Fes
5. Medical Feas [on bahalf
of driver, If applicable)
£ Owerrun

Remarks




EQ,MFDRTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

'REPAIR ESTIMATE®
VEHICLENO  : SHAD096P DATE: 4. Dec. 2018
MAKE : HYUNDAI
MODEL : 140 pOA:  3.Dec. 2018 _EM
at Parts Description/ Labour Unit Price Amount
1|Rear Door—=LH <M~ A $2,201.10
1|Rocker Cover Garnish — LE "": """’, $341.10
1|Rear Bumper -~ $544.50 |
io[Rear Bumper Clips »— = 1.,.)' $2.20 §22.00
1|Rear Wheel Cover—LH ~— e $107.10 |-~
SUB TOTAL $3,215.80
LESS 20%| 5643.16
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $2,572.64
1|Rear Door APP sticker <« :: $80.00 |Nett-f'
1|Rear Bumper Rubber Mat - $50.00 |Nett
$130.00
[Labour Charge Lo
1|Panel Beating — Sjﬂﬂﬁﬂ
1|Spray Painting Charge \ $9p@00 oo
1Tuff Kote $59fﬁﬁ’ g P
1|Remove/refix reverse senso \ 512000 Je
1[Transfer of Door 5129M'¥‘r
Kalow (1)
TOTAL LABO UR| '. $1,790.00
/ ¢ L f‘ f ﬁz" L. = > . '_‘_,_,--"_.ll
ESTIMATE TOTAL » $4,492.64
3 Ao MA | — ,
e ’
%
“h-ﬁl; * ﬂ.
Vo~ ¢
This Is an Initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repalr quantum will
{be prepared after the vehicle Is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.




Mei Kwan {LKI{Auth

From: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiatong@sg.cntaiping.com>>

Sent: Thursday, 13 December, 2018 11:26 AM

To: Mei Kwan [LEKAuUtD)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invelving GP700X (OI : CT1 - TBA) and SHAS096P
(TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT118021920/K1ha3) on 03/12/2018 / Our Ref.
SNM1BD05641C02

Attachments: INSD GlA REPORT.PDF

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMEK

Without Prejudice

Dear Mei Kwan,
We attached copy of our GIA report.

Thank you

Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Assistant Claims Execulive
Claims Departmeant

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Lid.

3 Ansan Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 073909
Direct (65) 6389 6174

Fax (65)6224 7174 /6224 7478

www.sg.cniaiping.com

ANNNVTHSARY
du

Simgapars simeor [ 908
Disclaimer ;
This message b5 confidential; ity contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapare) Pre. Lid. Anv unauthorized

disclasure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, iy prohibited. If you are not the intended reciplent of the message,
please notify the sender immediately

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 10 December, 2018 6:06 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong @sg.cntaiping.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>; C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=
1



This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www symanteccloud.com
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COMFORIDELCRO
ENGINEERING
Our Ref cC18120052/ SHAS096P NTI(st)
Yﬂur Rﬂf : .',u|-|l.||1.{'r111l."1lr::- +-.--|_.|:lr'mm*1|-_ }"-: l..:!.:
Date ' 12-Dec-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept {18 Brauell Rand Singapore 57574
50 Loyang Drive 4th Fir Mamline +55 5153 821
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508968 I | '_ } . -.-- i
3 ANSON ROAD PR
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER Workshops
SINGAPORE 079909 Braddol
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE 0S Braddel) S
Dear Sir Layang
g LEE
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHA9096P YOUR INSURED GP 700X Srgepare SOBTH
AN'D OTHER 'DH __u.E:L——-N' i) Ellf: MI?_I_I'I
We are the authorised repair workshop for Citycab Pte Ltd, the owner of motor Vehicle No: R, ’ ' u
_s_H__ABI‘.l!jF'_whil:h was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle. I ‘;“
The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concemed have requested and authorized us to assist i BOUEES
them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters arising s | ___‘;"*-
from the damage 1o the vehicle. o 400
As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving : GP 700X 24560 5"“”‘"
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants. Singapore 750156
TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM _ :-.L.l:;::-'.ltu-m h-:“f“,n
1 Costof Repair ¢ 1,605.00 Einaapom TZETH
2 4 days Loss of Rental @ $ 115.00 perday S 46000, . .
3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) -——-'-'——‘5 —1 pup kit £
4 LTA Search Fees $ 7.49
5 GIA/ Police Report Fees $ -
g Towing ! Medical { Transporation Fees $ -
Sub Total : _$ 2,072.49
HIRER'S CLAIM
7 4 days Loss of income @ s 8000 perdays s 32000

e
Total Claims : 3 2,362.49

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a) Original repair bill and photocoples of photographs 8 pcs.
b) LTA search slip/s of ! GP 700X
¢) GIA/Police report/s of - SHAGDG6P

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer [ operator
{ % ) Photocopies of Accident Scene Pholos
{ ) Witness stalement’s [ x) DowntimeMileage record

{ ) Cetificate of Insurance
( % ) Rental Rate lettar

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that itis a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

yours faithfully

William Tan
¢DGE Claims Department
Tel 8214 BT37 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : williamtan@cdge.com.sg

This Is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

A rramiber of O

COMFORIDELGRO




e ——— e —
62563561 FAX : (B65) p25pd315

e ——

51 U AVE 1, #01.25 PAYA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 40KY33 TEL : (D65)

|

Our Ref: CC3/CT 118021920/K1hal
01 MARCH 2019

SAMHUAT CLEANING PRODUCTS By Post and By Email
73 BENDEEMER ROAD

#01-505

SINGAPORE 330023

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH GP 700X AND SHA 9096P ON 03/12/2018

We refer to the above accident where we ar€ acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Ple Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against US. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matler prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithI'uJ7,

/ |'II
II'I

{

éigfslpﬂﬁ

: aaMaa
AX: 6741 4108
Email: vi a

cc.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)

sales@samhuat.com.sg / johnson(@samhuat. con.sg
(Email)



Vic !LKKAum]

From: Vie (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 March, 2019 10:44 AM

To: sales@samhuat.com.sg

Cc: johnson@ samhuat com sg; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: vour Ref: GP 700X_ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH GP 700X AND SHA 9096P ON

03/12/2018 LKK REF CGI{THEQEIEZWthui

F W Lo

B BA B Pie Lla

-—————

= e —————— - ———

51 UHIAVE L, #0125 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGATORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC3/CTI 18021920/K1ha3
01 MARCH 2019

SAMHUAT CLEANING PRODUCTS By Post and By Email
23 BENDEEMER ROAD

#01-505

SINGAPORE 330023

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH GP 700X AND SHA 9096P ON 03/ 12/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Rased on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party,

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

!-HH ST Gove the Earthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Lise or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you beligve that you received this e-mall in efror, please do nal
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and Inform the
sandar that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereof, Thank you.






CDG.VARS.V Lettof Authorisation Page | of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

[NAF | PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING | 40 SHAS096P , GP700X ON 03-Dec-18 14:50
ALONG RACE COURSE ROAD TWDS BUKIT TIMAH.
1/ We TAN LIK HENG (Hirer) NRIC No.: S£1505091H
anajar (Refef) NRIC No::

Tax| Number SHA9096P
hergby authorise ComfortDelGra Engineering Pte Lid(CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for gamages, costs and expense, including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree Lo any settlemant or compensston amount in respect of my/our caim
against third party (except personal Imjuries and medical claims).

3. Te sign Discharge Voucher on my/four behalf,
4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) In respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
"ComfortDelGro Enginearing Pte Lid",

Date 03-Dec-2018

Nama af Hirer TAN LIK HENG

Hirer NRIC S51505091H Signature :
o
W~

Address 123 MARSILING RISE #04-94

730123
Contact No. 97389404

httn/ledeek 2srv-82/Rumtime/Runtime/ Runtime/Runtime/View/CDG VAR, 03/12/2018



- . i . i

Policy Mo = LMCYEN3I0I2TEIB00 Claim No :SNH18D05641002 (GPTDOX)
Ciaimant : CITYCAR FIE LID
Amount + 552,180.00

STNGAPORE DOLLARS TWO THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED EIGHTY ONLY

I/We agres to accept the above mant ioned amount to be pald te me/us in full &
final settlsment of all claims, costs & disbursements far injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an acclident {nveolving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SHA 909&P
Tnaured Vehicle Ho, : GF TOOX

Date of Lops 3 03/12/72018
rlace of Accidant + RACE COURSE ROAD

I CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefun of the aforementicned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [(SINGAPORE) FPTE. LID.. I/¥e agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Hame . SAMHUAT CLEANING FRODUCTS
priver Nams : LOW FoO SUN

from all claims, present ar futufs in respect of all loas, injury or damage
sustalned by me/us ariaing cut of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment 15 made wWithout admisaiopn of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE] PIE. LTD.

{1} Global Sum (all Lin) 85 2,180.00

T T

TOTAL o « o o = = & 5 & & = « = » » 33 2,180.00
i 7 !
Claimant Hame : B3 0ANG |l HRIC Mo @
SINGAPCRE fo4s

Signature : ﬂf’ r,#j - ) e et 9

T T T RCR manes Ui‘,[" Please forward your <hegoe msde payable 1.
B SRR, DR T , . COMFORTOELGRO ENGINEERING PTE ITT
% persmal s and damages ansng Meresrom aré rclide

ko e il 3 aocicaion of this document



COMFORIDELGRO ComfortDelGro Engmaermg Pte Lid

ENGINEERING S o |
A member ol CoMmromDELGRO "HiiE“];ifF:fﬁ B rtlarmnlbin’ Loy ~nd
" COHPANY REG. NO.: 193506048
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE rage
8 =13 91413135 10.12.201E
HINA LA;PIHL INSURANCE CO (S)PTE LTD
SPHINGLEAF TOWER MAKE JOB NO,
HYUNDAI 5246756
5 ANSON ROAD #16-00 W 2
INGAPORE 079909 MODEL ODOMETER READING
UDET
ONTACT NO: 62222366 L=0 -
DATE OF REG
05.02.2015
CHASSIS CODE JOB TYPE
e e = KMHLB41UMFUDE59593
w, Description : 3P 03.12.2018

Invoice for Lump Sum Repair

Total Lump Sun Repair Amt
Add GST & 7.000 %

Total Involce amount

Issued by : CHEWBEELENG 10.12.2018 15:05:15
Igpa,_r TIPL : CFPSO/5T/57
Payment Type/Term : /Credit 30 days
mfortDelGGro Engineering Pte Lid
smber of COMPORIDELGID ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT
id Office:
Braddell Road

gopare STHT0]

Hly nate that no receipt shall be issued unless requestad.
STOMER'S COPY

1.605.00

BANK/CHQ No.




Our Ref: CC18120052 's = ('n‘q(nb

Date: 10 December 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 03/12/2018 @ 14:50 hrs

ALONG RACE COURSE ROAD TWDS BUKIT TIMAH.
INVOLVING GP700X

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that CityCab Pte Ltd is
the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration number SHAS096P (the
“Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to TAN LIK HENG IC NO $1505091H a registered hirer-
operator of CityCab Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of the aforementioned accident
at a rental rate $115.00 per day (inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accidenl.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his cholce.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settiement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident,

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assislant Manager, Fleet Salely

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

353 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainiine +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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surance Particulars Enguiry By Agents Detail hitps:/fvrd Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/insPartDetail By AATFUNCTIO.
Enquire Vehicle Insurer

‘Vehicle No. Incident Date/Time  Search Status Insurance Company Code  Insurance Company Name
GPT00X 03 Dec 2018/ 14:50:00  Successful co CHIMNA TAIPING INSURAMNCE |SINGAPORE] FTELTD

Previous OK



_l’ 1 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

H; =; .- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 188807T188R GST Reg Mo 18-8807188-R

Affilinted 1o Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref CC3MCTI8021820/K 1ha3q2
o RINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 078909 Nel:  (1eGeane I|||I|I|I||II|II
Code. CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  GP 700X Veh. Inspected SHA 9006P
Policy No. DMCVSN3032751800 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D05641C02 Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date D412/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMFUO85983 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 661408 Steearing IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[20560R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R18 WEST LAKE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [205/B0R18 WEST LAKE T mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 WEST LAKE 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 0311272018 Inspection Date 0411272018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
50 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

S5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusinal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 8258 3581 FAX G258 4315

Feg. No: 186860T188R GST Repg. No. 18-8607168-R Page No..1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHA 9096P
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR DOOR -LH TO REPAIR SEE 220110
LABOUR
1|ROCKER COVER GARMISH -LH TO REPAIR SEE 34110 g
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 544 50 544 50
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @%2.20 NECESSARY 22.00 22.00
1|REAR WHEEL COVER -LH GRAZED 107.10 107.10
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -843.16 -134.72
257264 538.88
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR DOOR APP STICKER (SN) NECESSARY £0.00 80.00
1|REAR BUMPER RUBBER MAT (SN) NECESSARY £0.00 50.00
130.00 130,00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 600.00 400,00
DOOR -LH AND ROCKER COVER GARNISH -LH
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 900.00 B00.00
TUFF KQOTE. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSCR . 120.00 30.00
TRANSFER OF DOOR NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
1,780.00 1.230.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,492.64 1.898.88
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5 11,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) .11 SN

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18021820/K1ha3q2

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN

Automolive Assessor / Investigator

e

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

DIECLAMER OF LULBELITY TO THIHD FPARTIER - This Asper s mass saisly lor the use svl mreflt sl the Clisr mamed oo The frani page of (his Rapart




