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. - Consultanis
el BE B Pie Lid Company Registration No. 199607T138R

!’ ";I' Auto

S UBREAVE |, B02-25 PAYA UBELINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORF 408933 TEL : (065] 62563561 FAX : (065 B1564315

Your ref: D180O0RS6 1 MESH

Our ref: CS/FCI18021900/T1vb Date: 10/12/2018

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO S]X 6628E
We thank you for your instruction on S/12/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
6/12/2018 at the premises of M/s Vv WAGEN CENTRE SING RE

and have the Tollowing to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 888,721.79
Revised Estimate Amount : 554.814.57
"Check” Items Amount : 85102722
Total {85
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value : S%

nearside
Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear e front
rear portion |

offside

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
MLMATAIL AMSAE-A
Automobile Assessor



Vis @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coseg ke 1950001060 G57 Reg Mo H2-D001676-9
B Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4ESE0
Tel (65) G222 2311 Faw (B5) 6222 3547

Clains & Hoter Underwriting Depts 35 Robinson Roed #LE-01 City House Singapove 058877
Tel: (R5) 6507 3848 Fax (55) 6507 3840

wwrwr.msfirstcapital.comsg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

04-12-2018 Our Ref Mo, D18008561MFSH

01-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC7715P Third Party Vehicle. SJXE628E

247 ALEXANDRA ROAD
CHARMAINE KONG

63057176/ 63057299 Fax No. 64743643

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cec : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE

SINGAPORE Attention. NIL
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letier, no signature required.

A Memaer of INSURANCE GROUF




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

f o
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 2:09 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: '‘Cithara'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008561MFSH/1, 5JX 6628E
Attachments: SKX 6628E PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle STX 6628E
Date of survey: 6/12/2018
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December 2018 2:16 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008561M FSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer arrange survey on 06.12.2018.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Mator Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December, 2018 2:02 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTSELKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008561MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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VIG5 Singapore, 247, 158934 Singapara

TAMN SHENG YANG
411A FERNVALE ROAD
#18-84

Singapore, 791411

: rvic uot
Singapore L"|7'L 18 110 an Se e Q e
Customer Mo CV040470
Quote No SER/QUO 1802050
QuoteDate 0311218
Salesperson Lawrence Tan Say Ch
Page 1
THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
Make Model Description Mileage Service Advisor
Volkswagen Passeng Passat 1.8 TS| Comfortiine 0 Kong Charmaine
License No. VIN Initial Registration Sales Advisor
SJX6628E WVWZZZICZIE193063 28/06/18 Lawrence Tan Say Chuan
Engine Code Labor Type Engine No. Model Code
1P CJS 279235 3G24J7
No. Description Qty. UoM Unit Price Amount
KtO
P B&P ALEX LABOUR LABOUR 3 Labor V' Qo0 2,520.00
P B&P ALEX PAINT SPRAY PAINT 3 Labor 2.400.00
P B&P NUMBER PLATE B&P NUMBER PLATE -NETT 1 pos v ~~ 80.00
P B&P DIAG PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION 1 Time Un < 77 480.00
COMPULSORY TO DO AFTER AC
P B&P MEGH CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECU, S 1 Time Un <" 28000
Mett
Sum Labor 5,760.00
. avy 7 o
P 3G0807305T BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 1 Pieces . 54099
Predeceaser3GHBGTIOEN m -
P 3G0B07521B GRU SPOILER ( PAINT ) 1 Pieces » 179.28
P 3360853835 277 CHROME MOLDING CENTER 1 Pieces ~726 98
P 3G0853841 222 CHROME MOLDING LH 1 Pieces A TI17479 %
Use-Predeessser3508807367-0989
P 3G0B53842 277 CHROME MOLDING RH 1 Pisces "‘"{ﬂ?d 78.¥
P 3G0998491 SENSOR BRACKET 1 Pieces M_;' §5.39 °
P 3G5807375 BUMPER BRACKET LH 1 Pieces nn = 07 =
P 3G5807376 BUMPER BRACKET RH 1 Pieces A AT
P 3G5807417 GRU REAR BUMPER COVER 1 Pieces oll 74 260,75
P 3G5807483A BUMPER GUIDE LH 1 Pieces An 7 2589 <
P 3G5807484A BUMPER GUIDE RH 1 Pieces a7 25937
P 3G5807863 STRIP 1 Pieces nb " G255 v
P D 1BOKU2A1 2KADHESIVE 1 Pieces w8984 7
P D 822150A1 BONDAGENT 1 Pieces bt 75427
Sum carried forward B,721.79
Payments to: - BBN: - Acc -No.
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L
! \F\VG Singapore

247
Alexandra Road
159934 Singapore

Phone No.  +65 6305 7299
Fax No. +B65 6474 3643
E-Mail senvice@vw com.sg

VAT Registration Mo M20098505-2
Tax Mo, 1991014047



Vi3S Singapore, 247, 158934 Singapore

TAN SHENG YANG

411A FERNVALE ROAD

#18-84
Singapore, 791411
Singapare

Make

Volkswagen Passeng
License No.
SJXB62BE

Engine Code

Explanations

Model Description
Passal 1.8 TSI Comfertline
VIN
WVWZZZICZIET193963
Labor Type

1P

Sum Item

P = Proportionately Charged

Payment Terms

Payments to:

Mo Credit

- BEN: - Acc.-Mo..:

Mileage
0

VGS Singapore

247

Alexandra Road

150934 Singapore

Phone MNao. +65 6305 7299

Fax No, +65 6474 3643
E-Mail service@vw.com.sg

VAT Registration No. M20098505-2
1991014942

Tax Mo

Service Quote

Customer No. CV040470

Quote Mo, SER/QUOMB02050
CuoteDate 03/12/18

Salesperson Lawrence Tan Say Ch
Page 2

THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE

Service Advisor
Kong Charmaine

Initial Registration Sales Advisor

2B/06/18 Lawrence Tan Say Chuan

Engine No. Model Code

CJS 279235 3G244Z
Continued 8,721.79

2,961.79

Sum Labor 5,760.00
Sum Item 2,961.79
Total SGD 8,721.79
T9% GST 8721.79 610.53
Total SGO Incl. GST g9,332.32

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey belore/after spray painting

» To display damaged part(s) dunng resurvey

« Paris prices ana subsect lo confrmation

« Third party survey is on 8 “Without Prejudca” basis

* No ifegal modiication(s) is allowsd

» Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
is subject 1o fmal approval from Insurance Company

Achnowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:




SERVICE ORDER NO:

CUSTOMER MO,
CUSTOMER NAME:

TELEPHONE NO.:

Service Order Confirmation

18IP31TE
CVO404TO

TaN SHENG YANG

ADDRESS: 4114 FEANYALE ROAD #18-84
Singapore
VEH No.: SJX6628E
Order Date: 0812118
Reg Cate: A0 B LA H a
Wi MO, WYWEEEICTIE 195963 ENGINE NO:
MODEL: Passal 1.8 TSI Comigriling MODEL NO.: 362402

[
Labar

DESCHIFTION

[T

BEP DIAG

BA&P MECH

BAF HUMBER FLATE
B&P ALEX LABGUR
BEP ALEX PAINT
EXTO03T
EXTO0037

Tam

AGSAOTAT GRU
IGSB0TEET
IG0GIRLT

D E222150A1

D 1BOKLIEAY
GOSN 227

IQ0ASIBLE 277

PADGRAMMING & CALIBRATION- NETT

CHECK WIRE HARMESS, ECU. SENSOR.SOCKET
BAF NUMBER PLATE -METT

LABOURA

SPRAY PAINT

Tow VG- Quality Recowery Sandoas

Tow SVG- Quaity Recovery Sarioas

RE&R BUMFER COVER
STRIP

SENSOR BRACKET
BONDAGENT

ZHADHESIVE

GHADME MOLDING CENTER

CHADME MOLDING RH

Fiemaris : FIRST CAPTAL DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Dow 1 12.2018

SLIAVEYOR LKK

TP VEHCLE BHCTT1EF

g

1 UNIT

1 UNIT

an

840

126075
B3 5%
5538
6427
a4
226.96

174.78

SA: Hong Chasmaing

1,280.76
&2 55
56.38
B4 2T
B3 .64
e 98

17479



Service Order Confirmation

SERVICE ORDER NO:  18IF3TE

CUSTOMER NO.: CVDA04TD

CUSTOMER MAME:  TAN SHENG YANG
TELEPFHONE NO.:

ADDRESS: 4114 FERNVALE ROAD #18-84

Singapone

VEH No.: SJX6628E

Dweiser Date: oaMang

Reg Date: 280616 KM ]

VIR NOL: WYWIZZIGZIE193963 ENGINE NO: BA: Kong Chamaina

MODEL: Passal 1.8 TSI Camforiling MODEL NO.: G242

Ha, DESCRIPTION oTyY won UNIT PRICE =~ DISG%% AMOUNT
TOTAL 481487
GET AMOUNT 33702
TOTAL AMOUNT 5,161.58
On Behall 01 *COMPANY® Certified GoodsService recelved:
Authorized Signature Customer

MOTE: THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL RECEIPT



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

# —— SR = — = =]

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 December 2018 2:07 PM

To: 'Cheang, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore)'; Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; Admin A; Admin-D
(LEKAUtD)}

Cc Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG
Singapore)

Subject: RE: SJX6628E - FINALISE

Dear Pearlyn,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirmed COR $4814.57 before GS1
Total 3 working days repairs

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore) <Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 5:52 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; Admin-
D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=>

Ce: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) <charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg>; Wang, Meiy (VWG Singapore)
<meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Foo, John (VWG Singapore) <John.Foo@vw.com.sg>

Subject: SIX6628E - FINALISE

Dear Taufikh,
Please confirmed
COR 54814.57 before GST

Total 3 working days repairs

Best regards,

Pearlyn Cheong

Service Advisor

Aftersales Body & Paint Department

Vp!kswagr—:-n Group Singapore (Alexandra)



247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934

Direct line +65 6305 7288

Mobile +£85 0236 1336
Main line; +65 6305 7299
Main Fax: +65 6474 3643

pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg
http:/fwww. vw. com.sd

The new Polo.
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, Mo: 108607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607158-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref - CS/FCI18021800/T1vbn2
#1601 OITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date 24122018 WWM“H"‘“M
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 7715P Veh. Inspected SJX 6628E
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. D18008561MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 0522018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN PASSAT c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WAVWZZZ3ICZIE183967 Colour BLACK
Odometer 10408 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
= Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[215/55R17 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/55 R17 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/55R17 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/55 R17 PIRELLI & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
7 General Information
Accident Date 01122018 Inspection Date 06/12/2018
Survey held at  VOLKSWAGEN GROUP SINGAPORE PTE LTD
247 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159334
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES COMNSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




T Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;‘_,i_;_i_; 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6250 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-06071896-R Page No..1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJX 6628E
f Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Oty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {g:']' [iJ}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 540.99 -
1|SPOILER (PAINT)(SN) NOT NECESSARY 179,28 -
1|CHROME MOLDING CENTER (SN) CuUT 226.98 22658
1|CHROME MOLDING LH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 174.79 :
1|CHROME MOLDING RH (SN} cuT 17479 17479
1|SENSOR BRACKET (SN} NECESSARY 55.39 55.39
1|BUMPER BRACKET LH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 4017 -
1|BUMPER BRACKET RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.17 :
1|REAR BUMPER COVER (SN) DEFORMED 1,260.75 1,260.75
1|BUMPER GUIDE LH (SN} WNOT MNECESSARY 2589 k
1|BUMPER GUIDE RH {SN) MNOT NECESSARY 2583 -
1|STRIP {SN) NECESSARY 62.55 62.55
1|2KADHESIVR (SN) NECESSARY 89.84 89,84
1|BONDAGENT (SN) NECESSARY 64.27 6427
1|B&P NUMBER PLATE (SN} cuT 80.00 80.00
3,041.79 2,014 57
LABOUR
LABOUR 2,520.00 840.00
SPRAY PAINT. 2,400.00 1,200.00
FROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION COMPULSORY TO DO 480.00 480.00
AFTER AC.
CHECK WIRE HARMNESS ECU,S. 280.00 280.00
5,680.00 2.800.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,721.79 481457
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | I 4,814.57|

m :

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benelil of the Client named an tha T
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