Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December 2018 9:36 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: '‘MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF7319A & XD6513S DOA
:28/11/2018

Dear Mr Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December, 2018 9:02 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; steven.chee@vw.com.sg

Subject: FW: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF7319A & XD6513S DOA : 28/11/2018

Our Ref : 18/18/18/VC05/021167
Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to survey and revert on liability.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore) [mailto:steven.chee@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December, 2018 6:57 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG; lionelchua@lonpac.com

Cc: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore); Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)
Subject: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF7319A & XD6513S DOA : 28/11/2018

Dear claims,

Please revert on liability & arrange survey for this claims.



Best Regards,

Steven Chee
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

Main Line : +65 6305-7299
Main Fax: +65 6285-8620
steven.chee@vw.com.sg
http://www.vw.com.sg

Back with a
bold new look.

The new Polo.

From: steven.chee@vw.com.sg [mailto:steven.chee@vw.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 4 December, 2018 6:54 PM

To: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore)

Subject: Scan von MyMFP

Scan from MyMFP



