Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 18 January, 2019 10:22 AM
To: 'PBSP

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SKA5626B

Hi Caroline,

COR $3853.70(before gst) , 3 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 5:59 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com
Subject: FINAL REPORT / SKA5626B

Dear Sirs
We refer to the above and attached Final Report.
Please confirm COR as follows:

Total Labour : 2,014.00
Total Parts : 1,839.70
Total Labour & Parts : 3,853.70

Repair days: 3

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601
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