Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Johnson Chua <johnson.chua@timotor.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 December 2018 10:03 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR; '‘Caymen'

Cc: Patricia Tan - Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd; 'Wei Shong'

Subject: Own Damage Claim Arrange survey - TLM Ref: OD001122018; AXA Ref: TBA;

Accident Involving SKT8087L on 01.12.2018

Importance: High

Dear Veron,

Noted with thanks.

Dear Caymen (TLM),
Please do the necessary.

Regards,

Tan Lim Motor Pte Lic

O. +656858 5151 51 Defu Lane 10
Johnson Chua F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539216
johnson.chua@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim |
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 6 December 2018 10:00 AM

To: Wei Shong <wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: johnson.chua@timotor.com.sg

Subject: RE: Own Damage Claim Arrange survey - Accident Involving SKT8087L on 01.12.2018

Dear Wei Shong,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKT 8087L on Lump Sum
basis (Excess $400/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wei Shong <wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December 2018 5:09 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: johnson.chua@tlmotor.com.sg

Subject: RE: Own Damage Claim Arrange survey - Accident Involving SKT8087L on 01.12.2018

Dear Executive,
Enclosed the Lump sum authorization Letter for your perusal.

As such, please authorize repair as soon as possible.

Thank you.

Regards,

Tan Lim Motor Pte Lic

TANLM

La_m_ Wei Shong O. +656858 5151 51 Defu Lane 10
William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539216
wei.shong@timotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sqg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim I
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: Wei Shong [mailto:wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, December 5, 2018 2:54 PM

To: 'sur@lkkauto.com' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Own Damage Claim Arrange survey - Accident Involving SKT8087L on 01.12.2018

Dear Executive,

Enclosed the GIA report as requested.

Thank you.

Regards,

Tan Lim Motor Pte Lic

La_m_ Wei Shong O. +656858 5151 51 Defu Lane 10
William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539216
wei.shong@timotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg




Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim I
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: Wei Shong [mailto:wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, December 4, 2018 10:03 AM

To: 'AXA- Survey' <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>

Cc: 'cst@axa.com.sg' <cst@axa.com.sg>; 'caymen@tlmotor.com.sg' <caymen@tlmotor.com.sg>;
'johnson.chua@tlmotor.com.sg' <johnson.chua@tlmotor.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Own Damage Claim Arrange survey - Accident Involving SKT8087L on 01.12.2018

Without Prejudice

Our ref: - SKT8087L
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please arrange for survey as soon as possible, vehicle in our premises.

Thank you.

Regards,

Tan Lim Motor Pte Lic

TANLM

La_m_ Wei Shong O. +656858 5151 51 Defu Lane 10
William F. +65 68580877 Singapore 539216
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.tlmotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim I
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: Wei Shong [mailto:wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, December 3, 2018 4:08 PM

To: 'AXA- Survey' <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>

Cc: 'cst@axa.com.sg' <cst@axa.com.sg>; 'caymen@timotor.com.sg' <caymen@tlmotor.com.sg>
Subject: Own Damage Claim Arrange survey - Accident Involving SKT8087L on 01.12.2018

Without Prejudice

Our ref: - SKT8087L

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We enclose the following documents for your attention:-

a. Copy of our client’s SAS report;
b. Estimate cost of repair

Please arrange for survey as soon as possible, vehicle in our premises.



Thank you.

Regards,

Tfll'll.im . Tan Lim Motor Pte Lt
a5 B Lam Wei Shong O. +65 6858 5151 51 Defu Lane 10

William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539216
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim I
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended

recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.



