Khanchna (LKK Autnz

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 B:57 AM

To: Khanchna (LKE Auto); MT_Claim_5G

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE - TP vehicle SLF1850H Your Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/021166 [MVA

BETWEEN SLF 1850H & SJH 43428 (Ol) ON 29/11/2018] [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Khanchna

Pls proceed.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all {8 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 5 August, 2019 2:15 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE - TP vehicle SLF1850H Your Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/021166 [MVA BETWEEN SLF 1B50H & SIH
43428 (0O1) ON 29/11/2018]

Lonpac Ref: 18/18/18/VPO5/021 144

LEK Ret: CC4/LPCI18021843/T1ka3g2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted fo your good office on 4/12/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal. Lanpoac Insurance Bhd.

This Is 4 vehicle chain collision, our Insured vehicle is the third vehicle, We are of the opinion that BOLA 28 is
applicable.

Summary to offer to third party repairer "CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount

1



1. Costof Repair [w/G5T) $7.624.6% % 5,029.00
2. Loss of Rental (3 days x §$ 577.80 $ 577.80 (3 days x $180) (w/GST)
$180) (w/GST)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 200 $ 200
Total | $8,204.49 S 5.608.80

**05days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above Is for your approval.

Thank you,

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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dvetident Ckem Repary, Cormnion Welding. Bosly Denl Repasr
oren-Pambing. Ulechasica! Nopair And Cermmereing of Lo
BLOCK 1010, BUKIT MERAAH LANE 3. #01-105. SINGAPORE 159724
BLOCH 1008, BIUMIT MERAH LAME 3, #)-82, SINGAPORE 168723
TEL: 6271 7054, 6273 3304 FAX: 62736676 EMAIL: chams @ mingneloom.sg
Bus Feg. No. 28151300M GST Aeg. No. MBO3ETBESL

22 MAY 2019 6" Mukor cloaw s b@r‘r
LONPAC Insurance Bhd
The Motor Claim Dept [Jl ¢0N 4 Lle o, By Fax & Post

100 Beach Road
#19-00, Shaw Tower L,\
Singapore 189702 AN A Yoy

fev . Tl Without Prejudice
Dear Sir i . “ I 1 |lcI Save as 10 Cost

ACCIDENT INVOLVING: SLF 1850 H & SJH 4342 B on 29 NOVEMBER 2018 at/along
AYE TWDS TUAS.

By Fax; 6296 2706

The above refer.

We are helping the owner ol vehicle no: SLF 1850 H to claim against vour insured SJH 4342 B
that the above accident was caused solely by the negligence of the driver of motor vehicle no:
SJH 4342 B which was insured by vou at the material time. As a result of the said accident. we
are claiming as follows:

1) Cost of repair $ 5029.00
2) Rental Bill § 577.80
3) GIA Fees § 2.00

$5608.80

We forward copies of GIA reports, repair bill. certificate of insurance. driver’s license and search
fee's receipts for your attention. Vehicle was surveyed by your appointed surveyor.

We appreciate if you could Kindly look into this matter and revert us soonest possible.
Thank You

|
Warmaest Rc[gards.

VAN

[\
Sharon [Tl-.:t:
Encls: ¥




Lonpac Insurance Bhi
300 Beach Road

07 The Concourse #17-04
Singapore 199555

Attn: The Maotor Claims Dept Without Prejudices
LETTER OF AUTHORITY
I. NG KONG WAH. owner of SLF 1850 H hereby authorize CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT to

act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use for my vehicle no:
SLF 1850 H that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 29 NOVEMBER 2018 along
AYE TOWARDS TUAS involving vehicle no/s: SJH 4342 B.

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem
fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.
| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis in so far as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned,

Dated this E’ (day) of ¥ {month) k% (year)

—

i / ] |'r. o
f [
/ # F
/ [t _-';r lf
-

Signature
Name: Ng Kong Wah
NRIC: S2706894D



Y
= LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO I8/ 18/ 18/VPOS/O21 166
DATE s 14 AUGUST 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We. CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of STH4342B the sum of Singapore Dollar Five
Thousand Six Hundred Eight and Eighty Cemis Only ($5.608.80) in full and final
satisfaction. liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving SJH4342B  and
SLF1850H on 29 November 2018 along AYE rowards Tuas.

| /We hereby agree 1o indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ MUHAMMAD SUPIAN BIN MD YUSUP) against all claims and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to CHARN'S
CUSTOMCRAFT.

I'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

Foe o
'f. .' r - P | % I_’,,'l'
T L;f.r.t war b3l g 10 )

Name of vehicle owner /Date
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Aot Claim Bepale, Corromion Weldong, Sty Denr Bepapirs
Sprory-Fuintimg. Mechanicn! Nepeir Ansd Cunmmicing of Cara

BLOCK 1010, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-105, SINGAPORE 158724 T A x
BLOCHK 1008, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #1-82. SINGAPORE 158723
TEL: 6271 7054, B27T3 3304 FAX: B273 BETE EMAIL charns @ singrel com ag l Nv O l c E,

Bus. Reg. Mo 25151300 GST Aeg No. MO0 THEIL

Wt/ LONPACINSLRANCELTD i, ; No. ........2019056259.........
ATTN: THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPI TERM: .
YOUR ORDER NO. oo, _
OUR YO NG, oo
V— 5 DATE: . .BISI2DLY..oooeeeeererrins
. — AMOUNT
QUANTITY ‘ DESCRIPTION $ TS,
0 Vehicle No. Make/Model DOA Reg No
SLF1830H LEXUS 15250 AUTO STD FI 290112019 1040 501554
Being Lump Sum repair for the above Vehicle 4,700.00

CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT
| g $4,700.00

\ .
N s 329.00

) Total $5.029.00



RENIoR-ENG TAX INVOICE

GST REG. NO.- 2001062760
OICETO DATE INVOICE NO
NG KONG WaAH 11-Jan-201%9 A 33739
BLX 333
WOODLANDS AVENUE |
B04-753
SINGAFDEE 7310351
VHA NO DUE DATE VEH. NO
A 38739 11-Jan-2019 SKK 6072 P
DESCRIPTION NO OF DAYS RATE AMOUNT
RENTAL FROM 26 DECEMBER 2018 TO 20 DECEMBER 2018 3 120,00 540,00
YOQUR REF. SLF 1850 H
GST@ 7% $37.80
TOTAL $577 80

Alf chegues must be made payable ro BKW Rent A Car Pre Ltd
Pleace write the vehicle and tnvoice number on the reserve

BKW Rent-A-Car Pte Ltd
120 Lower Delta Road #02-15 Cendex Centre (S) 169208 Tal' 6738 7777 Fax: 6738 6666

AGRA No: 2001062760 GST Rag. No: 20-0106276-D  Waebsite: www.bikw.5g ==
& pubaidiary of BKW Automobile Pte Lid Tens

hirSHFE




BKW RENT A CAR PTE LTD
120 Lower Dalta Road ﬂﬁliﬂgﬁjﬂﬁﬂtg 3u15gigora 1592&% Tal 5738 7777 Fax 6734 6555
o & 1 o5 Mo 20-01087TH-0
RFNT-A-CAR 24 HOURS HELPLINE - 6223 1122
VEHICLE HIRING AGREEMENT

UHJ‘-PBJ'A 3873 9
Chgsa I;'I'.-I.'rM
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.
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D1122018

RECORDS MAMNAGEMENT CENTRE
Dur Ref No GR-18-188384
Date of Raguest 01122018

Charm's Customaoraft

Block 1010 Bukit Marah Lans 3
#01-105

Singapare 158724

GENERAL
INSURANCE

lrmamen

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
8 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Manday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No. M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Raf Na Onlina Purchass

Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 011272018
Enquiry By Sharon Lee Chia Ling
TP Vehicle No S5JH43428
Accidant Date 212018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT [S8)
TP Inaurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.
This is & compuler genemted document and requires no signature.
For GIARMC Oificial usa
Crate
[X] GIRO [ | Cash | | Chegue
hitps: ifsingapore menmen comiclamaindes omMuseboreMTRsasb iuseactionsdsp_genimapSrefid=1061910ACF ID=4dBAENE3ACFTOKEN N2z . 22



Dina2018 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay £18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phona +85 6224 0010 Fax +85 5224 0030
ASSOCLIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Som
GST Registration No: M4D0017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry
Qur Ref Na GR-18-185384
Data of Ragusst: 01122018 Your Ref No Online Purchase

Cham's Customcraft

Block 1010 Bukit Marah Lane 3
#01-105

Singapore 159724

Dear SirMadam,

Enrguiry Date 01122018

Enguiry By Sharon Lae Chia Ling

TP Vehicle Na S5JH43428

Accident Dat= 29/112918

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicie No. Insurar Period of Insurance Insurer Tal Mo,
SJH43428 Lonpac Insuranca 8hd 30/D5/2013-28/M52019 +55 62507388
Thank You

The images provided fo you ans taken from the anginal repons forwarded (o the centre by the mambers of e General Insurance Assocation of
Singapore and we taks no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoswer for any loss or damage arising out of
or m connection with the repors or their images

This is a computer generated documant and requires no signature

hitps. ifsengaparg: manman comidaimsinde. chn Thusebon=MTRsas&fussactior=dsp_geninviplrafid=10815104CFID=440883614CF TOREN=2ca ]



