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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 June, 2019 11:48 AM

To: Enquiry

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle SLA1101M claiming T/party vehicle SGN2880G 

DOA 10.11.2018 | 3343510883SG-003

Attachments: DV.pdf

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Ms Wong, 

 

Please find attached DV for your further action. 

 

Kindly forward back to us the chopped and signed copy together with the copy of the Authorization Letter duly 

signed by the owner for payment processing. 

 

Thank you. 
 

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

From: Enquiry [mailto:enquiry@sh-motor.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 10:39 AM 

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <JoyIrene@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle SLA1101M claiming T/party vehicle SGN2880G DOA 10.11.2018 | 

3343510883SG-003 

 

Dear Joy, 

 

We confirm accepted the offer amount of S$3,290.00 (all-in) for the said claim. 

 

Kindly forward DV for our settlement.  
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Thanks & Best Regards, 

 

Ms Wong 

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD 

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02  

Sin Ming AutoCity 

Singapore 575722 

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931 
 

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 4:34 PM 

To: 'Enquiry' 
Cc: Admin A 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle SLA1101M claiming T/party vehicle SGN2880G DOA 10.11.2018 | 
3343510883SG-003 

Importance: High 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Ms. Wong, 

 

Kindly confirm acceptance of our offer sent on 09/05/19. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged 

information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender 

immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email 

is strictly forbidden. 

 

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 16 May 2019 5:24 PM 

To: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle SLA1101M claiming T/party vehicle SGN2880G DOA 10.11.2018 | 

3343510883SG-003 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Ms. Wong, 

 

Kindly confirm acceptance of our offer sent on 09/05/19. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Best Regards, 
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Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged 

information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender 

immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email 

is strictly forbidden. 

 

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 5:38 PM 

To: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle SLA1101M claiming T/party vehicle SGN2880G DOA 10.11.2018 | 

3343510883SG-003 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Ms. Wong, 

 

On without prejudice basis and without admission of liability, we offer settlement at global sum $3,290.00 

(all-in). 

 

Kindly confirm acceptance. 

 

Thank you. 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged 

information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender 

immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email 

is strictly forbidden. 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May 2019 10:40 AM 

To: Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) 

<JoyIrene@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Accident Involving our vehicle SLA1101M claiming T/party vehicle SGN2880G DOA 10.11.2018 | 

3343510883SG-003 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Thank you for your email. 
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Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

 

Please note that: - 

 

LKK ref Officer in charge   

CC4/AIG18021829/Kjb3 Joy  
   

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned 

 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 9:53 AM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com> 

Subject: FW: Accident Involving our vehicle SLA1101M claiming T/party vehicle SGN2880G DOA 10.11.2018 | 

3343510883SG-003 

 

Dear Ms Wong, 

 

Noticed that the case is currently under the care of LKK. Please liaise with them on settlement. 

 

Dear LKK, 

 

Received LOD. Fyna please. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 
 
Bernard Ler 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1946  

 
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 

 

 

 

From: Enquiry [mailto:enquiry@sh-motor.com]  

Sent: 09 April 2019 13:23 

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Accident Involving our vehicle SLA1101M claiming T/party vehicle SGN2880G DOA 10.11.2018 | 

3343510883SG-003 

 

Caution: External Email 
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Dear Bernard, 

 

Pls see attached documents and looking forward to your favourable offer soon.  

 

Thanks & Best Regards, 

 

Ms Wong 

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD 

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02  

Sin Ming AutoCity 

Singapore 575722 

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931 
 

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ [mailto:Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com]  

Sent: Friday, 23 November 2018 5:07 PM 
To: Enquiry 

Subject: Arrange survey for our vehicle SLA1101M claiming T/party vehicle SGN2880G DOA 10.11.2018 | 
3343510883SG-003 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Sirs / Madams, 

 

We refer to the subject matter. 

 

Liability is clear for this accident, quantum to be agreed. 

 

Should you have any further enquiry, please do not hesitate to contact the undersigned. 

 

PLEASE NOTE THAT CONTENTS OF THIS EMAIL SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS ANY ADMISSION OF LIABILITY ON 

THE PART OF WHOMSOEVER IS CONCERNED. WE HEREBY MAINTAIN FULL RESERVATION OF RIGHTS AND ALL 

DEFENCES AVAILABLE TO US. 

 

Thanks & Best Regards, 

 
Bernard Ler 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416 

 
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE:  

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, 

you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 

immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or 

printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other 

defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of 

the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International 

Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any 

way from its use. 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
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not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 

"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 

any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 

which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 

responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 

severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


