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12/4/2018 Claim Portal

L] N LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Meni

« Service Request Details

Claim
S8MO155T

Reference

None ¢ G DL

Loss Date
December 1, 2018 ?ﬁh \]l}ﬂ W

Request Date \
December 4, 2018 ?\Uﬂ

Due Date
December 11, 2018

Vendor Mame
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SLE5993H

Make
TPVD HONDA

https:/ivp.smartclaims.axa, com.sg/claim-portal/htmlfindex-vendor-service-requests. himi# service-reguests/?serviceRequestNumber=85800 12



12/4/2018 Claim Portal

Model
VEZEL

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured
LIM ENG MOY

903 TAMPINES AVENUE 4, #06-302, 520903, Singapore
206563388

Claim Handler

WANG Peter

peterwang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Messages Invaices Histary Documents Assessment Metrics Motes

https:/ivp.smartclaims.axa.com.sgiclaim-porta Ihtmifindex-vendor-service-requests himl#/service-requests/?serviceRequestNumber=85600



2/8/2019

«

https:'vismartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-porta Vhtmlfindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/service-requestsiview-message/?serviceRequestNumbe. ..

Claim Portal

LEK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD (TP} = e

<MANDATE |A> -S8M0155T JACCIDEN TINVOLVING

SLD 4042P(0l) / SLE 5993H(TP) / OTHERS ON
01/12/201

Type
© Question

Message

Liability: 100%. 3 vehicles chain collision whereby our Insured driver was the last car. Inform Ol about third
party claim. Agreed to settle at best and aware NCD issue. We seek your mandate at $19,577.49(if claim
LOU) -$20,497.42(if claim LOR). Mandate |A had been uploaded in Smartclaims. Kindly let us have your
approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - 08 Feb 2019

11



Auto
Cansultants

Pte Lrd

- -
T

74 %4

L

Company Registration Mo, 199607 138R

31 UBLAVE L #02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (065) 62563501 FAX : (063) 61564315

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

Survey Details:

Date: 08/02/2019

Date of loss 1-Dec-18
Date of appointment 4-Dec-18
Date of survey 4-Dec-18
Location of survey VERMOGEN ACE PTE LTD

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type:

Third party

Vehicle number

SLE 5893H

Make and Model

HONDA VEZEL 1.5 CVT

Date of registration 27/7/2016
Excess

Market Value 571,000
Parf Rebate 544,113
Nett Loss $26,887

Repair details:
Initial Estimate B 63,139.04 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 15,855.92
Check items (estimate) MIL
Labour S 5,550.00
Supplementary 5 100.00
Total g 21,505.92
Lump Sumlif applicable) S 17,000.00

INumber of days for repair




A
! !{ !{ C:nc;.uh*ms
M B Pte Lid

31 URIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL

Remarks:

Company Registration No. 199807 158R

P (63) 62563561 FAN 1 1065) 62564315

Recommnded 19 repair days + 3Sunday + 1PH = 23days

Mandate:

Liability(TP) 100%

Proposed repair cost (w/GST) 5 18,190.00 | § 18,190.00
Loss of use (23days x 560.00) 5 1,380.00 MIL
Loss of rental (23days x $100.00) NIL| S 2,300.00
Loss of income NIL NIL
LTA search fees 5 749 | S 7.49
Others MNIL MNIL
Proposed Total ] 19,577.49 | % 20,497.49




412712019 Claim Portal

<« Pls proceed DS with quantum as proposed

Type
@ Question

Message
LOR is subject to rental receipt.

https:/ivp.smartclaims axa.com.sg/claim-portalhtmlindex-vendor-service-requests htmi#/'service-requestsiview-message/7serviceRegquestNumbe... 111



Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com:

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 11:54 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Minoko Chan; Tejano Exequiel Dawal; Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon; desmond; Vmg
admin; Vermogen Ace; Rasul (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Re: SLES993H FINALISE //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18021806/R1pb3

Attachments: doc12846220190429114627 pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Above attach with LOD, could we settle as below:

Vo 0

COR -§ 17,655.00 \al"] , ,\,.\)-:a.e
Lou -$  2,400.00 ( $100 x 24 days ) "ﬁf’“ ﬁ\
Towing fee -5 100.00
GIA -5 2.00
$ 20,157.00

Kindly check and revert to us as soon as possible.

Thanks & regards,

Pila

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd
1 Bukit Batok Crescent
#05-23 Wcega Plaza
Singapore 658064

Tel: 6904 4596

Fax: 6694 4929

On 5at, Apr 27, 2019 at 1:31 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

1



Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your patience.,

For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $16,500.00(before GST) with 19repair days.

Kindly confirm.

** Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documentslie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action,

Flease note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5{(408933)



From: Minoko Chan <minoko @vermogen-group.coms

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 8:29 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com=; Tejano Exequiel Dawal
<ezel.t@vermogen-group.com>; Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>: desmond
<desmond@vermogen-group.com=>; Vmg admin <vmg@vermogen-group.com>; Vermogen Ace <ace@vermogen-

group.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SLES993H FINALISE

Dear Rasul,

1st remider.

Refer to attachment, kindly confirm & acceptance finalise @ COR $16,500.00 & 19 repair days (excluding
PRS/RS/Weekend & PH).

please revert ASAP

Thank you

Best Regards,

Minoko

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd
1 Bukit Batok Crescent
#05-23 Wcega Plaza
Singapore 658064

Tel: 6904 4596

Fax: 6694 4929



On Wed, Jan 2, 2019 at 1:38 PM Shirley Hiew [LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> wrote;

Hi Hsiao Tong,

CC4/ASM18021806/R1pb3

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 5256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Minoko Chan [mailto:minoko@vermogen-group.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 12:40 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com>; Tejano Exequiel Dawal <ezel.t@vermogen-group.com>; Baldoz Juan
Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>; desmond <desmond @vermogen-group.com=; Vmg admin
<Vmg@E@vermogen-group.com=; Vermogen Ace <ace@vermogen-group.com>

Subject: SLES993H FINALISE

Dear Rasul,

Refer to attachment, kindly confirm & acceptance finalise @ COR $16,500.00 & 19 repair days (excluding

PRS/RS/Weekend & PH).

please revert ASAP

Thank you



Best Regards,

Minoko

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd
1 Bukit Batok Crescent
#05-23 Wcega Plaza
Singapore 658064

Tel: 6904 4596

Fax: 6694 4929
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Hsiao Tunﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 9.07 AM

To: 'Pila Ng'

Cc: Mincko Chan; Tejano Exequiel Dawal; Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon; desmond; Vmg
admin; Vermogen Ace; Rasul (LKKAuto): Admin A

Subject: RE: SLES993H FINALISE //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18021806/R1pb3

Without Prejudice

(save as fo cosls)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $19,030.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our propesal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com=

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 11:54 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Ce: Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com>; Tejano Exequiel Dawal <ezel.t@vermogen-
group.com>; Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>; desmond
<desmond@vermogen-group.com>; Vmg admin <vmg@vermogen-group.com>; Vermogen Ace
<ace(@vermogen-group.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>: Admin A <admin-
af@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLE5S993H FINALISE //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18021806/R1pb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Above attach with LOD, could we settle as below:

COR -8 17,655.00

LOU -$  2,400.00 ( $100 x 24 days )



Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 9:14 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vermogen Ace; Rasul (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Re: SLES993H FINALISE //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18021806/R1pb3
Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We accepted your offer with settlement amount $19,030.00 ( Global sum ).

Kindly send us the DV as soon as possible.

Thanks & regards,
Pila

On Fri, May 3, 2019 at 9:07 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $1 2,030.00(all-in).

Flease confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims."

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)



Efficient Towing Services

403 Sin Ming Avenue #13-307, Sin Ming Garden, Singapore 570403

Ah Di Mobile: 8588 8877
Email : efficientiowing sgiligmail.com

Business Ren, Mo §31349324K NO. 2 3 D 7 8
CASH SALE / J
OB ORDER — 0l }1’1;{ |y
Messrs: Voo , Bl &U"‘ U] Jump StaryChanging of battery
+ 5 £ . .
Vehicle No. ‘3LE§¢1“13,'L§- Model No: Honeten Maa DE }T h_ch]mmtm
i 8 (B /&) i I o b Accident/Breakdown
Time (day/night): __._t' a_l. Contact No; _u v «” (] Muli/Basement
}:.]cl::atinn: [ ‘J_]I:‘ c I"“ 9 PQ' O g -'51; I:] W:i'm S
| g ; D King Dolly
To: 6 ad A -;6['{@(' D Transport Charge
-8 1] g Low Body Kit
Cash & 10¢Q Others: Full S Door Open : Servi
2FA Tow Truck ‘Y B Ty
Authorised By: Driver Name: K-L b E] Crane Up/Winch Out
Ij Collzet Doc/Key
i R O ML S48, LA A AL AR S AR, L] Repo
—Hd 2 A4, [ ] woodiands and Tuas Checkpoint

Note: Vehicle is towed at owner's risk. The company sccepts no responsibility
for damages or other misdemeanour to your véhicle whilst being towed. E.& 0. E.



ACE;
Vermogen ACE Pte Ltd

1 Bukit Batok Crescent

#05-23 Weega Plaza

Singapore 6580564

Co. Reg No.:201606023C GST Reg No.:201606023C
Tal:6694 4919 Fax:6694 4929
Email:vermogenacafgmall.com

¥r Ref :SLD4042P
Our Ref : SLES993H

29 APRIL 2019 Without Prejudice
Attn: Motor Claim Dept

AXA INSURANCE (S) PTELTD
8 Shenton Way,

#27-01/02 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Accident in ing SLE5993H & SLDA042P on 1/12/2018 16:20 hrs at along PIE TOWARDS TUAS

We refer to the above said accident.

As instructed, we are claiming the following as stated below:-

1. Cost of repair 5 17,655.00
2. Lossofuse (5100 x 24 days) S 2,400.00
3. Towing fee ] 100.00
4. GIA search fee s 2.00

Total 5 20,157.00

We enclosed herewith relevant document as stated below:-

Towing receipt
GlA search receipt

1. Accident report
2. Final Repair Bill
3. Letter of authority
4.

5.

We do not have the survey report and photographs as our client’s motor vehicle was surveyed by
your appointed surveyor.

Please kindly let us know whether you are prepared to settle our client’s claim & we look forward to
hear from yoll '

Thank you.

Best Regards,

e
Pila (Claim Dept) \

Vermogen ACE PTE LTD
Tel: 6358 3031 | Fax: 6694 4929
Email: pila@vermogen-group.com




THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)

Vehicle No: SLD 4042P (insd veh)

Maodel: HONDA VEZEL 1.5X CVT

SLE 5993H (TP veh)

Date of Accident: |01/12/2018

Global Sum Settlement | : | [%] Yes I [ 1 Mo

Repair Estimate ] 67,826.27

Final Repair Cost - 17.655.00

Loss of Use % 1380004 23  days at $60.00 per day
Rental (if any) . days

LTA ! GIA Search Fee % 2.00

Others: ]: $|

Final Setflernent Sum (GLOBAL SUM) M 16,030.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registerad?
below)

[X] YES [ ] NO (Kindlyindicate

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ Ne  BOLA Scenario No:
B} For GIA Registered Workshop: o8 2 *
BOLA Liability: 100 (%) Assessed Liability (*); 100 (%)

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |VERMOGEMN ACE PTE LTD

I: s| 19,030.0

NUR SHAQILAH BTE ABDOL
WAHAB

03/06/22019
Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report! Bill {if any)




B V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

PV 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Dee Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref :  CC4/ASM18021806/R1pb3s2
8 SHENTON WAY #24-01 .
A TOERSINGAFORE 081 owe: osssae I
ATTN: PETER WANG Code: ASM

1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SLD 4042P Veh. Inspected SLE 5893H
Policy No. GA306602 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SBMO155T Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From PETER WANG Assign Date 04M12/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL 1.5X CVT c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. RU11201466 Colour BLUE
Odometer 189615 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60R16 ROADSTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60R16 ROADSTONE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60R16 ROADSTONE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60R16 ROADSTOMNE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT ANMD REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  01/12/2018 Inspection Date D4/12/2018
Survey held at 6 BENOI SECTOR
Repairer VERMOGEN ACE PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 19 Working Days




[ |

1 7l 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AJE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 15-9607198-R Page No..1of 7
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLE 5993H
Qty Description of Parts Condition \'E:rtm ?;}] Our ‘}:ﬁ“tﬂd
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP LH/RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 250.00 -
1| TAILGATE (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 1,860.00 1,100.00
1]1SET TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 285.00 285.00
1|SET TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1|TAILGATE LOGO (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 52.00 52.00
1| TAILGATE EMBLEM "VEZEL" (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 56.20 56 20
2| TAILGATE LAMP LH/RH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 980.00 504.00
2|SET TAILGATE LAMP CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 50,00 50.00
1|TAILGATE OUTER HANDLE SWITCH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
2| TAILGATE DAMPER LH/RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 424.00 -
1|TAILGATE WIPER MOTOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
1| TAILGATE WIPER BLADE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 75.00 -
1|TAILGATE BUZZER (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 150.00 150.00
1|TAILGATE INNER HANDLE (COMSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 74.00 -
1|TAILGATE INNER LOCK (CONSISTENT) BENT 245.00 245.00
1|TAILGATE LOCK SENSOR (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 220.00 220,00
1| TAILGATE STRIKER (CONSISTENT) BENT 32.00 32.00
1|SET TAILGATE TRIMBOARD (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 295.00 295.00
1|SET TAILGATE TRIMBOARD CLIPS (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 45.00 4500
1|SET TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 145.00 145.00
1| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 164.00 164.00
1| TAILGATE HINGE LH/RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 100.00 -
2| TAIL LAMP LH/RH {(CONSISTENT) CRACKED a78.00 820.00
1|SET TAIL LAMP GLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 36.00 36.00
2| TAIL LAMP PANEL LH/RH (CONSISTENT) NS BENT f QS TO 1,100.00 1558.00
REPAIR SEE
LABOUR
1|REAR BEUMPER {CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 850.00 680.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER LH/RH (CONSISTENT) N/S NECESSARY / 144.00 72.00
QI8 NOT
NECESSARY

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18021806/R1pb3s2




' P4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AJE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.2of 7
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition :
i P Workshop 8| ($)
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKET LH/RH (CONSISTENT) N/S NECESSARY / 116.00 58.00
0/S NOT
NECESSARY
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH/RH (CONSISTENT) N/S DEFORMED / 334.00 131.00
o5 NOT
NECESSARY
2|REAR BUMPER COVER LH/EH (CONSISTENT) MN/S DEFORMED / 420.00 198.00
0/S NOT
NECESSARY
2|SET REAR BUMPER COVER CLIPS (CONSISTENT) MN/S NECESSARY / 100.00 50.00
0/S NOT
NECESSARY
Z|REAR BUMPER COVER RETAINER LH/RH (CONSISTENT) |NfS NECESSARY / B4.00 42 .00
OIS NOT
NECESSARY
1|REAR END PANEL OUTER (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 58500 415.00
1|REAR END FANEL INNER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 396.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 184.00 184.00
1|SET REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS NECESSARY 25.00 25.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|SPARE TYRE PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 1,230.00 :
LABOUR
1|SPARE TYRE PANEL INSULATOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 240,00 E
1|SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP BOARD (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 420,00 306.00
1|SPARE TYRE TOOL TRAY (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 430.00 215.00
2|REAR FENDER PANEL LH/RH (CONSISTENT) N/S BUCKLED / OIS 1,900.00 950.00
TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR
2|REAR FENDER LOWER INNER TRIM LH/RH DEFORMED 480.00 480.00
(CONSISTENT)
2|REAR FENDER LOWER INNER TRIM CLIP LH/RH NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
(CONSISTENT)
2|REAR FENDER ARCH GARNISH LH/IRH (CONSISTENT)  |N/S DEFORMED / 330.00 165.00
OIS NOT
NECESSARY
2|SET REAR FENDER ARCH GARNISH CLIPS N/S NECESSARY / 80.00 40,00
(CONSISTENT) oS NOT
NECESSARY
2|REAR FENDER INNER WATER SHIELD LH/RH NOT NECESSARY 320.00 .
(CONSISTENT)

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18021806/R1pb3s2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8607158-R Page No..3of 7
S Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | op {;H : ﬁJ}
2|5ET REAR FEMDER INMER VWATER SHIELD CLIFS HMOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
2|REAR FENDER AIR DUCT LH/IRH (CONSISTENT) NIS NOT 150.00 .
NECESSARY / O/S
SERVICEABLE
T|EXHAUST MUFFLER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 855.00 -
1|EXHAUST MUFFLER MOUNTING (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 79.50 .
1|EXHAUST MUFFLER HEAT SHIELD (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 165.00 2
2|REAR DOOR (CONSISTENT) N/S TO REPAIR 2,084.00 -
SEE LABOUR / /S
NOT NECESSARY
Z|REAR DOOR FRONT RUBBER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY B0D.0D -
2|REAR DOOR BOTTOM RUBBER [CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 ;
2|REAR DOOR BACK RUBBER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 64.00 I
2|REAR DOOR STICKER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 9200 -
2|REAR DOOR MOULDING (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 170.00 ¥
2|REAR DOOR WEATHER STRIP (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 190.00 2
2|REAR DOOR REGULATOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 954.00 :
2|REAR DOOR LOCK MECHANISM (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 754.00 2
1|REAR DOOR LOCK CATCH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 66.00 e
1|BONNET (CONSISTENT) BENT 1,130.00 819.00
2|BONNET HINGE LH/RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 124.00 2
1|FRONT TOW HOOK COVER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 62.00 -
1|BONNET INSULATOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 160.00 :
1|SET BONNET INSULATOR CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 50,00 50.00
2|BONNET RUBBER SIDE (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 66.80 66.80
1|BONNET RUBBER CENTRE (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 35.20 35.20
1|BONNET LOCK MECHANISM (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 75.00 !
1|BONNET LOCK MECHANISM CABLE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 36.00 .
1|FRONT GRILLE BASE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 250.00 250.00
1|FRONT GRILLE GARNISH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 28500 285.00
1|FRONT GRILLE CHROME (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1,150.00 -
1|FRONT GRILLE SIDE BRACKET (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 279.00 279.00
1|FRONT GRILLE CENTRE BRACKET (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 139.50 138.50
1|SET FRONT GRILLE CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
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1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 28.20 28.20
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 576.20 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH (CONSISTENT) |[NOT NECESSARY 185.00 “
1|SET FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 35.00 =
(CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT SUPPORT LOWER PANEL (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 42220 :
1|AIR INTAKE DUCT (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 115.00 :
1|WASHER TANK (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 120.00 :
1|WASHER TANK MOTOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 59,60 .
2|HEADLAMP LH/RH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 5,080.00 3,568 00
2|HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET LH/RH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 140.00 140.00
1|FRONT BUMPER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 927.50 801.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER RUBBER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 200.00 ;
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
2|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER LH/RH (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 92.00 92.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT) BENT 321.00 290.00
2|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 60.00 .
(CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 351.00 195.00
1|SET FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP CLIPS (CONSISTENT) |NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
2|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH LH/RH cuT 180.00 180.00
(CONSISTENT)
2|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP LH/RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 775.40 =
2|FRONT LOWER SPLASH COVER LH/RH (CONSISTENT)  |NOT NECESSARY 210.00 :
1|SET FRONT LOWER SPLASH COVER CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT LOWER SPLASH COVER CENTRE (CONSISTENT) |[NOT NECESSARY 249.00 !
1|SET FRONT LOWER SPLASH COVER CENTRE CLIPS ~ |NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
2|RADIATOR SIDE GARNISH LH/RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 150.00 s
1{A/C CONDENSER (CONSISTENT) BENT 538 50 538.50
1|A/C FAN ASSY (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 392.00 .
1|RADIATOR (CONSISTENT) BENT 1,220.00 1,220.00
1|RADIATOR FAN ASSY (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 483.00 .
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1|RADIATOR SPARE TANEK (COMSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 55.00 -
1|AIR RESONATOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 173.00 -
2|FRONT DOOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 2,284.00 -
1|HORN (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 64.00 :
2|IFRONT FENDER INMER SHIELD LH/IRH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 302.00 -
2|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
2|FRONT FENDER ARCH GARNISH LH/RH (CONSISTENT} |NOT NECESSARY 330.00 -
2|FRONT FENDER ARCH GARMNISH CLIPS (CONSISTENT) |NOT NECESSARY B0.00 -
2|FRONT FENDER LH/RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1,320.00 -
2|REAR FENDER INNER UPPER TRIM (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1465.00 =
1|ROOF LINING (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 1,250.00 1,250.00
2|REAR CHASSIS MEMBER (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 1.440.00 -
LABOUR
2|REAR WHEEL HOUSE LH/RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1,396.40
2|REAR FLOOR SIDE PANEL LH/RH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 320.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR TOW HOOK PAMEL CENTER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 95.00 -
1|REAR CROSSMEMBER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
1|ECCL MODULE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1.043.30 -
1| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1,150.10 -
1| TAILGATE SPOILER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 430.20 -
1|THIRD BRAKE LIGHT (COMNSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 280.00 -
1|ROOF PANEL (COMNSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 91540 -
Z2|REAR SEAT BELT (COMNSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1,360.00
2|SIDE SKIRT (CONSISTENT) NOT MECESSARY 755,00 -
Z|SET SIDE SKIRT CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY T0.00 -
2|ROCKER PANEL (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1,321.20 -
1|TAILGATE WIRE HARNESS (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 891.10 -
1|REAR WIRE HARMESS (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 963.80 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -11,727.26 -3,806.48
46,9045 04 15,225.92
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE WITH FRAME (SN) (CONSISTENT,) |BENT 55.00 35.00
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1| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) (CONSISTENT) } |NECESSARY 80.00 100.00
1| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL (SN) 80.00 4
(CONSISTENT) }
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 80.00 60.00
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT WORKING 300.00 200.00
1|SPARE TYRE PANEL SEALANT (SN} (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
1|SPARE TYRE PAMEL PADDING (SN) (CONSISTENT} NOT NECESSARY B0.00 -
1{SUNDRIES (SN} (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 80.00 40.00
1|REVERSE CAMERA (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 300.00 -
1|RADIATOR COOLANT (SN} (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 80.00 B0.00
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING (SN) CRACKED 55.00 35.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|TOP UP GAS (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 150.00 100.00
2|REAR SEAT CUSHION (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 800.00 -
2,220.00 630.00
LABOUR
TO STRAIGHTEN AND PANEL BEATING ACCIDENT AREA. 3,500.00 1,800.00
REAR PORTION. TAILGATE, TAILGATE GARNISH, RR
BUMPER, RR BUMPER SIDE COVER X2, RR END PANEL,
SPARE TYRE PANEL, TAIL LAMP PANEL X2, RR FENDER
X2, RR DOOR X2, RR WHEEL HOUSE X2, REAR FLOOR
SIDE PANEL X2, RR CROSSMEMBER. INCLUSIVE OF THE
REPAIR OF O/S TAIL LAMP PANEL LH/RH, SPARE TYRE
PANEL, O/S REAR FENDER PANEL LH/RH, N/S REAR
DOOR, REAR CHASSIS MEMBER AND REAR FLOOR SIDE
PANEL LH/RH.
TO PUTTY, RESPRAY PAINTING AND POLISH ACCIDENT 2,600.00 1,600.00
AREA. REAR PORTION. TAILGATE, TAILGATE GARNISH,
RR BUMPER, RR BUMPER SIDE COVER X2, RR END
PANEL, SPARE TYRE PANEL, TAILLAMP PANEL X2, REAR
FEMDER X2, RR DOOR X2, RR WHEEL HOUSE X2, RR
FLOOR SIDE PANEL X2, RR CROSSMEMRER, RR
CHASSIS MMEMBER X2.
TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER TAILGATE COMPONENTS. 180.00 80.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT TAILGATE WINDSCREEN. 180.00 120.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REVERSE SENSOR. 150.00 60.00
TO RUST PROOF AFFECTED AREAS. 300.00 150.00
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TO CHECK AND RECTIFY WIRING AFTER DISCONNECT 180.00 60.00
AND CONNECT
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR PARTS TO GIVE WAY 180.00 80.00
THE REPAIR,
TO REMOVE AND ALIGNED EXAHUST PIPE NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
TO MOUNT YEHICLE ON CHASSIS MEMBER. 350.00 150.00
TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER REAR DOOR LH NOT NECESSARY 180.00 =
COMPOMENTS.
TO STRAIGHTEN AND PANEL BEATING ACCIDENT AREA. 2,400.00 600.00
FRONT PORTION. BONNET, FRT BUMPER, FRT BUMFPER
REINFORCEMENT, FRT SUPPORT PANEL, FRT FENDER
LH/RH. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT SUPPORT
PANEL
TO PUTTY, RESPRAY PAINTING AND POLISH ACCIDENT 2,400.00 &00.00
AREA. FRONT PORTION. BONNET, FRT BUMPER, FRT
BUMPER REINFORCEMENT, FRT SUPPORT PANEL, FRT
FENDER LH/RH.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT RADIATOR, CONDENSER AND 250.00 120.00
TOP UP AIRCON GAS.
TO RESET CHECK LIGHT ON 350.00 30.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT UNDERCARRIAGE TO ASSIST NOT NECESSARY 280.00 -
WORK LOAD.
TO REMOVE & REFIT EDCL MODULE. 350.00 100.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT ROOF LINING. (ADDITIONAL) 250.00 100.00
14,260.00 5,650.00

GRAND TOTAL 63,389.04 21,5056.92
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 16,500.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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