Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Shafawati <shafawati.rabu@premierauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 20 April 2020 10:20 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: AccReport

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SHD 1801H (OUR REF: CC4/ASM18021797/gb3) *** ACCIDENT

INVOLVING FBM 7540U & SHD 1801H ON 23/11/2018 ***
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Cecilia,
We refer to your email below.
Ur client is not pursuing for this case.

Thank you

Regards
Shafawati Md Rabu

Claims Settlement Officer
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 076 | DID: 64100946 | Fax: 6214 1511

NOTE: Please be informed that we have changed our email from Shafawati.rabu@premiertaxi.com to Shafawati.rabu@premierauto.com.sq

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact the
sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

& Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION g

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Sunday, 19 April, 2020 11:34 AM

To: Shafawati

Subject: YOUR REF: SHD 1801H (OUR REF: CC4/ASM18021797/gb3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBM 7540U & SHD
1801H ON 23/11/2018 ***

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your ref: SHD 1801H
Our Ref: CC4/ASM18021797/gb3

Dear Sir/Madam,



