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Appointed
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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
03-12-2018 Our Ref No. D18008538MFSH
30-11-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCTT21X Third Party Vehicle. ET8818R

303 ALEXANDRA ROAD SIME DARBY PERFORMANCE CENTRE
CAROLINE

BI1G01 740 Fax No. 54784801

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

L KK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc: TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

PERFORMANCE Attention, NIL
MOTORS LIMITED "
NA TP Sollcitor Fax No. NA
SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and T days for re-inspaction

This is 2 computer ganerated letter, no signature required.
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Nivitha SLI(I{ Autuz

From: Admin=-D (LKKAute) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 4:35 PM

Tao: ‘Merina Chia San San’; SUR

Cc: ‘Sithara’; assignments

Subject: RE: D1BO0BS3IBMFSH of accident involving SHC7721X & ETB818R on 30-11-2018

Dear Merina,
Thank you for the email,

we will close this file at our end without hilling.

Best Regards,

G Nivitha| Admin

I KK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: pssignments@kkautpcom | fax: Ga56-4315
Blk 51, Puva Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #c2-25 | S{408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 4:31 PM

To: Merina Chia San San «MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Ce: Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: D18008538MFSH of accident involving SHC7721X £ ET8818R on 30-11-2018

Dear Merina,
Thank you for the email.
ear Assignment Team,

Please refer to the below email.

Best Regards,

Shizmu Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKE Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phome: 62563561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4515
Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

from: Merina Chia San San <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 4:25 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@|kkauto.coms»

Ce: Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assighments <assignments@lkkauto com>
Subject: RE: D18008538MFSH of accident involving SHC7721X & ET8818R on 30-11-2018



Dear Shiau Chan,

Thank you for your prompt reply,

Please kindly assist to cancel the assignment for the above mentioned case.
Thank you.

Eest Regards;

Merina Chia (Ms)
Maotor Claims Departiment

M First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-0] Singapote 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DI 6507 3856

| Fax Mo, - 6307 3849 | Envail: pierinachin@melirsteapital ¢om.sg | Company Régn. Na. 195000106C
A Member of BN 1nsurance Group

Pzrzanal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PEPAT):
Under the FOPA, there are various requiraments that requlate the processing of your persanal date Please refer to
Netp:! a'mw.nuﬁrﬂcm.ms_w for detplls of POPA Persongl Dote Coltectlon Statemng.

Confidenticlity Notice: This &mafl iz confidential, It may algd bie tegully privileged, 1] you ore nat He addiessee or b whom Tt 13 Intended, you
iray not copy, forward, disclose or wre ony part of I 1 you have recelved this message In error, plegse delets the message and all coples: from
st syscem ond HOETfy tie sender immeiiately by reditn e-moil. '

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <si Ikkauto.coms>

Sent: Thursday, 28 March, 2019 4:19 PM

To: Merina Chia San San <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Ce: Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com sg>; assignments <assignmen SULO.com
Subject: RE: D1800B538MFSH of accident involving SHC7721X & ETB818R on 30-11-2018

Cear Merina,
Thank you for the email.

Please be informed that no survey done for the vehicle ET 8818R.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKE Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: Gas6-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrinl Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Merina Chia San San <MerinaChia @msfirstcapital. com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 4:14 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siev kkauto.com>

Cc: Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: D18008538MFSH of accident involving SHC7721X & ETB818R on 30-11-2018

Diear Shiau Chan,

As spoken earlier, please kindly assist to confirm if there is any survey conducted (@ Performance Motors for
ET8818R.

Thank you.

Best Regords,
Merina Chia (Ms)



Mutor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Lid | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6307 3848 | DID : 6507 3856

| Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Email: mérinachia@mstirsicapital.com sg | Company Regn. No. 1950001060
A Member of Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ["POPA"):
Under the POPA, there are witfowus requirements that regulate the processing of youl: perional data. Please tefer 1o
htp! ! L www, nsfirsteopltol. com. ¢ for detalls of PDPA Personal Data Collection Stotement,

Conficentialiey Natice: This e-mall Ts confidential. It may alsd be tegally privileged. If yoir are hot the addressee or te whom | s intended, you
indy ot copy, forward, disclose ar use any part of It {f you have received this messaye fooerror, pleme delete the messow and all coples from
yrur system and notlfy the sender mmediately by return e-mill

I 5 i This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
- WWW.avg.com



