Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com:

S5ent: Monday, 14 October 2019 3:32 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A&

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Alfred Toh; Chee 5o Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE8904P and GBF183) (TP . LKK REF -

CCB/CTINB021791/Afb3) on 29.11.2018 / our ref: SNM18D05603C02/cbs

LKK REF-CC6/CTI18021791/Afb3
CTPIS REF =SNM18D05603C02/chs

Dear lia Le
We refer to your email pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to offer as follow:

Cost of repairs 58,600.00
Loss of use (580.00x 11 days) S 880.00
Total $9,480.00

We await your payment advice to enable Boon Sen to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 618399

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X F3##& Taiping SG

Diselaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it s intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mall and any coples of it thereafter.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailtodiale@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 14 October, 2019 10:16 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBEB304P and GBF189) (TP : LKK REF -CC&/CTI18021791/Afb3)
on 29.11.2018 / our ref: SNM18D05603C02/cbs

Your ref : SNM18D05603C02
Ourref : CC&/CTINARD21791/AdR3

Dear Sirs/Madam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8704P(OI) & GBF 1895(TP) ON 29/11/2018



We refer to the above matter,

The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the last vehicle. In accordance to the
MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD [if any) would be on hold
far the time being.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "MGARAGE (EAST) PTE LTD" af $9.920.00(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Armount Amount Revised
Claimed
1. Cost of Repair 31799422 § 8.500.00
2. Loss of Use [11days x $150.00) $ 1.650.00 5 1.320.00 (1 1days x $120.00)
Total $19.644,22 $9.920.00

**10 days recommendation for repair + 15un = 11days.
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval/instruction please.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 3 January, 2019 12:57 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.coms; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBEBS04P (Ol : CTI - TBA) and GBF18SJ (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI18021791/Afb3) on 29.11.2018 / our ref: SNM18D05603C02

Dear Shu Pei,

Pls find Insured report,
Thank you.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen

Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079209

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

CID: 63896171
Fax: 62247175
Email. boonsen chona@sg.cntaiping.com




Website: www sg.cntaiping.com

Lisclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by Ching Taiping Insurance (Sin gapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in a written ogreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Led. Any unouthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited, If you are nat the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Shu Pei (LkKAute) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December, 2018 2:39 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Lucas Lee <|ucas. lee@sg cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>: Poh Kin
(LKKAuto) <pohkin@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE8304P (01 : CTI - TBA) and GBF189J (TP ; LKK REF -
CCB/CTI1B021791/Afb3) on 29.11.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Boon Sen,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle GBF 189] at M /s Mgarage (east) Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed
for a direct settlement.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Our case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841-2132.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6366-0055 | email: shupel@@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com




MGarage (East) Pte Ltd

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #04-01 Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(Co. Reg. No. 200913013D)

Date : 29/03/2019

Your Ref : GBESY04P

To : CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Attn : Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE GBF189J & GBES904P ON 29/11/2018 AT
ALONG WOODLANDS AVENLUE 12 TOWARDS SLE AFTER WOODLANDS LANE.

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for vour kind perusal:
1) Invoice No.198004 (@ S$8.600.00

2) Loss of Use (@ S81,650.00 (11 Days x S§150)
3) LTA Search (@ SSNIL

4) Authorisation to Act

3) GIA Report

Hope to receive your favorable reply as soon as possible.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

Roger Tan

HP: 9189 4223
E-mail: mgarage.east@gmail.com



" V Auto
- Ewm Ewm Consutfants
i BA B Ple Lid

S1UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 405933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (I65) 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18021791/Afb3
14™ January 2019

BLU3 STAR MFG GROUP PTE LTD
1 Soon Lee Street,

#05-42 Pioneer Centre,

Singapore 627605.

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GBE 8904P, GBF
189J AND OTHERS ALONG WOODLANDS AVENUE 12 ON 29.11.2018.

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

1 o,

b

7L
Poh«Kin, Chong
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpehi@lkkauto.com

cc.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Name NK. CEBAMIC PTE LTP
Address . 4 Senotr Loop  Wind lnnds Fas]
fwdustiinl F Sty _:'-:p“-g_{‘- prrg Feigd
Contact No
Tﬂ: ." A ) -:J I AR r :'-J f ':;i' I '_-:'; [.ll L ! ! 11 [ =1 |
Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING ___[xEF 107 AND  GBE 49047 on 24l 201
AT/ ALONG Wopd|as /5 hve 2 Aowmrds €L f At £+ \Noudls .'-,-fl-. [ Ang
r"'}WE, WA CErfwA [ T L |'1 . am‘{are e registerEd —
Sr A

motorcarno, BT 141

Please note that | have assigned all compensations monies due to me/us in the above said
accident to M/S MGarage (East) Pte Ltd.

I/We , hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the above-

mentioned accident to M/S MGarage (East) PTE LTD and forward your settlement cheque to M/S
MGarage (East) PTE LTD whom | had authorized to collect the said compensation monies.

Thankyou

P -
LA
4%
bl

A,

Signature of Claimant Witness By



MGarage (East) Pte Ltd

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(Co. Reg. No. 200913013D)

MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE
INSURED ovomrno NI LA B A
CAR/ LORRY/CYCLE: REG NO: ... \50  anT POLICY NO: oo

ACCIDENT CLAIM NO: oo, e,

| / We confirm that | / we have taken delivery of Car / Lorry / Motor Cycle

A D | BT

Registered NO. ...t S S S e s L from the repairers,

& A PhE '-.."'4

LT[ SRR SN it SR A b SR e e
And that all repairs necessary as a result of an accident in which the said vehicle was Involved

on or about the ...... P dayvof ... e 20...L.... have been completed to my / our

satisfaction, and that | / we have no further claim on the above company in Respect thereof.

D U NURORINNS 1~ - | 1 | ¢ - PPN
/ 'ﬁ*h‘]-k_ ;Q\
,f s
H&}; ")
Co's Stamp: ..., u.‘.;........n | | L
N



MOTOH CLATMS DISCHARGE WOUCHER

Policy Neo i  DMCVSK30D28551800 Claim Ne : SNM18D0S603C0O2
Claimant ¢ @ HNEK.CERAMIC PTE LTD
Amount : 558, 48000

DOLLARS NINE THOUSAND FQUR HUNDRED EIGHTY ONLY

I/We agree to accept the sheve mentioned amount. to be paid to mefus in full &
final ‘settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuriss / damages
sustained by mesus through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle Ne. @ GBEF 1897
Insured Vehicle Na. = GEE B304P

Date of Loss 2941142018
Place of ARccident . WOODLANDS AVE 12 TWDS SLE AFT WOODLANDS LANE

IN COMSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the afcrementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) PBETE. LTD., I/We agresa absalutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/for

Insured MName 1 BLU3 STER MFG GROUE DTE LTD
Driver Mame : CLAVIN TENG KARE CHUN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss; injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPOEE) PTE. LTD.

(1) General Damages 53
{2} Cost of Repair/ Beeess 2 B,600.00
{2) Loss of Use/Restalifarsins 5§ BEBO.00
{4} GIAR/Police Reports/
Investigation Results/Search Fees 5z
{5) Medical Reports/Expenses 55
(&) Survey Fees/P.T. Faes 8%
(7)) Cost. including Disbursement 58
POTEL: 5 & o 7 & & 06 3 b 5o a0 v OB 3,480.00

Claimant Name :

fignature :

Provided

Turihe T
dameges o my personal i

N AT samE auciden



MGarage (East) Pte Ltd

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6242 1376
(Co. Reg. No. 200913013D)

Bill To:
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
NO. 3 ANSON ROAD INVOICE No : 198004
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909 Date : 29-March-2019
ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Vehicle Number : GBF 189.J
QTyY DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation g 8,600.00
{Lump Sum)

TOTAL | § 8,600.00

Cheque should be made payable to MGarage (East) Pte Ltd

/)
St :
; S C J-Lf(}—} L—

Co's stamp & Authqﬂsed Signature



