Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@I|onpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 5:41 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. YL 5551)

{O1) AND GBC 7519K (TP) ON 29-11-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18021790/K1fb3;
Lonpac ref: 18/18/18/VC00/021179 [External Canfidential]

Categories: clear

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Poh Kin,

We are agreeable to your proposal for cost of repair but for loss of use,
we proposed the amount $720.00 ( 6 days x $120).

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all {#ew 3} lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin(@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 22 April, 2019 2:57 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT _Claim 5G; Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. YL 5551]
(OI) AND GBC 7519K (TP) ON 29-11-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18021790/K11b3; Lonpac ref:
18/18/18/VC00/021179

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/LPC18021790/R1fb3
Your Ref: 18/18/18/VvC00/021179

Dear Sir/Madam,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. YL 5551 (Ol) AND GBC 7519K (TP) ALONG CARPARK

OF BLK 173 YISHUN
AVENUE 3 ON 29/11/2018




Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 2:57 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

CE "MT_Claim_SG"; Admin A

Subject: SEEK MAMNDATE: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS, YL 55517)

(Ol) AND GBC 7519K (TP) ON 29-11-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18021730,/K1fb3;
Lonpac ref: 18/18/18/VC00/021179

Attachments: LKK Adjustment report.pdf: LKK Inspection report.pdf; LKK Resurvey photo.pdf; LKK
Survey photo.pdf; TP LOD.pdf

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/LPC18021790/R1fb3
Your Ref:  18/18/18/vC00/021179

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. YL 5551 (Ol) AND GBC 7519K (TP) ALONG CARPARK
OF BLK 173 YISHUN
AVENUE 3 ON 29/11/2018

We refer to the above matter.
Liability: The accident occurred when our insured driver collided with third party vehicle while reversing.
Liability is down against our insured as Vehicle

reversing in/out of parking lot should exercise greater caution.

Summiary to offer to third party repairer, Sin Sheng Engineering Services is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair 5 5,275.78 S 3,370.50 (53,150.00 + 7% gst)
2. Loss of Use S B40.00(5120.00x 7 days) | S  840.00 ($120.00 x 7 days)
3. LTA search fee S 2.00 S 2.00
Total | $ 6,117.78 —_ﬁ 4,212.50

**5 days recommendation for repair + 1 day downtime/survey + 1 day weekend = 7 days
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.




Y/ -
SIN SHE

/4

FRERIMIERS
(; SN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

HEGISTFLATIGN NO : 312029/00D
No 3, Tech Park Crescent, Tuas Tech Park, Singapore 638129
Tel : 6863 9595 Fax: 6863 6477  Email : sinshengl981@gmail.com

5-Mar-19
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Fax: 6533 3270
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 Tel; 6477 1186

The Concourse

Singapore 199555 Our ref: SSES/L2019/0088

Attn: Mr Gerald

Dear Sir,

Your ref: 18/18/18/VC00/021179

VEHICLE: GBC7519K (DoA: 29/11/2018)

Our Costing as follows: -

Final Repair Bill : 3,370.50
Loss of Use: 7 days @ S$ 120/day : 840.00
(Including 2 day PRI)

Survey Fee ; N/A
Third Party Vehicle Insurance Search Fee : 2.00
Total : - 4,212.50
Thank You

Yours faithfully

SUSAN TAN
Encl,



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

|, GOLDBELL LEASING PTELTD (“The Third Party Claimant”) of

NO 59, SENOKO ROAD, SINGAPORE 758123 (address),

being the owner of __ GBC7519K {vehicle no.) hereby authorize

SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES ("the workshop”) to act for me
with respect to my claim for repair cost and / or rental and / or loss of use (“claim”) for my
vehicle bearing registration no. _ GBC7519K___that was damaged pursuant to the accident

which occurred on __29/11/2018  along _Carpark Driveway of Blk 173 Yishun Ave 7
invalving vehicle's GBCT7519K [ ¥L5551J (“the
accident”)

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner they deem
fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlemeant of my
claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability in so far as the driver/owner/insurers of
the other vehicle is concerned.

Dated this 04 day of __ MAR _ (month) 2018 (year)

Signed by “the Third Party claimant” Signed by "the workshop”



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO :18/18/18/VC00/021179
DATE

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We. Goldbell Leasing Pte Lid confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of YL 5551J the sum of Singapore Dollars
Four Thousand Ninety Only ($4,090.00) in full and final satisfaction. liquidation and
discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by me/us whether now or
hereafter to become manifest. arising either directly or indirectly from an accident to
my vehicle. GBC 7519K on 29" November 2018 along/at carpark of BLK 173
Yishun Avenue.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (JIA MEI TRADING (85) PTE
LTD/ LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever
made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/s SIN
SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES.

[/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recgvery action.

7

............................................

Mame of vehicle owner/Date

-l



SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

3 TECH PARK CRESCENT

SINGAPORE 638129

Tel Mo. : 6863-8595 Fax No. : 6BB3-8477
E-Mail : sinsheng1981 @gmall.com
Buss. Reg. No. ; 312029/00D

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD

T ice :
59 SENOKO ROAD ax Inveice : TIDD2683
SINGAFORE 756123 Date : 05/03/2019
Vehicle Num. : GBCTS19K
: Make/Model : MITSUBISHI FB 70-2013
Aecion : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng#t | FB70BBA20845/4M42AF1970
Contact 8861 0007 Fax No.: 6753 7780 Accident Date : 28/11/2018

Claim MNo. | 18/18180CO002117TE
Reference : YL5551J
Policy No. : 29090793

Amount 5§

ACCIDENT LUMP SUM REPAIR 3,150.00
: Total S$ ; 3,150.00
GST@ 7% S§: 220.50

Amount Due S5 : 3,370.50

SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

Me-0010074-J



12372018 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GE“ERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raflles Quay #18-00, Si 048580
INSURANCE Frone: 165 6324 0010 s gy B ot
i ASSOCIATION Dpamtinq Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE G5! Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No G3R-18-186914
Date of Request: 03nzr2018 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase
Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescant
Tuas Tech Park
Singapore 638129
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 03anzr20e
Enquiry By Wang Sye Yuen
TP Vehicle No. YL5551J
Accident Date 281112018 ]
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Ameount Due (GST Inclusive) 2,00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:

[¥] GIRCQ [] Cash [ ] Cheque

hitps:iisingapare.meriman.comiclalms/index.cim?fusebox=MTRsas&iuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=19928574CF|D=44T839EZLCFTOKEN=046... 22



