Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December 2018 1:31 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT VEHICLE GBG6068E AND YOUR INSURED

PA2494A ON 29/11/2018 / our ref: snm18d05594c02

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December, 2018 1:03 PM

To: ADMIN SAT <admin@sngahtee.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT VEHICLE GBG6068E AND YOUR INSURED PA2494A ON 29/11/2018 /
our ref: snm18d05594c02

Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter.

Liability is in favor of your client and we agree to go for Direct Settlement, subject to consistency of damages, based
on our appointed surveyor’s findings, with supporting documents.

Please submit your claim in Merimen/Audatex as this is authorized workshop.

Aside to M/s LKK, please upload your report and bill for services rendered in Merimen at your earliest convenience.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175



Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: ADMIN SAT [mailto:admin@sngahtee.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December, 2018 11:39 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT VEHICLE GBG6068E AND YOUR INSURED PA2494A ON 29/11/2018

Hi Boon Seng,

We don’t have any video footage.Please refer to the above accident scene photo

Hope to hear from your soon.

Best Regards

Best Regards

Joyce Tan | admin@sngahtee.com

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

From: Chong Boon Sen

Sent: Monday, December 03, 2018 11:42 AM

To: admin@sngahtee.com

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT VEHICLE GBG6068E AND YOUR INSURED PA2494A ON
29/11/2018

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171



Fax: 62247175
Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Chong Boon Sen

Sent: Monday, 3 December, 2018 11:41 AM

To: 'Bertha Chua' <bertha@sngahtee.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT VEHICLE GBG6068E AND YOUR INSURED PA2494A ON 29/11/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Bertha,

Insured yet to report.

Will follow up as usual. Meanwhile, you may wish to provide video if any for our further review.
Thank you.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential, its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Bertha Chua [mailto:bertha@sngahtee.com]

Sent: Monday, 3 December, 2018 9:22 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT VEHICLE GBG6068E AND YOUR INSURED PA2494A ON 29/11/2018

Hi All,

We refer to above and wish to check liability for this case.



Hope to hear from your soon

Best Regards

Joyce Tan | admin@sngahtee.com

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com
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