Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 11:47 AM

To: Chan Soo Lye

Cc: Lee Tong Ren kenji; Coleen Leong Lai Yee; Rahman; 'Jeff Lum Wei Keong'
Subject: Re: PA5662L AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Attachments: PA5662L.pdf

Hi Mr Chan,

Refer to attached. COR lumpsum $3650, 6days.
Regards,

Taufikh

Lkk Auto

Get Outlook for Android

From: Chan Soo Lye <slchan@woodlandstransport.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, January 3, 2019 4:07:45 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Lee Tong Ren kenji; Coleen Leong Lai Yee; Rahman; 'Jeff Lum Wei Keong'
Subject: PA5662L AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Dear Taufikh,

As per your request please refer the attached file and advise us final repair cost.

Thank you.
Best Regards

Chan Soo Lye
Service Executive
WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

@Wﬁﬂdlands Transport

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd

8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Direct Line : +65 6559 8984 Fax 1 +65 6862 2163
www.woodlandstransport.com.sg #
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