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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 9:41 AM

To: 'ASM Jaclyn'

Cc: SUR; ASM Yandy; Alex; KHONG Lynn

Subject: RE: Winning Bid Notification for (XE1730J) of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

Dear Jaclyn, 

 

I’ve spoken with Lynn from AXA, please go ahead on part by part 11,500/-. 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: ASM Jaclyn <jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 3:36 PM 

To: KHONG Lynn <lynn.khong@axa.com.sg> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; ASM Yandy <yandy@asmauto.com.sg>; Alex <alex@asmauto.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Winning Bid Notification for (XE1730J) of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 

 
Dear Lynn, 

 

Our bidding amount, $11,500/- is on part-by-part basis. Kindly re-confirm. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards,     
Jaclyn LaiJaclyn LaiJaclyn LaiJaclyn Lai  

Customer Service & Motor Claims Executive  

ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd  

No. 2 Kwong Min Road, Singapore 628705 

Hp: 9236 8218  |  Tel:  6265 0980  |  Fax: 6265 6068 

Web: www.asmauto.com.sg   
 

 
 

From: KHONG Lynn [mailto:lynn.khong@axa.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 3:19 PM 
To: ASM Jaclyn 

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; ASM Yandy; Alex 
Subject: RE: Winning Bid Notification for (XE1730J) of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 
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Hi Jaclyn, 

 

Kindly proceed at LS COR $11500, 4 days of repair. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Hi LKK, 

 

Kindly take note to follow up. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 
 
 

 

Lynn Khong 
Specialist, Motor Claims Department 
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 

 

8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811  
Email: lynn.khong@axa.com.sg 
Customer Care No. 1800 8804888 
www.axa.com.sg 

 
 
Please consider the environment before printing this message.  
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited.  
If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately. 
 

From: ASM Jaclyn [mailto:jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, December 10, 2018 4:21 PM 

To: KHONG Lynn <lynn.khong@axa.com.sg> 

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; ASM Yandy <yandy@asmauto.com.sg>; Alex <alex@asmauto.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: Winning Bid Notification for (XE1730J) of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 

 
Dear Lynn, 

 

Kindly refer to the attached letter for the reason of late report submission. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards,     
Jaclyn LaiJaclyn LaiJaclyn LaiJaclyn Lai  

Customer Service & Motor Claims Executive  

ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd  

No. 2 Kwong Min Road, Singapore 628705 

Hp: 9236 8218  |  Tel:  6265 0980  |  Fax: 6265 6068 

Web: www.asmauto.com.sg   
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From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December 2018 9:20 AM 
To: Alex; ASM Jaclyn 

Subject: Winning Bid Notification for (XE1730J) of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 

 

This mail is associated with : 

eTender XE1730J 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

This is to notify that you have been awarded for the bidding of the subject vehicle. Kindly check the award 

letter that was sent to your Merimen account for further details. 

 

To view this record, please logon to www.merimen.com.sg  

 

Thank you. 

 

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd  

 

This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this email.  

 

Sent by : Lynn Khong (AXA Insurance Pte Ltd)  

 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

 

-----Disclaimer----- 

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If 

you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this 

message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or 

opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of 

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and 

duly authorized by the said companies.  


