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MS > FirstCapital

B Ratiles Quay 821-00 Sinpapore 048580
Tet (G5 6222 2311 Fax: [65) 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited  comey. Mo, 1950000060 G5T Reg. fo, M2-0OD1676-9

Claims & Metor Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-0L City House Singapore 06B877

Tel (65} 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 30849
e misfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

nengrnd Vohicle

Survey Location

Cont on,

Contact No.

Survey Type

""mher.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

30-11-2018 Our Ref No.
29-11-2018 Claim Type.
SHCO7735 Third Party Vehicle,

51 DEFU LANE 10
WILLIAM

68585151/ 0 Fax No.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:

LEK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No.
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18008503MFSH

Third Party

5GQeB515U

68580877

68416315

't lo us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

TY SURVEY REQUEST

rqe

TAN LIM MOTOR PTE

Attention.
LTD
MA TP Solicitor Fax No.
SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

MNA

“mit the survey report via CWES within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto) e — —

From: Wei Shong <wei.shong@timotor.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 December 2018 6:55 PM

To: '‘Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)

Cc ‘Admin A"; sur@lkkauto.com; caymen@timotor.com.sg
Subject: SGQA515U and GBCBB71K - Finalising

Attachments: 20122018185419.pdf

Dear Adrian,

1. GBCB8871K Lump sum $1,950.00 and 4 days repair — Confirmed.
2. 5GQBE515U should be Lump sum $8,450.00 and 7 days repair, the Labour for replace engine mount we put
$200.00, towing fee is $180.00 cannot be less and paint coating is $350.00.

Enclosed the revised estimate, towing bill, paint coating invoice and before coating invoice for your perusal.

Please revert to us as soon as possible,

Thank you.

Regards,

Tan Lim Motor Pte |

TANLM

La_rr! Wei Shong O +B65 6858 5151 51 Defu Lane 10
William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 538216
wei.shong@timotor.com.sq http:ffwww imotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the reciplent(s) named abaove and may contain information that is confidential 1o Tan |
Fie Lid. Any use of the information {inciuding but not limited to, total or partial reproduction. distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intent
racipient{s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please natify the sender immedialaly and delete i, While Tan Lim Motor has put in place &
programs, we da not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 5 December 2018 11:13 AM

To: 'Sithara’; '"CWS Maoter Claims’

Cc: SUR: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008503MFSH/1
Dear Sithara,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SGQ 6515U on 03/12/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 30 November 2018 4:24 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara’ <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008503MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed repairer agreed survey on 3/12/2018.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 30 November 2018 2:37 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008503MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.AVE.COm




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMatoring

' Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Cwner 1D

Vehicle Details

YWehicle Mo.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Ma.;

Chassis Mo

M aximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid;

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

Singapare NRIC
B905C

SGOES15U
Mo
29 MNov 2018

MERCEDES BEMZ
S300L

Black

2006
27204430489256
WDD2211542A057119
170.0 kW (227 bhp)
$81,524.00

22 Jan 2007

22 Jan 2007

1

$90,117.00

Farfeited

$0.00

21 Jan 2027

Page 1 of 1

COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE PeriodiYear 4. ic
POP Paid: 852 660,00
COE Rebate Amount: $42 59200
Total Rebate Amount: $42,892.00
The information contained hereinis correct as at 25 Nov 2018
OK

https://vil.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy Pu blicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION _ID=F03... 29/11/2018



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 10 Type:
Owner 1Dy

Singapore NRIC
B905C

Vehicle Mo,

“ehicle to be Exparted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid;

SGQ6515U

s

03 Dec 2018
MERCEDES BENZ
S300L

Black

2006
272R463048%254
WDD2211542A0%711%
170.0 kW {227 bhp)
$81,924.00

22 Jan 2007

22 Jan 2007

1

£90,117.00

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Forfeited

$0.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(ears):
PGP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Taotal Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Dec 2018

21 Jan 2027

B - Car{1401cc & above)
10

$£52.640.00

34282100

$42,821.00

OK



scCarMAnRT.COM Login | sonue NS

Mew Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum - Resources
Some rides are betier than others.
DOS WE'ItAU to. Broce yourself for edrenaline pumping offers on certified,
Used cors you con trust, Guaranteed. pre-ownod VW cars of the sgCarMart Camival

@ Downtown Eash,

Post an Advertisement New 3 Years Coe Rencwal Toyota Altis .04 b #Lake View iy aarcans |
Sol it yoursel! Advertise It at Just S L B 1 et Lnber Gy T ECreditPteltd )
$58 until it's SOLD! | hiaredl B b i 2 Low prices guaranteed

yment Monkhly From ) ¥ Specialist in Japanese cars
» Easy loan approval
» All terms are negotiable

Sort by Date Posted ¥ | 2D results/page ¥

Search Salection | 5-Class S300L fany Ary >10 D‘;:"f’j vy fny fary Awalloble
Co TS B[] Mercedes-Benz 5-Class S200L  $85,398 | $10.060 fyr W-Mar2007 | 2997 33,000 km Lupvury R
(AL z‘- [COE till 03/ 2027)
Problemns/Accident Free, 33k Km Mieage, Verifisble CRC Recorgs From Day 11 Car In Showroem Conditions! COE Renewed About $50k Plus, Expiring
In 2027 Mar, & Manths Read Tax, Previcus Cwnar (Senior C&C ., fosnecr Camer ]
E. Mercedas-Benz 5-Class 5300L £02L800 ¢ $10,520 fyr 05=Jun-2007 2,997 oc 80,000 km Lumsuary Available
(COE till 05/2027)
Super Condition With Onily 1 Ownert Original Beautiful Black. A Oass Of Its Crnl Having The Both Workd By Combining Luxury And Mot To Fonget
Having Tha BH® O 227 A% The Same Time. Well Maintained. Or...
Prem Roy Motoring
14
I:! Mercedes-Benz 5-Class 5300L $90,800 £10,650 fyr 13-Jun-2007 2,997 e - Lusury Avallabie
(COE till 05/2027)
Full 565 Conversion Kt With Mew Facelift Fronk And Rear Lignt. Upgraded AMG Front Brake And Upgrades Rims. Owner Consigned, Ploase Call Far
Viewing Appointment.
D Mercedes-Benz S-Class S300L £89,777 58,570 fyr 25-Mov-2008 2997 x B5, 500 km Luxury Available

{Mew 10-yr COE)

§7000 For Down Paymert, 51250 For Monthly Instaliment, Mew 10 Years COE, 1 Owner, CAC Unit, Low Mileage, Low Deprecation, Excellent
Maintained Condition, No Repairs Needed And Comes With & Months Waer,.,

Gawe this search Criteria, to gat amail alerts whenever a match is found. u Save Search

For old advertisements, view Expired ads 20 ¥ results/page

Home | Mew Cars | Usaed Cars | Sell My Car | Directory | Products | Insurance | Article | Forum Resources

115 the b i i it | irrisdirt =ar i o M i B B

& Dawslesd on the

Follow sgCarMart.com g (- BB B @ App Store

LHOE TLISTIR HESTORT

About Us | Careers | Contact Us | Sitemap  Terms of Service | Privacy Policy | Personal Data Protection Statement
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MS FCIL Insured's Veh No : SHC773S TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD

Date of Accident : 29 November 2018 51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216
Tel : 68585151 ( 24 Hours ) Fax : 68580877

GST Regn. No. : M2-8922054-2

TP
Miss Loo Sek Lin (Lu Xueling) Jeleyf Date : 01 December 2018
r i Bdlea=_
Estimate To Repair SGQ6515U - Mercedes Benz S300L 0% afls @ £ 73
Chassis No : WDD2211542A097119
S/Ne | Quantity Description Amaunt
NETT ITEMS
01 |1pc left front door 5 1,550.00
02 |1pc left front door side inner rubber % 95.00
03 [1pc left front door bottom moulding 3 95.00
04 |1pc left front door top hinge . - 155.00 |7
05 |1 pc left front door bottom hinge X g 155.00
06 [1pc left front fender V.50, 1 g 1,380.00 |
07 |1pc left front fender moulding ] 110.00 |~
08 |1pc left front fender inner cowling e 5 201.00
09 |1pc left front fender inner air guide _ ] 175.00
{10 |1pc front suspension height level sensor A /€4 $ 400.00 # SIS
1 |1pec left front lower arm  Bovd’ $ 91600 °
12 |1 pc left front upper arm g QH'.‘DD'*__ i
13 [1pc left front shock absorber assy -t ~4 $ 4,200.00 [* -
14 |1 pc left front knuckle arm | $ 1,200.00 |&
15 |1pc left front wheel bearing with hub & ¢ - $ 702.00 [
16 |1pc steering rack and pinion A s $ 8,030.00 {*
17 |1pc left front torsion rod A Ao $ 800.00 jc
18 |1pc left front radius rod P pts 17 'J.If $ 800.00 |}~
19 |2ps anti-roll bar links @ $148.00 ¢ pe ) . $ 296.00 |
20 [1pc engine mounting right =~ #* g 257 20 $ 300.00 |-+
21 |1pc engine mounting left g 300.00 |~
22 |1pc gearbox mounting o $ 116.001°
23 [1pc engine mounting rear/ ¢ ¥ $ 300.00 7
24 |[1pc left rocker panel garnish ¢ 3 185.00 [
25 |1pc engine suspension cross member »L 5 2,830.00 §
3 26.207.00
Less 10 % ] 2,620.70
¥ 23,586.30
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
26 |1pc left front sport wheel rim [ ./ a2 $ 150000 |
27 (1pc left front wheel tyre ., , g 550.00
(3 2.050.00
LABOUR & MISC. CHARGES B
01 To transfer of door fittings and perform water seepage test. § 250:00
0z To transfer of tyre, rim and on wheel balancing. g 80.00 |
03 To drop front suspension undercarriage parts, remove and renewal | $ 36000 222
of the necessary parts, to perform final checking and testing.




MS FCIL Insured's Veh No : SHC773S TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD

Date of Accident : 29 November 2018 51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216
Tel : 68585151 ( 24 Hours )  Fax : 68580877
GST Regn. No. : M2-8922054-2

Miss Loo Sek Lin (Lu Xueling) Date : 01 December 2018

Estimate To Repair SGQO6515U - Mercedes Benz S300L
Chassis No : WDD2211542A097119

SiMNo | Cuantity Description Amount
LABOUR & MISC. CHARGES 5D
04 To remove and renew engine and gearbox mountings. 3 25000+
05 To check steering geometry and computer wheel alignment. g 100.00 |
06 To check electrical lighting concerned. 5 80.001 *
o7 To rust-proofing of the affected areas. 3 25000 |
08 Using onboard scan tool (OBD) perform full engine diagnostic check, | § 80000 .:*91.
to confiqure and clear, reset SRS service light. .
09 Fanel beating, knocking and straighten the necessary portion, g 1,800:00 | |
remove and renewal of parts, adjust and realign the same. )
10 Futty and spray painting of the affected portion. .? 3 / $ 1,00000| ¢
1 Towing with king dolly charges $ 200.00 | /&
3 5,160.00
Total 3 30,796.30
20 14s 30
Bt L |
1l¢ p3|aL\1E '
|
e TS u= TR | :
NotyY :E?? 'y-.‘ .\.Il;;’._:J

e

Fotel * 1060434
[[C . 8450,

D
Vi
N

.....




MS FCIL Insured's Veh Mo : SHCT735

Date of Accident ; 29 November 2018

Miss Loo Sek Lin (Lu Xueling)

TAN LIM M

Bk

SRR
OTOR PTE LTD

51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216
Tel : 68585151 ( 24 Hours )

GST Regn. No. : M2-8922054-2

Date : 11 December 2018

ntary To Repai - enz 5300
Chassis No ;. WDD2211542A097119
SiNo | Quanlity Deascription Arnouinl
LABOUR & MISC. CHARGES
04 To redo paint coating accident affected portion. 5 350.00
g 350.00
Total 5 350.00

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey belora'alier spray painting
» To display damaged part(s) durng resunvey
« Parts prices ane subject 1o confirmation
» Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudics” basis
* No ilegal modification|s) is allowed
» Supplamentary ilem{s) must be resurveyed and
18 Ssubject o fnal approval from Insuranca Company

Acknowhadged by Repainer
Signature:

Data:

Fax : GBSB0BTT




Express Towing Services . -
vYou Call, We Tow - Fast Secured  Reliable
Bf& 27 Marina Crascant Velfe 21901 Singaporn 440027 G Reg, ho, 331320000 HE: 80 90092 Emalk jim kahsharmalboem W lmitieg BLUEm W WG AR PSS OWIN. 5
e o e, F oG
D R Yl Lt
Mo, 15605

(Q\SH SALEJWORK ORDER

Date: "’:F{ /f

E] Jump Start/Changing of battery

1:] Tyrefleplacement
@‘éi‘l}ﬁmakdcwﬂ
E] pilult/Basemeant
[] with Load/Cargo Box

WDO“T

[] transport Charge
E} Low Body Kit

E:] Door Opening Service

M:;m /qt’ t‘ o
\.:“l:;il%cle No: S U Qp (J..-’ [PV ]"-.:!rj::iel o *".*’RFClE?- /.S.

Tr:::{ w‘nlght] Contact No; Gf o0 q OT{-'-}EJ
llgcatir:rn: A NS ?JZ U'.’_}"' -

‘;11 S ,;'-"'j)' ' { s # &

:Cash A 11 <o Clthpr'; A{—MOLU-’L i
ﬁ:;;;ised By »_.—5_1‘ ek Bcfl?;v;rrnl{dcakme. \J'rf*"“""*lq 3 LEO}
il doon S AR ddn AL AT P e AT TR e a i bR EHER.

Mote: Vehiche is towed at owner's risk, The company accepts
athar misdemeanour to your vehick whilst heing tawed,

[[] crane Upswinch Out
r:_t Collect Doc/Kay

D Repo

D Woadlands and Tuas Checkpoint

no responsitbility for damages or



Opti-Shine

OPTI-SHINE PTE. LTD. re

35 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #06-47 Synergy@KB Singapore 417800
Tel: +65 6635 5656 Fax: +65 6635 4646 Mohbile: +65 8661 8747
Email: sales@opti-shine.com Website: www.opti-shing.com

TaN LL W

g No. 201227486G

Invoice / Cash Sale
No: OS-14185

Mame T el TR e e et =
Address N e Mobile , _6& }‘3_%_%,_’:‘;:. | S
- _ R _ Email e S -

_Uehicl'e No. T  Model - 1 Remarks :
'. Crn& oY | M 5300 | I
O oare sk S e R i T e D
i [ | Amount
| S.No Description l s l crs |
g o _%_.,__#.__,__, e e s e e T =g | SR
. = <& {) i e pf
| r*' L Par ) - e T I e
- ATl B ot BEDR S | .
| = e ~ ;, |
b ‘1 F_L;_.,'l:(_@i'l"_&ff T S i e e R _...i,_ ______ BEEET T s :
{ I ¢ SJ&‘;_“ o | 1 i
:i,__, — __.I_..l'ﬂ-'i'_,- g k\j_fi R e i i —————————hr b _1,__-_.__., - _,_.|.. S — _,...1

| ! _ 1
!r_ P i ..._i..._ e A SR L .T_ e —— -.i_ ....... g __.-;
i = ,_i S AT S e i e I _l.__u AT _I._.._-_ s ..|I
I - M B T
| | _ | |
~r .__,_.___'._..—-—. it b M R o e T = e —— o s i 4 e i S
| | T
e e — = — — ; —
{ g - B—— [T .
L - i e J

DEPOSIT

BALANCE PAYABLE

Terms and Conditions:
[y peoviding Your
aiks And plone gvan |
gour personal Infarmaticn

critagt piLiiEn te this fogm, you give L pernisgion o cak you i HEsRnnsE

§ e contact numier 15 Hisl=e 10

v witls any ehired pacty organization

et refundable or transferable.

y date of package shiall be fot a p

el b erpstad and made pavie 1o OPTI-SHINE PTE. LTD.

- Funcs transfer should be made to DES Current Account B, Ba03463537 and prost of teanler &
reforaice,

« Warranty is subject to Cuick Maintenance dong al feast nnce every & months.

o All Payments are due upon recaipl of this invoice,

e

e g Mo Call Registry, Yo Prvary i

Tha above agrecemant 13
Llees otherwise stated, the 2xpis

heques shir

TOTAL

o ikt ant T s,

PAID

toy Lty eeque st and ather marketing acklntiers via

yue weilt nevar sell, trade O $NATE

srioel ol 32 pannths fem aste ol agreantenii

o b amaiad (o saleaa shunacom for U

Z—

5

i e gt

OPTI-SHINE PTE. LTD.

Prelesginnal Caf Graaming { Bt Pegtection Systom

Customer’s Signature
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Dato : L0 | Ao
LS gy 8 3 -
Address : L Maohile ; . ir(.f[ﬂ{TE

gmail

Manae

| vehicle No, ' Model | H!“:r'nnfk';

NP g ] |
Sohpial \ [ Meveedes T

Amount

Description

=t .ﬂﬁf'f}""v e Mieteetioln Ty ezttt
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ot Tckepe ":'L”.I.'?:.v."{?'.-c:m"ﬁﬁ
i - A
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saloal 2006
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No 19-9607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref : (CS/FCIB021612/Asd3n2

416,01 CITv HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 Date: 26122018 ” ”IN”"'M“""N
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 7735 Veh. Inspected SG0Q 65150
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D18008503MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 30/11/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ 3300 c.C 2997
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. WDD2211542A087119 Colour BLUE
Odometer 191435 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GoCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/55 R17 LEAO & mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/55 R17 LEAD & rmm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/55 R17 LEAD & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/55 R17 LEAD & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY AND UNDERCARRIAGE.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  28/11/2018 Inspection Date 031272018
Survey held at  TAN LIM MOTOR PTELTD
51 DEFU LANE 10
SINGAPORE 539216
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 7 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1#D1-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6266 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 108B07198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No..1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGQ 6515U
; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |- e op {;Jl {‘;j]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LEFT FRONT DOOR (N) DENTED 1,550.00 1,550.00
1|LEFT FRONT DOOR SIDE INNER RUBBER (N) cuT 95.00 95.00
1|LEFT FRONT DOOR BOTTOM MOULDING (N) cuT 95.00 95.00
1|LEFT FRONT DOOR TOP HINGE (N) NOT NECESSARY 155.00 -
1|LEFT FRONT DOOR BOTTOM HINGE (N) NOT NECESSARY 155,00 :
1|LEFT FRONT FENDER (N} DISTORTED 1.380.00 1,380.00
1|LEFT FRONT FENDER MOULDING (N) MISSING 110.00 110.00
1|LEFT FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING (N) DEFORMED 201.00 201.00
1|LEFT FRONT FENDER INNER AIR GUIDE (M) MOT NECESSARY 175.00 -
1|FRONT SUSPENSION HEIGHT LEVEL SENSOR (N) NOT NECESSARY 400.00 2
1|LEFT FRONT LOWER ARM (N) BENT 916.00 814.00
1|LEFT FRONT UPPER ARM (N) BENT 916.00 795.00
1|LEFT FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER ASSY (N) NOT NECESSARY 4,200.00 .
1|LEFT FRONT KNUCKLE ARM (N BENT 1,200.00 1,200.00
1|LEFT FRONT WHEEL BEARING WITH HUB (N) DAMAGED 702.00 702.00
1|STEERING RACK AND PINION (M) NOT NECESSARY 8.030.00 -
1|LEFT FRONT TORSION ROD (N) NOT NECESSARY 800.00
1|LEFT FRONT RADIUS ROD (N) NOT NECESSARY 800.00 -
2| ANTI-ROLL BAR LINKS @$148.00 (W) NOT NECESSARY 266.00
1| ENGINE MOUNTING RIGHT (N) NOT NECESSARY 300.00 :
1|ENGINE MOUNTING LEFT (N) TORN 300.00 300.00
1|GEARBOX MOUNTING (N) NOT NECESSARY 116.00 -
1|ENGINE MOUNTING REAR (N) TORN 300.00 300.00
1|LEFT ROCKER PANEL GARNISH (N) DEFORMED 185.00 185.00
1|ENGINE SUSPENSION CROSS MEMBER (N) NOT NECESSARY 2,830.00 :
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -2,620.70 772.70
23,586.30 §,954.30
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|LEFT FRONT SPORT WHEEL RIM (SN) CuT 1,500.00 1,000.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18021612/Asd3n2
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i i §1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
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; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition
y i Workshop (§))| ($)
1|LEFT FRONT WHEEL TYRE (SN} NOT NECESSARY 550.00
2,050.00 1,000.00
LABOUR
TO TRANSFER OF DOOR FITTINGS AND PERFORM 250.00 B0.00
WATER SEEPAGET TEST
TO TRANSFER OF TYRE RIM AND ON WHEEL NOT NECESSARY £0.00 5
BALANCING
TO DROF FRONT SUSPENSION UNDERCARRIAGE 250,00 220,00
PARTS.REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF THE NECESSARY
PARTS.TO PERFROM FINAL CHECKING AND TESTING
TO REMOVE AND RENEW EMGINE AND GEARBOX 250,00 200,00
MOUNTINGS
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER 100.00 80.00
WHEEL ALIGNMENT,
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED 80.00 30.00
TO RUST-PROCFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS NOT NECESSARY 250.00 :
USING ONBOARD SCAN TOOL (OBD) PERFORM FULL 800.00 250.00
ENGINE DIAGNOSTIC CHEGK, TO CONFIQURE AND
CLEAR RESET SRS SERVICE LIGHT.
PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE 1,800.00 600.00
NECESSARY PORTION,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 1,000.00 700.00
PORTION
TOWING WITH KING DOLLY CHARGES. 200,00 150.00
TO REDO PAINT COATING ACCIDENT AFFECTED 350.00 350.00
PORTION (ADDITIONAL}).
5,510.00 2 560.00
GRAND TOTAL 31,146.30 10,614.30
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 8,450.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18021612/Asd3n2

MARKET VALUE: $83,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $42,892.00=NETT VALUE: $40,108.00

%g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repont is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on ihe front page of this Report.
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