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P Pie Ltd Company Registration No. 19960719ER

5] UBLAVE 1, 02-25 PAYA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 405933 TEL: (65 62563501 FAX ¢ (65) 6264315

vour Ref: D18008428MESH Date: 03 December 2018

Our Ref: CS/FC118021 567/Gsd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __GBH 9675C .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 30/11/2018 at the premises of M/s Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 8§ 7.477.96
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5% 4,551.04
“Check™ Items Amount : 8% 706.60
Market Value 1 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value :S%
Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 5 Days

Yours faithfully,
Xing Guo Qiang
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

b Raffies Quay 421-00 Singapore 048560
Tek {63 6222 2311 Fax |65} 6222 3547

M3 First Capital Insurance Limited comsy o 195

JDOI06C ST Reg. Ko, M2 00016764

Clai & Hotor Undsrwrising Degt: 36 Robinsan Road #16-01 Gty House Singapore 0580877

Tel {65) 6507 3B48 Fax (65) 6507 3849
wwwr mefirsicapital comsg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 27-11-2018 Our Ref No. D1800B8428MFSH
Accident Date 25-11-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHA3286. Third Party Vehicle. GBHI675C
Survey Location 10 TUAS AVENUE 18
Contact Person. LI LEWEI
Contact No. B8640637/ 97557336 Fax No. 68630425
Survey Type DIRECT SETTLEMENT:
Appointed

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315

Contact Number.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

GOLDBELL

Cc : Worksh Attention. NIL
R ENGINEERING PTE LTD '

Cc : TP Solicitor NA, TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Officer Incharge KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required




Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 11:12 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Ashlyn Chng; William Oh Soon Lee; Ramesh

Subject: Re: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

Dear Shirley,

We confirm finalise @ $ 4,656.48 @ 5 days of repairs before GS5T.

Thanks and Best Regards

ey — Brian Eng Kwok Long | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd
ustomer Service Advisor, Motor Claims

=

ID; +65 6864 0637 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
obile; +65 9755 7336 lWeh: hitp:/fwww.goldbell.com.sg

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com=>

Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 11:08:45 AM

To: Brian Eng Kwok Long; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Ashlyn Chng; William Oh Soon Lee; Ramesh

Subject: RE: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

Dear Brian,

Please re-confirm final fig & 4,656.48 @ 5 days of repairs before GST.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long [mailto:EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 10:45 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <guogiang@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia
Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Ashlyn Chng <AshlynChng@goldbell.com.sg>; William Oh Soon Lee <WilliamOhSL@goldbell.com.sg>; Ramesh
<Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

Dear Shirley & Guo Qiang,

Please refer to the attached for GBEB697L survey by LKK at Year 2016, The price for sticker 70km/H sticker
is already $20.

While the reverse sensor assy at year 2016 is $250, now already 3 year at the price 5280 is fair enough.
We sincerely hope the above explanation.

Can we finalise the amount @ 54686.48?7

Thanks and Best Regards,

Brian Eng Kwok Long | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd
Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims

DID: +65 6864 0637 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
Mobile: +65 9755 7336 | Web: hitp://www. goldbell.com.sg




From: Brian Eng Kwok Long
Sent: Wednesday, 24 April 2019 6:49:26 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Ashlyn Chng; William Oh Soon Lee; Ramesh
Subject: Re: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

Dear Shirley,
It is our standard pricing for number plate as 520 and reverse sensor assy for $280.

Can we finalise the amount @ $4686.487

We sincerely hope the above explanation will clarify your queries.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Brian Eng Kwok Long | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd
Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims

ID: +65 6864 0637 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
obile; +65 8755 7336 | Web: hitp:/fwww.goldbell.com sg

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 10:54:04 AM

To: Brian Eng Kwok Long; Ramesh; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Ashlyn Chng; William Oh Soon Lee

Subject: RE: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

Dear Brian,

Please re-confirm final fig $ 4,596.48 @ 5 days of repairs before G5T.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6756-3561 | emall: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long [mailto:EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 9:33 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com>; Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Guo Qiang
(LKKAuto) <guogiang@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ashlyn Chng <AshlynChng@goldbell.com.sg>; William Oh Soon Lee <WilliamOhSL@goldbell.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

Dear Shirley,

Kindly refer to the attached.

Thanks and Best Regards

rian Eng Kwok Long | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd
ustomer Service Advisor, Motor Claims

DID: +65 6864 0637 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
obile: +65 9755 7336 | Web: http://www.goldbell. com.sg

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 9:07:58 AM

To: Ramesh: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Guo Qjang (LKKAuto)
Cc: Ashlyn Chng; Brian Eng Kwok Long; William Oh Soon Lee

Subject: RE: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

Hi Ramesh,



Kindly send us before paint photo.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ramesh [mailto:Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 2:23 PM

To: guogiang@Ilkkauto.com; 'thinthin@lkkauto.com' <thinthin@lkkauto.com=>; 'Guo Qjang (LKKAuto)'
<GuoQjang@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: Ashlyn Chng <AshlynChng@goldbell.com.sg>; Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg>; William
Oh Soon Lee <WilliamOhSL@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

Importance: High

Hi Guo Qiang,

Up to today you did not reply our email.
Monday, March 18, 2019 8:05 PM
Wednesday, 6 March 2019 3:16 PM
Monday, 25 February 2019 7:45 PM
Monday, 18 February, 2:41 pm

This is a Third Party claim against First Capital Insurance,
As such we engage your surveyor service through Third Party Insurance as per 2016 NIMA Protocol.

Unfortunately, we did not receive any reply on your repair finalization confirmed amount since Feb 2015.
We hope to receive your reply soonest by 22 Apr 2019 (Monday).

Then after we shall seek payment directly to First Capital Insurance,
Hence you may answer directly to Insurer on your failure.

(Attached above is our intended “Letter of Demand” to Insurer - FY])

Regards.

Ramesh | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd
Senior Executive, Motor Claims

DID: +65 6864 0695 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
Maobile: +65 8157 8014 | Web: http:/iwww goldbell.com.sg




From: Brian Eng Kwok Long

Sent: Monday, March 18, 2019 8:05 PM

To: guogiang@lkkauto.com

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Ashlyn Chng <AshlynChng@goldbell.com.sg>
Subject: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

Dear Guo Qiang,
Kindly refer to the attached above.
Can we finalise the amount @ 54686.48?

Thanks & Best Regards,

rian Eng Kwok Long | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd
ustomer Service Advisor, Motor Claims

DID: +85 6864 0837 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
obile: +65 9755 7336 | Web: hitp://www.goldbell.com.sg




From: Brian Eng Kwok Long

Sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 3:16 PM
To: guogiang@lkkauto.com

Cc: Ramesh; Ashlyn Chng

Subject: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

Dear Guo Qiang,
Kindly refer to the attached above.
Can we finalise the amount @ $4686.48?

Thanks & Best Regards,

Brian Eng Kwok Long | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd
ustomer Service Advisor, Motor Claims

DID: +65 6864 0637 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
Mobile: +65 8755 7338 | Web: hitp./iwww.goldbell.com.sg




From: Brian Eng Kwok Long
Sent; Monday, 25 February 2019 7:45 PM

To: guogiang@Ikkauto.com
Cc: Ashlyn Chng; Ramesh

Subject: Finalise - GBH 3675 C

Dear Guo Qiang,

Kindly refer to the attached above.

Can we finalise the amount @ $4686.487
Thanks & Best Regards,

“iBrian Eng Kwok Long | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd
Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims

DID: +65 6864 0637 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
Mobile: +65 9755 7336 | Web: http://www.goldbell.com.sq

oo

SR
oay

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long

Sent: Monday, 18 February, 2:41 pm
Subject: Finalise - GBH 9675 C

To: guogiang@lkkauto.com

Ce: Ramesh, Ashlyn Chng

Dear Guo Qiang,
Kindly refer to the attached above.

Can we finalise the amount @ $4686.487



Thanks & Best Regards,
Brian Eng Kwok Long

|
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd

Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims

DID:

+65 6864 0637
| Tel:

+65 6861 0007
| Fax:

+65 6863 0425

Maobile:

+65 9755 7336

| Web:
http:/iwww.goldbell.com sg



Shirle! Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 3 December 2018 1:46 PM

To: ‘Karen Tan’; 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc SUR: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Suhjen:t: RE; SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D'IBU{]MEEMFSHH
Attachments: GBH 9675C - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Karen,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBH 9675C.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email; Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 51408933)

Erom: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailtu:admin-d@lkkaum.mm]

Sent: Thursday, 29 November 2018 9:39 AM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims'’ c:cwsmc:ton:Iairns@msﬁrstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008428MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

pPlease be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6B41-1972 | email: assignments@|kkanto.con | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS5 Maotor Claims [ma':Itc:-:cwsmutcrc!aims@msfirstcap‘ltaLcc-m.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 4:03 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008428MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team
Claim Workflow System
Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWw.avg.com




MIRMHA PARFICNE Rakata Frmirg

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

> Ty —
-] articLilars

Owner |ID Type: Business

Owner ID: 5400A

Vehicle No.: GBH9675C

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 03 Dec 2018

Vehicle Make: FIAT

Vehicle Model: FIORINO CARGO 1.3MTA E6 GLAZED
Primary Colour: Brown

Manufacturing Year: 2017

Engine No.: 225A20006494013
Chassis No.: ZFA22500006H33301
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $17,155.00

Original Registration Date: 16 Nov 2018

First Registration Date: 16 Nov 2018

Transfer Count: 0

$858.00

No

$0.00

|
s

15 Nov 2028

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $28,501.00

COE Rebate / mount; $28,358.00

Total Rebate Amount: $28,358.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Dec 2018

OK

hitpsiiivrlita gov.sgitalvifaction/enquireHebate By FublicBetore Uereginputl dFUNLG | IUN_ILSFUSUS0UY) | M
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MOTOR INSURANCE COVER NOTE

Wiereas the spplicont named In the Schedule below having prapesad far lssurance in respact of the Motar Vehicle deseribed in the
Schedule below the risk is hereby HELD COVERED in the terms of the Company’s usual form of Pollcy applicable thereta far the period a3
stazed below unless the cover be terminated by the Company by notice in writing in which case the insurance thereupon will cease and a
Frapartianate part of the annual premium atheryise payabla for such Insurance will by charged for the ime the Company has been an rigk.

Name of Insured: £\ T, MINT MBRT

DESCRIFTION OF MOTOR VEHICLE

Type of Vehicle: . Class ﬂescrlpﬁun:ﬁbgmmﬁk fm
Reglstered Number | “BE AovisED 3 Make: Prgs

Yaar of Registration: They (% Model Fraomap 2w

Seating Capacity: 7} _ Chassls Number: ZrannS 80006 HBR30|

Engine Capacity/Max Laden Welght:| 300 e Cﬂ'{ﬂ {DMQY) Englne Number NS00 nan b Hot3

Estimated Value: Market Value

COVERAGE OF MOTOR POLICY

Ty

PERIOC OF INSURANCE

ké[ulwﬁf ~te xsjnjﬁmﬂ‘\ .

VALIDITY PERICHD OF COVER NOTE

VALID FOa 30 CAYE FAOR DWTE OF 135S

HIRE-PLURCHASE OWMER

Goroean. Prusucrar. Seovces Tre o

W haraby certlly that this Cover Note Is issuad in accordance with the provigions of Park IV of the Aead Transpore Act 1987 (Malaysia)
Medor Vehicles {Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chaptér 189) (Republic of Singapaore).

Signed For And on Belalf OF

Signabure of the kalermediary

Date of lsue: Autharisad Passan

Billing AT BSletSiad . Allled Warld Asurance Comparny, Ltd
ALLIED WORLD ASSURANCE COMPANY, LTD (SINGAPORE BAANDH) 85 Floor T 850320 1163
Incorpmated in Bivreicd wits Brited Raliity 60 Anson Roed §38-0 £ igeatomasendeaccom
¢ Meogdetres Ansoan Ao
ool Singupore a70B14

Pape 6 of 19
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/. GOLDBELL GOLDBELL ENGINFZRING PTE LTD

i 7 ....., ias Tel +55 BEGY DOOT Fax, +85 6361 3676 (Salas)
|

J W Fax: +535 6853 0425 (Service) +05 8882 134T (Parts)
cosist ENGINEERING el it g
Ca Rag. Mo 1080030835
Industrial Vehicles, :
20,000 Sorved. And Counting.

Page 1.3
ESTIMATE |
Date T 26/11/2018 Reg No : GBHY9875C
To : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE Model ! 225.2LR.1 (444 BRONZE)
LIMITED
Attn. : Chassis No : ZFA22500006H33301
Office / Mobile Engine No 1 225A20006494013
Email Address Quotation Ne. : 76638
Ref. No. : GBE/SVC/SALES-4743/181126
From : MOTORVIVA PTE LTD D.0.A. : 25/11/2018
Attn. :  LILEWEI Policy No. : ADDOG148
Office / Mobile : +65 6864 D637 Claim Type : TP CLAIM - MSFCIS
Email [ FaxNo. : LiLewei@goldbell.com.sg Workshop ! 29 TANJONG PENJURU
S/N Part No Description Oty U/Price 2 NetPrice Ext Price
1 735666169 BUMPER, RR ' L 1 510.75 -10  459.68 459.68
2 735482370 TOW HOOK COVER X [}T’ 1 53.82 -10 48,44 48.44
3 1355231080 REAR BUMPER SUPPORT "!‘i' 1 150.48 -10 135.43 135.43 -~
4 1362666080 REAR BUMPER BRACKET LH ; NV 1 69.22 -10 62,30 62,30
5 1362665080 REAR BUMPER BRACKET RH 1 69.22 -10 62,30 62.30
6 1389334080 REAR DOOR - LHS _- 1  1,491,31 -10 1,342.18 1,342,18 .~
7 1355051080 TAILGATEHINGELH 2 3T 1 65.77 -10 59,19 59.19 .~
B 1388875080 DOOR CHECK - REAR X A 1 99.51 -10 89,56 89,56
9 735500163 DOOR INNER TRIM LHS & ?( Sm n 1 144,48 -10 130.03 130.03
10 1389751080 SEALING GASKET -WEATHERSTIP ?’ 1 420.94 -10  378.85 378.85
PARTS TOTAL : 2,767.96
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1 REAR NUMBER PLATE X s AAS 20.00
2 REAR NUMBER PLATE HOLDER X 1 20.00
3 SEALANT ./ (2“& 1 7 40,00 -~
4 "70 KM/H" STICKER ~ 1 7 Jo” 2000 _~
5 REVERSE SENSOR ASSY - ‘;44 X 1 0/5“, Qe 280.00 _-
PARTS TOTAL; 380.00
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GOLDBELL
ENGINEERING

Industrial Vehicles.
20,000 Served. And Counting.
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OOLDGELL

GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD
10 Tuas Avenus 18 Singapors 630884

Tal +55 G861 0007 Fax +00 BBG1 3676 [Sales)

Fax: +65 GABS 0425 (Service) +55 8362 1347 (Parts)
VWebsite: waw goldbed com.gg

Ca. Aeg. No 10300386306

Page 203
ESTIMATE |
Date : 26/11/2018 Reg No : GBH9675C
To : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE Maodel * 225.2LR.1 (444 BRONZE)
LIMITED
Attn. : Chassis No ¢ ZFAZ2500006H33301
Office / Mobile Engine No i 225A20006494013
Email Address  : Quotation No. : 76638
Ref. No. : GBE/SVC/SALES-4743/181126
From : MOTORVIVA PTE LTD D.0.A. : 25/11/2018
Attn. : LILEWEI Policy No. : ADDOG6148
Office / Mobile : +65 6864 0637 Claim Type : TP CLAIM - MSFCIS
Email /Fax No. : LiLewei@goldbell.com.sg Workshop : 29 TANJONG PENJURU
LABOUR CHARGES
1 TO CHECK FOR AND RECTIFY WIRING |26 18000 -~
FAULTS, TO CONDUCT DIAGNOSTIC
CHECK
2 TO REMOVE AND REFIX DAMAGED (_éag) [2¢® 240000
PARTS, CUT, WELD, PANEL BEAT,
STRAIGHTEN & REALIGN, ETC
3 TO REMOVE AND REFIX DOOR ~  180.00 —
COMPARTMENTS
4 TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR DOOR ~  120.00 -
GLASS
5 TO PUTTY, CLEAN, SPRAY PAINT AND (},5" a) 74 & 1400.00 .~
POLISH, ETC
6 SUNDRIES Wit 20 50.00 _~
LABOUR TOTAL : 4,330.00
g D% : SUB-TOTAL : 7,477.96
; 4
&( GST @ 7% for $ 7,477.96 523.46
Pﬁ‘l" l”"" % GRAND TOTAL (S$) : 8,001.42
it et et
LKK Avto Consultants hence notify
the Rep.irer of the following:
. GI,.,,.P - Wﬂwl # To fesu: oy befora/atier spray painling
bb"‘b & » To dis s} during resuney
» Parts ¢ nlirmation
i » Third party surye thout Prejudice” basis
% G “ I 8 » No iBeqal modificat iliowed
» Supplenentary em(s) must be resurveyed pnd
Is subject 1o final approval from Insurance Company
Acknowladged by Repainer
Sagnature:
Diates
’ Y il
bASATE S5 L4
s‘r-ﬁ!”l *_:‘m";;.'; ...%Iu._f.r..
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ssos ENGINEERING

Industrial Vehicles.
20,000 Served, And Counting.

GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTELTD
10 Tuas Avenus 18 Singapore 636834

Tial +65 6B61 D007 Fax: +65 6861 3676 (Sales)
Fax: +65 6863 0425 (Service) +55 6062 1347 (Parts)
Website: www goddball.com.eg

Co Rag Moo 1BAD0SAE3G
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ESTIMATE l
Date :  26/11/2018 Reg No : GBH9575C
To :  MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE Model : 225.2LR.1 (444 BRONZE)
LIMITED
Attn. 3 Chassis No : ZFAZ22500006H33301
Office / Mobile : Engine No : 225A20006494013
Email Address Quotation No. : 76638
Ref. No. : GBE/SVC/SALES-4743/181126
From : MOTORVIVA PTE LTD D.0.A. i 25/11/2018B
Attn. : LILEWEI Policy No. : ADDOG6148
Office /f Mobile : +65 6864 0637 Claim Type t TP CLAIM - MSFCIS
Email f FaxNo. : LiLewel@goldbell.com.sg Waorkshop : 29 TANJONG PENJURL
PREPARED BY : LILEWEI
DATE f TIME :
SURVEYOR :
MOBILE NO :
OFFICE FAX NO .
EMAIL ADDRESS :

EXCESS AMOUNT :

REPAIR TYPE : PART-BY-PART / LUMPSUM
AUTHORISATION @ AUTHORISED / NOT AUTHORISED
RE-SURVEY : BEFORE PAINT / AFTER PAINT
MO, OF DAYS
REMARKS :
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Matorviva Pte Ltd

A maenbier of Goltsd] Engiscaring

MOTORVIVA PTE LTD

Mo Oflice, & Tuaa Ave 18 Singapore 038862 Tal GGHE0 2518
Finance 8 Tuas Ave 10 Sngapors G2EES2 Tel 6501 0007 Fox: GBSZ 3500
Fiat Prefesaianal: 01 Uy Avenue 2 #01:11 Smpopore 400690 Tel: 0605 2518 Fax: 0501 7955
Iveca B Tuss Ave 18 Singapore 020682 Tel: BE6 0804 Fax 0BO1 3670

Wahsite: wws, moloniva com 5g
Go. fog,. Ma VRISATRIAZ

Page 1/ 2
TAX INVOICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED GST Reg No. M3-0002514-E
6 RAFFLES QUAY #21-00 Invoice No. MXI00026142
SINGAPORE 048580 i
Alfn: MOTOR CLAIM DEPT ireyolcs Pds. 26-03-2019
Account No. Coo000247
Quotation No. TEG638
Work Order No, 1 701916
Service Centre, 8 TUAS AVE 18
Agreement No, ¢ MV-3720
Reg No :  GBH9B7EC
Chassis Mo ZFA22500006H33301
Engine Na 225A20008494013
Model Mo y 2252 R.1 (444 BERONZE)
Mileage : 805
SRR No :

ACCIDENT REPAIR: GBE/SVC/SALES-4743/181126

DATE OF ACCIDENT: 25/11/2018

POLICY NO.: AC0DG148

¥t TP CLAIM - MSFCIS ™™

ITEM 1: TO CHECK FOR AND RECTIFY WIRING FAULTS, TO CONDUCT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK

ITEM 2: TO REMOVE AND REFIX DAMAGED ARTS, CUT, WELD, PANEL BEAT, STRAIGHTEN & REALIGN, ETC
ITEM 3: TO REMOVE AND REFIX DOOR COMPARTMENTS

ITEM 4: TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR DOOR GLASS

ITEM 5: TO PUTTY, CLEAN, SPRAY PAINT AND POLISH, ETC

ITEM 6: SUNDRIES

Description Qry UlPrice Disc  NetPrice Ext Price
BUMPER RR 1 459.68 N 459.68 459,68
REAR DOOR LHS 1 1342.18 N 1342.18 1342.18
TAILGATE HINGE LH 1 59.19 N 59.19 59.19
SUPPORT 1 13543 N 135.43 135.43
SEALANT 1 40.00 N 40.00 40.00
“70 KM/H" STICKER 1 (@ 2000 N 20.00 20.00
REVERSE SENSOR 1 %0p 280.00 N 280.00 280.00
LABOUR CHARGES (REFER 1 120.00 N 120.00 120.00
TO ITEM 1)
LABOUR CHARGES (REFER 1 1200.00 N 1200.00 120000
TO ITEM 2)
LABOUR CHARGES (REFER 1 180.00 N 180,00
TO ITEM 3) -

U weco

ST




MOTORVIVAPTELTD

Main Office: & Tuss Ave 18 Singagora 628892 Tel G065 2518

Einenca 8 Tuas Ave 10 Snpapore 638393 Tel: 6561 000T Fax: GEGZ 3500

. Fiat Profacgisnal G4 Ut Avanus 2 48141 Singapora 400093 Tek 8605 2318 Fax 0581 7038

l:

1 Tuos Ave 18 5i EIOBS2 Tel: 6843 £364 Fax GBG1 3375
R LW"” R D et '.r:e':ana i odoriva 'l:u:?!g
Hﬂfﬂrﬂfﬂﬂ Prﬂ- I"f Ca Rog B3 1RESQTE1ST
A massingr of Gotibe® Engineoring Fage -
=
Description QTY  UPrce Disc  NetPrice Ext Price
LABOUR CHARGES (REFER 1 120,00 N 120.00 120.00
TO ITEM 4)
LABOUR CHARGES (REFER 1 700.00 N 700.00 700.00
TO ITEM 5)
LABOUR CHARGES {(REFER 1 30.00 N 30,00 30.00
TO ITEM 6)
Parts Charges: 4686.48
Sub Total: 4686.48
GST@ 7.00 % 328.05
E.&0.E
TOTAL 5014.53

Please make all cheques payable to MOTORVIVA PTE LTD.
When making payment, please quote our Invoice numbers.
No recaipts will be issued for Chagua Payments.

erms and ditic alas
[nterest at 1.5% per month will be charged on overdue account

This is & computer generated document, Mo signature is required.




' V4 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-V 51 Ubi Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 62568 3561 FAX: 6255 4315

Reg. Mo; 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-3607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref © CS/FCI18021567/Gsd3n2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Dems: Aeleang MHM“‘”"‘““INH
Code . FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 3258J Veh. Inspected GBEH 9675C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18008428MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 2BM1/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model FIAT FIORING c.c 1248
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. ZFAZ2500006H33301 Colour BROWN
Odometer 757 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/65 R15 PIRELLI 9 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 PIRELLI 2 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/85R15 PIRELLI 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/65R15 PIRELLI 9mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  25/11/2018 Inspec.tinn Date 30/11/2018
Survey held at 48 CHANGI SOUTH STREET 1
Repairer GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 12-9607198-R Page MNo.1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBH 9675C
- ey Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rﬁhup?;}} li%u
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMFER,RR DEFORMED 510.75 510.75
1|TOW HOOK COVER NOT NECESSARY 53.82 -
1|REAR BUMPER SUPPORT BENT 150.48 150.48
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET LH NOT NECESSARY 69.22 -
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET RH NOT NECESSARY 69.22 -
1|REAR DOOR-LHS BUCKLED 1,481.31 1,491,231
1|TAILGATE HINGE LH BENT B65.77 65.77
1|DOOR CHECK-REAR NOT NECESS5ARY 29.51 -
1|DOOR INNER TRIM LHS NOT NECESSARY 144 48 -
1|SEALING GASKET-WEATHERSTRIP NOT NECESSARY 420.54 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -307.55 -221.83
2,767.95 1,926.46
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN} NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE HOLDER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1| SEALANT (SN} MECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1]"TOKM/H" STICKER (SN} NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|REVERSE SENSOR ASSY (SN) DAMAGED 280.00 250.00
1|SUNSRIES (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
430.00 340.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK FOR AND RECTIFY WIRING FAULTS, TO 180.00 120.00
CONDUCT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK.
TO REMOVE AND REFIX DAMAGED 2,400.00 1,200.00
PARTS,CUT WELD.PANEL BEAT, STRAIGHTEN &
REALIGM,ETC,
TO REMOVE AND REFIX DOOR COMPARTMENTS 180.00 180.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR DOOR GLASS. 120.00 120.00
TO PUTTY CLEAN SPRAY PAINT AND POLISH,ETC, 1,400.00 T00.00
4,280.00 2,320.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18021567/Gsd3n2
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Page No.2 of 2
GRAND TOTAL T7.477.95 4,656.48
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 4,656.48]
Report Ref No. CS/FCI18021567/Gsdan2

KING GUO QIANG ADRIAN LING WAI PING

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,MMATAI

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solety for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

Mo llabiity of responsibifity whatsoaver, in contact or tort. is accented bo any third party who may reply on the Bepen wholly of In part, ANy therd )
Beport, in wiobe o in part, does S0 at his or her vwn sk,




