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. W Consultants
B A& % Pim Lid Company Regisiration Mo, 10060T10ER

! U!! Auto

31 UR1AVE 1, #02-25 PAY A 1K1 INDUST RIAL PARK, SINGAVORE 05933 TEL : (&) 62363561 FAX {10651 62304315

Your ref: D18008380MFSH

Our Ref: CS/FCI18021564/R1vd3 Date :3/12/2018
The Motar Claims Department

M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SHD 1649G

We thank you for your instruction on 28/11/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
29/11/2018 at the premises of M/s PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 §$5,718.02
Revised Estimate Amount - §§5.046.64
"Check” Items Amount - 5%141.38
Market Value 1 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
n/s portion

Comments/Present Status:
Dramages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited = Reg Mo 1950001060 51 Beg too M2-0001675:9
& Raltles Quay #21-00 Singapore D48580
Tek {B65) 6222 2311 Fax (65)6222 3547

Claimm & Motor Underwsiting Dept: 36 Robinson Rozd #LE-01 Oty House Sangapore 0BBB7 7
Tal: (65) 6507 348 Fax: |G5| B507 3840
wowrwi. msfirsicapital. com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
26-11-2018 Our Ref No. D12008330MFSH
23-11-2018 Claim Type. Third Party

SH75TTP

Third Party Vehicle. SHD1849G

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02

GOH WEE DEK
B2148880/ 65446682

Fax No. 62141511

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA,
NA

Fax No. 68416315

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE
SERVICES PTELTD

NA

JOANNEY

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

Attention. MNIL

TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 3 December 2018 2:14 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc 'Joanne Yong Lai fong’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008380MFSH/, SHD 16496
Attachments: SHD 1649G PREL! ADVISED pdf

Dear Sir'Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHD 1649G
Date of survey: 29/11/18
Number of days : 8 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 5256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Thursday, 29 November 2018 9:47 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' -«tcwsmﬂtorclaims@msﬁrstcapital.mm.sg:-; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com=
Cc: 'Joanne Yong Lai fong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008380MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From;: CW5 Motor Claims [maiItu:cwsmumrcIaims@msfirstcagital.cnm.sgi

sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 5:44 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTD_CDM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmutorclaims@msﬁrstcapttal.cum sg>; Joanne Yong Lai fong
<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008380MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded int

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

o CWS for your perusal.

PS: This is a system generated mail. please do not reply to this mail.

. AUG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.

WwWw.ave.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 4.04 PM

To: Goh Wee Dek; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Ce: SUR; Gary Shi

Subject: RE: SHD1649G- FINALIZE-DOA: 23/11/2018
Dear Wee Dek,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm PxP $6,041.52 & 8 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premiertaxi.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 2:32 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Gary Shi <gary.shi@premiertaxi.com>
Subject: SHD1649G- FINALIZE

Dear Rasul
Enclosed supplementary bill, check item and before paint.
Please confirm PxP $6,041.52 & 8days.

Regards

Goh Wee Dek
Assistant Claims Manager
Premier Automotive Services Pte Lid

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 068 | DID: 6544 6682 | Fax: 6214 1511

Visit us at: www.premiertaxi,com.Sg

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s} and may contain confidentiat or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the criginal message.

&4 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION

o



27-Mov-18

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443

TEL: 63446676 / 65446689 FAX: 62141511
CO. REG:200707743D  GST REG:200707743D

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR HYUNDAI I30A REGN NO: SHD 1649 G

1pe
1pc
1 pc
1 pc
1 pc
1pe
1pc
T ps

SINETT

1 set
1 set
1 set

1 set

Front bumper Tﬂrﬂ-‘/ l ié \”{
Front n/s side bracket M= - @ﬁp

& 811.11
5 32.51
nis headlamp €4~ §  1,53157
Eront nis fender T~ «~ lmeS/ 3 514.02
oo K Y Qoo
Front n/s fender inner shield - ~ 3 176.72
Front n/s fender lamp 7o 8 [9011/) $ 32.10
Front nis door handle- outside ¢t 7 ] 105.00
nis mirror Assy 9ol 7 '? ’ () $ 749,49
S 3,952.52
? Less 20% g 790.50
| ) fr—* $  3,162.02
is door sticker Aes $ 100,00
Front n/s fender sticker £~ g 3 30.00
Front bumper clips A~ #~ 3 48.00
Front n/s fender inner shield clips Ae Fid S 28.00
Sundry N $ ;o-cﬁ 2
Ta labour charge for dismantle and renew the accident
damaged parts. Including knock-cut, straighten, repair,
reshape and adjust of front n/s door, rear n/s door, rear n/s
fender, rear bumper 3 M‘?m
To putty and spray painting on front bumper, front n/s fender,
front n/s door, rear nis doar, rear n/s fender, rear h?L‘F:I'I"IpEI' % 1 ,}Bﬂfﬁﬁ f oo
To apply rustproofing on the repaired and replaced panels $ zg.a‘ﬁu a=
i $ 5718.02
: & notify
VoRean o 611390
{ ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SLLBJEGTED 10 GST]
E Drices ar g
THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST S‘FW n:'z,ﬂorﬂym.ung 2
ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES.|  « o fionsl oo I
® Supplemer tsms i v
L E'-'I-'h:"!"I to final approva I‘!'.H"' .-f:r*: :?Emn"'
Acknowledged by Repairer
Signaturg
Dhate




'V Vg LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;_‘:. ;; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

= TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No 19960T198R G5T Reg. Mo, 19-9607196-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18021564/R1vd3n2
$16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 063877 Ding; SvREae ”"‘lu"‘l"mllnm
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. §H 7577P Veh. Inspected SHD 1649G
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D18008380MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 281172018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAIIZD1EA c.c 1582
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. TMADZB1UVHI134125 Colour GREY
Odometer 109555 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 MAX XIS B mm
L/H Front Tyre |[195/65R15 MAXXIS 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyrg 195/65 R15 MAXXIS & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/65 R15 MAXKIS 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 23/11/2018 Impucﬁnn Date 29M11/2018
Survey held at KOMOCO MOTOR 253 ALEXANDRA ROAD
Repairer PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTII.|MTED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR 8 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubd Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 19560T198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.;1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 1649G
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ o [:}} ﬁi
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER TORN B11.11 B811.11
1|FRONT N/S SIDE BRACKET WECESSARY 3251 32.51
1|n/s HEADLAMP CRACKED 1.531.57 153157
1|FRONT NS FENDER BUCKLED 514.02 514.02
1|FRONT NS FENDER INNER SHIELD SERVICEABLE 176.72 -
1|FRONT N/S FENDER LAMP BROKEMN 3210 3210
1|FRONT N/S DOOR HANDLE-QUTSIDE SCRATCHED 105.00 105.00
1|NS MIRROR ASSY SCRATCHED 748.49 749 49
1|SUPPORT PANEL (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 1,243.60 1,243.60
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,039.22 -1,003.88
4 156 90 4015.52
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET N/S DOOR STICKER (SN} NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
1|SET FRONT N/S FENDER STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 48.00 48.00
1|SET FRONT N/S FENDER, INNER SHIELD CLIPS {5”} MECESSARY 28.00 28.00
1|SUNDRY (SN} NECESSARY 50.00 20.00
256.00 226.00
LABOUR
TO LABOUR CHARGE FOR DISMANTLE AND RENEW THE S00.00 T00.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS.INCLUDING KNOCK-
OUT STRAIGHTEN,REPAIR RESHAPE AND ADJUST OF
FRONT N/S DOOR REAR N/S DOOR,REAR NIS
FENDER REAR BUMPER.
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OM FROMT 1,200.00 1,000.00
BUMPER FRONT N/S FENDER FRONT N/S DOOR REAR
N/S DOOR,REAR N/S FENDER REAR BUMPER
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING ON THE REPAIRED AND 200.00 100.00
REPLACED PANELS
2,300.00 1,600.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,712.80 6,041.52

Report Ref No. CS/FCHB021564/R1vd3n2
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Page No..2 of 2
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 6,041.52

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18021564/R 1vd3n2

M % g‘
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATA|

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solaky for the use and banedit of the Cliend named on the frond page of this Report.
any third party wheo may ree




