Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

#

From: Tan Lee Gek {Auto Svcs/Claims & |1A/Claims & |A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 May 2019 11:26 AM

To: CS A Teamn; Admin A

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 24/11/2018 involving SHB 1215K & PC 1540X (China
Taiping's insured) Our Ref: TAX/11/18/2110/lg

Attachments: TAX 11 18 2110.pdf

Dear All,

We guantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of Repair 51,150.00
Loss of Rental SE71.19 | 6.5 daysx $103.26 )
Loss of Income $390.00 | 65 dayx 560.00 )
LTA Search Fee $7.00
Total $2,218.19

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repair invoice
2] Proof of rental rate
3} GlA report
4} Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) LTAsearch
6) Hirer's letter of authorisation

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
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. Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 6:04 PM

To: 'raizad65@gmail.com’

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. PC (540X AND 5HB 1213K
ALONG WOODLANDS ON 24.11.2018

Attachments: Addendum form PC 1504X pdf

Our Ref: CC6/CT118021486/R1fb3
Your Veh: PCIF40X

IDZY TRANSPORT SERVICES
Policy Holder

Attn: Mr Suraizad Bin Sulaimi

Dear Mr Suraizad,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. PC :5+0X AND SHB 1215K ALONG WOODLANDS ON
24.11.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distnbution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.
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AUTOMOTIVE

Date: Wfl” J"J-' o

Our Ref, No.:
Letter of Authorisation
| Geel"Yoks  HBMNG | (NRIC No.: HGG‘HE{J . ) the

registered hirer / relief driver / taxi share driver of SMRT taxi registration number
3HB 1345 K - hereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

(“AutoSvs”) to deal with all matters arising out of the accident between my taxi
and PC. ISHO %X happened on ﬂ“!]g#ir.: ol oAy |
along __ WwWeodkaeD CEMIER P .

(the “Accident”’) on my behalf, including but not limited to instituting and any claims or
proceedings against such party or parties (as AutoSvs deems fit in its absolute

discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability, damages or

action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negotiate, resolve
and settie any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including but not limited
to doing any act or executing any document or signing the Discharge Voucher on my
behalf as may be required.

Name é""{ " \{u‘“* WC .~ Signature:
NRICNo, .. (6435 /Y .

Tel No. ST QHQE‘SH ..........

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

FR-AS-CLM-D2 REV 3



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

I, SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party claimant™) of _BLK 60 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 (S) 757705 (address). owner of SHB 1215K (vehicle no.) hereby

authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with

respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SHB
1215K that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 24/11/2018 (date) along

WOODLANDS CENTRE ROAD (location) involving vehicle no/s _?C {G&D% _ (“the accident”).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.
| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this _ 0 (day) of !mc\ﬂ (month) 20 |4 (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™

{(with chop if applicable) {with chop)



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Policy No @ [DMBISN30Z3621800 Claim No : SMM1BDDE57E/C02
Claimant : SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Amount  581,920.00

DOLLARS OME THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED TWENTY ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid te mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by mefus through an accident invelving

Claimant Wehicle MNo. @ SHBE 12153K

Insured Vehicle Ne. @ PC 15408
pate of Loss 2471172018
Flace of Accident : WOODLANDS CENTRE ROAD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PFTE. LTD. and/or

Insured HName : IDEZY TRANSPORT SERVICES
Driver HName © SURAIZAD BIN SULAIMI

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by meSus arising out of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment iz made without admissien of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPCRE) PTE. LTD.

(1) Globkal Sum 35 1,920.00

TOTAL = ¢ & & & ¥ & & Sameidy & B 1,5%20.00

Claimant Mame :

HRIC No : mm F_

Signature T Pate * 3ﬂ fo Img

* This Discharge Veucher applies only 1o e chaimant's clam

af WS propary damage and will nat afect his personal

meles Clawn Arior drinsured losses claem n 3 lales date
ruriher, he Sefement 1erms nimsn should not be used @5
3 avidence 10 prejadce bo the clamants personat INjUries
clEim andize giber uninsured losses claim ateing of the

| Suteect maler in fhas aclion,
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BMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
@m 251 Borth Bridge Road Singapore 179102
Tel: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247
.a-"—':—"‘-.,_

AUTOMOTIVE .
Tax Invoice

Customer Code: 3000063 GST Reg No. : MR-BS00001-7
CRN i 1990042802

SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD Invoice Ho. = IV1SDS00051
Date : D6.05,2019

Block Unit Vehicle Mo. : SHB1Z15K

Your Ref No. : TAX/11/18/2110

60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK Ed Cur BRef Ho. : 24098903
SINGAPORE 757705 Terms : 30 Days
Description oty Unit Add / (Disceount) Amount
Cost % Amount
LUMPF SUM AMOUNT FOR EEPAIR 1.00 3 1,150.00
AS PER SURVEYCOR'S RECOMMENDATIONM
GRAND TOTAL 3 1,150.00

Femark :

Make /Model : TOYOTA PRIUS
Accident Date : 2%.11.2018

H.B. Paymant by chequa should be crossed and
made payabla to "SMRT Autcmotive Services Pte Ltd',
Ho receipt will ba issusd unless requasted. N_,
—— /.- J____""-s\li; —
RButhorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1/1 E. & 0.2



& SMRT

SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref: TAX/T1/18/2110
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 04/12/2018

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 1215K & PC 1540X ON 24/11/2018 ALONG
WOODLANDS CENTRE ROAD

This is to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHB 1215K is $103.26 per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
SMRT

for Manager
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11 RS A Wehirde Hiih

Enquire Transaction History

|.ag Date Time: 36 Nov 2018/ 11:24:29
Assel Type: Wihicle Transaction Amount:
Asset D PC 1540
Transaction Type. 1B.92 Insurance Frguiry [GIRO Fayment} Channel:
User I0: ESASEAHO - BALCISH BINTE ABDUL Business Transaction
FALIL Heference No.
.- Search Date / Time: 24 Mov 201805 25:00
Ineurance Company: C1IINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) PTELTD

-« Infarmation displayed is correct as at the log date and time.

Enquirc Related Logs OK

ATES:I ., eV, SMAIVIIBCHONIUDRGENCY | MLGGLISING 1 UM | IUN LS auiugEL

£7.4%

External Agency
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