Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 November 2018 5:36 PM

To: '‘Ngian, Kelvyna'

Cc: SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Subject: RE: Our re:MOMVC00000050302 ACCIDENT ON 20.11.2018 BETWEEN SLL 9565Y
AND insd GY 4978M ALONG THE SERVICE ROAD AT ENTERPRISE HUB

Attachments: SLL 9565Y - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Kelvyna,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLL 9565Y.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 2:41 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref:MOMVYC00000050302 ACCIDENT ON 20.11.2018 BETWEEN SLL 9565Y AND insd GY 4978M
ALONG THE SERVICE ROAD AT ENTERPRISE HUB

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed repairer arrange survey on 28/11/2018.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna [mailto:Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 2:06 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Our ref:MOMVC00000050302 ACCIDENT ON 20.11.2018 BETWEEN SLL 9565Y AND insd GY 4978M ALONG
THE SERVICE ROAD AT ENTERPRISE HUB

Hi team



TP survey please. Our insured has not report.

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: gerald@singhnco.com <gerald@singhnco.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2018 12:00 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: annabelle lim90@hotmail.com

Subject: [External] RE: ACCIDENT ON 20.11.2018 BETWEEN SLL 9565Y AND insd GY 4978 M ALONG THE SERVICE
ROAD AT ENTERPRISE HUB

Importance: High

Our Ref: SC.GMW.2051.18.05
Your Ref: GY 4978M

APPOINTMENTOF SURVEYOR FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION

Dear Kelvyna,

CLAIM BY SEE CHYE HENG ROLAND, NRIC NO. $8947623B
THE OWNER OF SLL 9565Y AGAINST OWNER/DRIVER OF GY 4978M

We refer to your email of 26 November 2018.

Our instructions are to agree to the appointment of No. 5 on your list LKK Auto Consultants for the conduct of the
PRI.

As previously stated in our earlier email, our client’s motorcar is presently located at the repairer’s workshop,

Glockewerke

c/o 48, Toh Guan East, #07-97
Enterprise Hub

Singapore 608586

Tel: 81126485

Email: annabelle lim90@hotmail.com
Attn: Annabelle Lim

And, you may contact Annabelle Lim who has been copied on this email directly to arrange for the PRI.

Yours faithfully,
Gerald Martin Wee

SINGH & CO.

77, High Street, #10-09,
High Street Plaza,
Singapore 179433.

Tel: +65 6338 3766
Fax: +65 6338 3762
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recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWWw.avg.com



