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- 1‘. n Piw Lid Campany Registratian Mo 1006071987
S1UKLAVE 1L #0225 BAYA L BIINDUSTRIAL PARK: SINGAPORE 08935 TEL @ (0651 62203501 FAN @ (065) 6220115
Your ref: D1B0083I9IMESH

Our Ref: CS/FCI1B021420/R.1vd3 Date :10/12/2018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REFORT OF VEHICLE NO.SKK 3288D

We thank you for your instruction on 27/11/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned

711272018 at the premises of M/s CYCLE & CARRIAGE IND PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8$8.576.75
Revised Estimate Amount : 557,634,583
"Check" Items Amount : 5817.13
Market Value 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the

ofs front portion

rear

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor



H H M5 First Capital Insurance Limited comeg bio 1950005060 G5T Reg. Me M2 00016755
MS‘FII’StCEPltEI B Raffies Quay 421-00 Singapare 048580

Tel (65) 6222 2311 Fox: (G5)6222 3547

Claims & Menor Underwiiting Depe 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City Howse Singapore DEEATT
Tet (65) 6507 3848 Faoc [B5)ES07 3845

wwie, mafirstcapitalcom,sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 26-11-2018 Our Ref No, D18008391MFSH
Accident Date 24-11-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHA9342D Third Party Vehicle, SKK3288D
Survey Location PANDAN LOOP SERVICE CENTER 188 PANDAN LOOP
Contact Person. ALAN QUEK
Contact No. 67714377/ 91865112 Fax No. 68721272
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:

inted
ARpoInia LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Flease submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cc : Worksh tion. Ml

M INDUSTRIES PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA, TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
B e e s e B — = =8 TR S SR A= 2 R

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Manday, 10 December 2018 12:44 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Sithara'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008391MFSH/1, SKK 32BEBD
Attachments: SKK 3288D PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKK 3288D
Date of survey: 7/12/2018
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 1:33 PM

To: 'CWS5 Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008391MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignmentae@ | kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapi
Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 11:49 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008391MFSH/1

.com.sg]

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System
Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ A"G. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: Www. avgE.com
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» Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:;

Cwner 1D
Vehicle Details

Vehicle Na.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Frimary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Dec 2018

PARFINOF Rakhata Frmiire

Singapore NRIC
3473F

SKK3288D

Mo

10 Dec 2018
MERCEDES BENZ

SLK 200 KOMPRESSCR
White

2008
27195431061943
WDB1714452F196054
135.0 kW (181 bhp)
$50,285.00

28 Nov 2008

28 Nov 2008

4

$50,285.00

Forfeited

$0.00

27 Moy 2028

E - Open Category
10

$32,121.00
$32,005.00
$32,005.00

OK ﬂ‘P‘,JvJ

hipsiivriita.gov.sgiitanriacton/enguireKebateByHublicBetore Uereginput/FUNG HON_1IU=FU30400d | |

n



Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage

Industries Pte Limited

ESTIMATE FOR SKK3288D
Wenicle & Documeani Information

""x\
( MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED WIP No 28724
| Reg No/Reg Date SKK3288D [/ 28M1/2008
MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT Date In'Mileage / 0
36 ROBINSON ROAD #16-01 ;
CITY HOUSE Chassis No WDEB1714452F 196054
SINGAPORE 068877 Engine Mo 27195431061943
65073848 MakeModel MB/SLE 200 K ROADSTER (MEW G
-7 ¥4 ColourTrim 021 197 Dbsidian B1,/ 048 801 Black
Account Mo Terms DateTime Printed CSE Operator
WF001862 Credit  26/11/2018/ 12:16 40 305 / Alan Quek Ai Lun
Description of Goods / Services Qity Unit Price  Disch Amaunt
M BFNSUN
POLICY NO/ACC DATE :GAZ62564 // 22-11-2018
DRIVE IM:Z6-11-2018 // TP CAR NO:SHARO342D (FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE )
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY: o\ \

BY /AUTHRIZED ON
& BPILAB
USE XENTRY TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS & RESET MEMORY TO
STANDARD SETTINGS.NETT
5 BPHSUB
SURRLY& TRANSEER-IRC FRONT RIGHT RIM
PURCHASE ORDER NOD:

/330.00//
H“"“X 60.004~

A BPILAB 7~ 580.00
INSPECT & CONDUCT WHEEL ALTGNMENT.NETT fﬂ 25
A BPILAB 0'1{{1' & @ A 24060
REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT BUMPER, FRONT RIGHT FENDER & REMOVE FRONT Lj*'
SUPPORT ASSY COMPONENTS & REFTNISH. Lff 'I'.)a-‘
A BPIRES ?Wv‘b ] 2070 1586700
RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER & FRONT RIGHT. FENDER G
M RH/F FEWDER s - 1.00 836.76 00.00 | E€3'Y¥ER36.76
/ A
M RH/F INTERMEDIATE LAYER T )& 1.00 17.13 00.00 17.13
M RH/F FENDER EMBLEM au:)( AN 1.00 144.79 00.00 15,1479
M FRT BUMPER Qe ~~ e 1.00 1396.00 00.00 | / %+ Y1395.00
M RH/F BUMPER BRACKET *5-"l<§§- 1.00 61.92 00.00 |, ., 61.92
M RH/F DISC WHEEL oo 1.00 1240.15 00.00 &b 1240, 15
W 13T Endu
1PL 0186 5112 72 1272
Email: alan.oicke: ST LC.COIm AR
6 éé 2631-32
Confirmed & accepted by
Nett 8,576.75
7% GST on 8576.75 600.37
Total Payable 9,177.12

Autharized signatory and company stamp

Validity of this estimate 13 14 days from date of guote. This is a computer penerated documest, ne signature is required.

Estimated costs queted are eacluding S5T. We would mention that the abeve eitimate i: basod oo our tnitial inspection amd doss mot nclude any additional parts or labeur which may be
required after ropair work has commenced. Occasionally wers or demaged parts ere discowered after work has started and needed Tor repairs or replacement. Howewer, thould this sccur,
wi wolld adwide you. Please be inforesd that o deposit of 500 of the above extimate 15 payable before commescement of the work. Payment for thiz may be made in cash, credit card or

chbqui. You st alse agres to pay Tull smount for renewal of the windicreen in the event of |madvertest breakage im the courss of renewing the rebber seal or
the removal of the windscresn.

€e

CYELE & CARRIAGE

Pandan Lo ice Ceriter

188 Fan,

of Sary

WE DRIVE FIRST CLASS

(=] Mercedes-Bere - are regiztered trademans of Daimier, Stataer, Garman W MES P"‘rS AL COTLER
; E

obher repair reguiring



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607T198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref CS/FCIMBO21420/R 1wd3n2

i?sﬁgagﬁ? E(?L?EAE%INGAPDHE 068877 Dtes: ANOEENA H‘ll‘l”””l""lm"m
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 83420 Veh. Inspected SKK 32880
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1B00B39TMFSH Excess () 0,00
Assign From  SITHARA Assign Date 27M1/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES EENZ SLK 200 c.c 1796
KOMPRESSOR
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Req. 2008
Chassis No. WDB1714452F 196054 Colour WHITE
Cdometer - Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [225/40 R18 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/40R18 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date 24/11/2018 Inspection Date 07122018
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES (1986) PL
186 PANDAN LOCP
SINGAPORE 128378
(MERCEDES-BENZ)
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
ClIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5§ Working Days




' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408933
= TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199807198 GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R Page No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR GOST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKK 3288D
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo ﬂmhnp?;]} lg{
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RH/F FENDER (SN) BENT 853.48 853.48
1|RH/F INTERMEDIATE LAYER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 17.13
1|RH/F FENDER EMBLEM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 144,79
1|FRT BUMPER (SN) SCRATCHED 1,423.91 1,423.91
1|RHIF BUMPER BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 6102 4
1|RH/F DISC WHEEL (SN} SCRATCHED 1,240 15 B4B 96
1|FRONT RIGHT RIM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
3.B01.38 2,926.35
LABOUR
USE XENTRY TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS & RESET 380.00 380.00
MEMORY TO STANDARD SETTINGS.
INSPECT & CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 540.00 540,00
REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT BUMPER, FRONT RIGHT 2,400.00 1,920.00
FENDER & REMOVE FRONT SUPPORT ASSY
COMPONENTS & REFINISH
RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER & FRONT RIGHT FENDER 1,500.00 1,200.00
4,820.00 4,040.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,621.38 6,966.35
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | I 6,966.35

U

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18021420/R1vd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $74,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $32,005.00=NETT VALUE: $41,995.00

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Rapart is made solely for the use and benefi of the Chent named on the front page of this Report.




