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XIN. HUA WORKSHOP PTE. LTD.

23 Kakl Bukit Avenue 4, #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415023
Tel . GB44-19B5 Fax - 6844-5185
Reqg - 2018385216

Repair Estimate
Date :20M11/2018 Raference: OPEL
’ Make: ASTRA
A &

To Whom It May Concam
GO fara
Dear Sir, d’ .

RE: VEHICLE .:5JM14245
CHASSIS NO.: WOLBEGEA4HG 180065
ENGINE NO.: B117143THRXX0501

Name of insured ..LIM PECH HWA BERENICE
Date of accidant.: 19/11/2018

s 8

We append hereunder the estimated cost of repairs lo be carried oul 1o the abave vehice.

Parts
_No, Qty Fart Description
1 1 |FRT BUMPER $s 5 1,594, 00
| 2 | 15 [FRT BUMPER CLIP  ile : 5 9730
| 3 | 1 |FRT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH - GUIDE Crel ™ 5 136.00)
4 1_|FRT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH - Upp  »7 5 | 06,00}
5 | 1 |FRT BUMPER BRACKET LH e i 3 192,00
| 6 | 1 |LHHEADLAMP iy $ £20.00
7 | 1 |[FRTFENDERLH © W.afs 5 k2 D)
| 8 | 1 |FRT FENDER SIGNAL LAMP LH & ~* $ 146.00
| 9 | 1| |FRT FENDER BRACKET LH [ 3 192,00
1 1 [FRT FENDER INNERSHIELD LH ~+< »— 3 138.00
11 | 10 [FENDER INNERSHIELD CLIP e 5 53,00
1 1 |[FRTRIMLH L~ 5 1.200,00
13 | 1| [FRT WHEEL BEARING LH - with Huh ) 5 492,00
14 | 1 [FRT KNUCKLE ARM LH Tid 5 414,00
| 15 | 1 |[FRTLOW ARMLH ~ 5 567.00
16 | 1 |FRT SHOCK ABSORBER LH 5 528,00
g 0%+ Parts Total: §  8,060.50
Wkt Less10%: § 806.95
ASUE Total: §  7.262.55
Labour
Labour Description
_No, Price (SGD)
1 To dismantie / renew the accident damaged portion, to panel -
beating,reshape straighien,onentate and align repair freplacemeant pans. $ Fﬂﬁﬂﬂ
z Carry out spray painting on affected area, FRT BUMPER, FRT FENDER LH,
FRT DOOR LH s o




3 To disconnect front wire hamess of electrical component to faciiitate $ 12000 3
repairs reconnec and check electncal function after repair i
4
To remove and replace LHF under carmage parts $ AW ]
5 o
To conduct 4 whee! alignment ’ 100
1’} i }
Labour Total : § 1.680.00
Others
Qther Description
I ] I | |
Other Total: 0.00
TOTAL: 894255
GST [ 7%): 625.98
GRAND TOTAL : 9.568.53

MB: THIS IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE AND SHOULD ADDITIONAL WORK BE FOUND NECESSARY TO BE CARRIED OUT N THE
COURSE OF REPAIRS. EXTRA MATERIALS AND LABOUR COST WILL BE CHARGED ACCORDINGLY WHICH HOWEVER You
WiLL BE INFORMED PRIOR TO ACTION TAKEN PARTS PRICES ARE SUB.JECT TO CHANGES.

Yours i t Iy

Fil ]
Serviceflivisor |
Kelvin Chew L.[ ¢ b ﬁ/r &
HP: B292 5585 Fax: 68445185 | {

oM ,A,7 .

Toted | 3¢ S8
LS A3k,

60

Hal s ang
B BUORECT 10 S agor i,
Alndwitogad by Repare

Signature:

D




‘Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December 2018 2:15 PM

To: ‘alan.quek@cyclecarriage.com.sg’

Subject: <Request for Video Footage> ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIL 180G(AIG) & SIM 14245

ON 19/11/2018 *Our Ref: CC6/AIG18021389/Apa3

Cwur Ref; CC6/AIG1802138%/Apal
Dear Sirs/Madam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING $JL 180G(AIG) & SIM 14245 ON 19/11/2018

we refer to the above accident where we ore actling AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve a third
party claim against our insured vehicle 5JL 180G (Mr Wan Chee Kiong Edmund).

We would like to request a copy of the video footage as stated in his GIA report for our necessary action,

Thank you for your kind and early reply.

Hest Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408031)



'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December 2018 2:23 PM

To: 'kelvinpeekuang@gmail.com’

Subject: Your Ref; SIM 14245 *Qur Ref: CC6/AIG18021389/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIL

T1BOG(AIG) & SIM 14245 ON 19/11/2018]

Your Ref: 5JM 14245 Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC46/AIG1802138%/Apal

Dear Sirs/Madam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING $SJL 180G(AIG) & SJM 14245 ON 19/11/2018

We refer fo the obove matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear as our insured driver reported that he was driving on his lane. All
of sudden, your client filtered into his lane and hit anto his car. Attached here is a copy of our insured driver

report for your easy reference.

We would like to request a copy of your client's video lootage as stated in his GIA report for our reference.

S e T
BRI, i
e . e R &

AL of sdln B vkl Suddn, filfe
tnd ol Jg) s

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter ls purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influgnce on the issues
of llability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408031)



Letter of Authorisation & Indeminity

ﬁl‘.‘tldﬂ‘m|anIU|ngVehf-Elenn.cjm H”'!S md':-jL lfvﬁ On 'r(f/”/?{?ff f:alfof'-u
At ungara l?mtcl

UWe, the owner of vehicle no. (3 IY2¢¢ hereby instruct and  authorize

Yip l'un. n/g. k slr';,-,_r F’f{* [‘[ (“the workshop")
10 commence repairs 1o the said vehicle. Pending the outcome of my/our claim against the
third party, l/we forthwith pay you the sum of § being refundable deposit of the
repair 1o my/our said vehicle.
Your are further authorized 1o appoint solicitors on my/our behalf and give the solicitors full
instructions as if the appointment is made and instructions are given by me/us with respect 1o
the conduct of my/our claim against the third party driver and/or his insurers including if
necessary, to commence legal proceedings in court in my/our name against the third party,
You have my/our full authority to instruct my/our solicitors to negotiate a settlement with the
third party and/or his insurers on such terms 13 you deem fir.
Upon resolving myfour claim, vou are authorized to agree with my/our solicitors on the
amount of their professional costs and disbursement for acting for me/us and 1o receive
payment of the balance of the settlement sum on my/our behalf directly into your account. In
the event that my/our claim or legal costs of the third party as well as the professional costs
and disbursements of my/our solicitors notwithstanding that my/our solicitors were sppointed
by you on our behall
Uwe also hereby instruct and authorise you deduet directly from the claim monies received
from the third party all outstanding balances that are still owing to you, namely the balance of
repair costs and rental of substitute vehicles.
In the event that I/we am/are required to artend at my/our solicitors office or to attend court in
connection with my/our claim, 'we shall render full co-operation,
In the event that my/our claim against the third party and/or his insurers is not successful or
cannot be proceeded with and/or if any ludgement or settlement is not honoured or satisfiad
by the third party, I/we authorise ¥ou to revert the claim against my/our own insurers for the
cost of repairs and any other losses recoverable under myfour policy of insurance. In this
respect, l/we understand and accept that the excess amount applicable under policy of
insurance shall be borne by mevus.
If for whatever reasons, my/our msurers reject my/our claim for indemnity for the cost of
repairs and/or any other losses recoverable under the policy of insurance or make an offer 1o
pay less than the amount claimed by you, I/we agree and undertake to pay the full amount of
your repair bill and survey fees and any ather expenses reasonably incurred on my/our behalf
or to pay vou the difference in amount, as the case may be.
Iiwe shall keep you Informed of any correspondences and/or summons that | may receive due
to this action agreeing to pay or receive any manies due to this claim,

Dated this day of 20

e
Um e HiA Witnessed by -

IC No -

(Company stamp, if applicable) L]
Address -

Tel:




Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd

Letter of Demand

Our Ref: SIM14245

AlLG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

AlG Building
78 Shenton Way, #07-06

Singapore 079120

Dear SirMdm:

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIM1424R AND SJL1B0G ON 19-Nov-2018 AT DURNEARN ROAD

We are acting on behalf of the owner/driver to recover his vehicle damages and losses
sustainer in the above accident from the third party driver/ or insurers.

Description Amount

Repair Costs 5 4.300.00
Loss of Rental $0.00 X 4 days s -

Loss Of Use $100.00 X 4 days 5 400.00

Search Fees (LTA) 5 7.45
Surveyor fees 5 -
Others Claim 5 -

[Amount 5 4,707.45

Please look into our client claims and let us hear from you shortly.

Xin Hua Workshop Pt
Tel : 82925595

email ; xinhuaworkshopkermryi@gmail.com



1L AVE 1, 00025 PAYA LI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGATORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563501 FAX : (06567414108

Ouwr Ref: CC6/AIG18021389/Aeal

22 AUG 2019

WAN CHEE KIONG EDMUND
BLK 9 TOH YI DRIVE

#04-329

SINGAPORE 590009

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJL 180G AND SJM 14248 ON 19/11/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or
your authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days, after we shall proceed with
negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement
should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party's
insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yuug faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng @ Ikkauto.com

cc.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



Authorization To Act

L Lim fech Mo Becenice  (“the third party claimant”) of
OLE Y28 orsed Roud B2i-113 Sigepeal  Ulogy

(address), owner of <7 I€1s (vehicle no.) hereby
authorize_Xl+ lwa Workd.., T4, L4d

(“the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair
costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle
no. 3o (%24 5 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which
occurred on K/ [20(§ (date) along_ Duneaen [

(location)  involving

vehicle no/s STL [90(,
(“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to
settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on
a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis in so far as the
driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this Lo day of \ (month) 20 |3 {vear)

= Lt

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the warkshop”



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, XIN HUA WORKSHOP PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/I have reached
an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount cluimed for $$2.300.00
(Global Sum) for vehicle no, SJM 14248 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on 19/11/2018 (date) along DUNEARN ROAD involving vehicle no/s SJL 180G.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 26/11/2018 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner LIM PECH HWA BERENICE (“the third
party claimant™) of vehicle no, SJTM 14248 make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/I enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/lI will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above suid agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining (o costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to S]M
14248 (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

Thiz agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Datedthis_ [0 @ayyof 09 (month) 2014 (year)

0 '|
(k) \;L | /\

Signed by.appointed surveyor Si

l’{luin Che Tee kum:c)

eI
.r _.I
=1
,.o
L]

“the workshop™ (with chop)




Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #04-01{SouthWing) Singapore 415933
Tel : 6844-1985 Fax : 6844-5185
Business Reg No. 2018385216

Proformal Invoice
Bill To Invales Date : 08-Apr-19
Involce No :  P19-0012

AIG Asin Pacific Insurance Pe Lid Viehicle No, t BIMI424%
AIG Building Accident Date ! 19-Now-18
78 Shenton Way, #07-06
Singapore 079120
Item No Description Cuantity Unit Price Amuuni

| Lump Sum Repair for Third Panty Claim I 54,300,000
—
Remarks Sub Tnuq £4,300. 00

Amount
Due| 430000

for Xin Hus/Workshop f

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



GE
INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

Invaice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
€ Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: <65 6224 0020
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam 1o Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE 7 Hedstration No: M4D0017735

Third Party insurer Enquiry

Our Ral No: GR-18-181142

Date of Request 221112018 Your Raf No: Onlina Purchnse

15t Autowerks P1e Lid

23 Kaki Buiit Ave 4

&04-01

Singapore 415833

Dear SinMatdsm,

Enguiry Date 22112018

Enqguiry By Chew Pees Kuang Ketvin

TP Vehicle No SJLIBDG

Acciden| Data 19172018

Enauiry Resull

TP Vohicle No. Insurar Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SJL1B0G AlG Asia Pacific Insurancs Ple, Lid, 23/06/2018-22:08/2019 65-6419-3000
Thank You,

The Impges provided 1o you are Laken from the
Singapare and we thée no responsibility for their
of in connecion with the repons or helr images.

This is & compuler genarated dacument and r2quUIres no signature.

arginal reports lorwirded 1o the centre by the mambers of the General Insurance Assasistian of
mmyumﬁu-ndtﬂhmﬂrmmﬂmnrhwhnwmm“ﬂ

mmum.m.mmuxmmmmmmmnmcfmmmw*rumrm,,. w2




A0N1EE nvoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
1 & Raflles Quay #1800, Singapore 048580
% ‘) F; IHSUWCE Phone: *ml 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operaling Hours: Monday (o Friday 8am to Spm
RECORDS u..u».-mEn-Em CENTRE ‘95T Regisiation No: MA000TTTIS

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No GR-18-181142
Date of Reguest: 222018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

181 Autoworks Pis Lig
23 Koki Bukit Ave 4
#02-01

Singapore 415833

Dear SirlMadam

Enguiry Date 212018

Enguiry By Chew Fee Kuang Halvin
TR Vihicle No. SJL1BOG

Accident Date 1911/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (SS)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13

Total Amaounl Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00|

Thank You.

This is a computer generaled document and requires no signalure,

For GIARMEC Official use:
Data:

%] GIRO [] Cash | ] Cheque

et pE iangEpors menmen came claimfindes ot Museboxe M TRz poction=deg_goninviphrofid=19824404CF ID=44652 1TOACFTOREN=-TRE... 272



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

.+.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiann

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Casp Biotifiad Est Submited Ad) Aesigned Ad) Rpt Af) Suilsrnitted Ly Auth'ed Etatus
26 Nav 2018 Paniding for Survey
O me  [Watmes, |meven Repor
o Ad Rt | cancel Coss |

Main Clalm Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [[createa by adjuster]

Insured- WAN CHEE KIDNG EDMUND, 1D 502373250
Myir 5
Clnimant; LIM PECH HWA BERENICE, |0 568353281
Vehicls Beg, . [19/11 /2008 17:00 - :59
o 5IM14245 Date of LOSS: |1y 5 months and 2 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r]]
: Policy/Cover | 1700019448 [Comprehensive)
Claim Type: |TP / 285494345056 Hote No.: Coverage: 2Y/08/2018 - 22/06/2019
Vehicle Beg.
No. SIL18OG m":!! 5095152663-01
(Trsured) i
Excess:
Repairer: Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd (HQ) 23 Kakl Bukit Ave 4 #04-01, 415933 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 68441985 5292 5555
Handling AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, [Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Syed-Yusoff, Saliha] Saliha Syed-
Insurer: Yusoff@aig.com
mrf" NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:
Adjustar LKK Auto Consultants Poe Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 _ [Handied by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 06/13/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Mal |
« AIG _SG (28/11/2018): Request To Upload TP GIA Report

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view Al | Searcn Tasks | Creste tew Task | comptete |

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handior Assigned By Complaeted On Created On Done?
No resuits.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 13/9/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*5IM14245 (28549434505G)
[SIL1B80G]
TP
LIM PECH HWA BERENICE
Nov 19 2018 5:00PM
[WAN CHEE KIONG EDMUND]
¥in Hua Workshop Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Video 1 pet hd i
Ne |Finalized On LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |22/06/16 16:55 | TP VIDEO SIM 14248 Loma MP4

No_| Finalized On ATG Asin Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (5G) Patwnbwall | Print
T [T oy o O R e Load MP4
Letters/Correspandences |1 per page ~]| &
Mo | Finalzed On LNK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 | (prany Third Party Express Settlement — Payment Breakdown Edit
Assessment Reports [loervsoe 1] &
o | Finalized On AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) Thmhill!!rht
1 |38/11/18 10:35 w.m Ak CHEE KICNG EOSLIND @ | lowtir J
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| vehicle No: SJL180G (Insd veh) Model: OPEL ASTRA 999CC HB (A)
SJM1424S (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |19/11/2018

Global Sum Settlement [ : | [X] Yes [ [ | No
Repair Estimate  § 8,942.55
Final Repair Cost 5 2,300.00
Loss of Use - § 4.00 days at $50.00 per day
Rental (if any) -] days
LTA / GiA Search Fea 5
Hhers: -
' §
Final Settiement Sum (Global Sum) '3 2.,300.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X ] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 50 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B} For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: _______ (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain callisions and far cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payea's Breakdown

1) [ Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd 3 2,300.00
2 &
3 ;5

13 Sep
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno 1sssoriser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 4080833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-BB05 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCE/AIG180213B9/AEA3QZ

Datea: 13/08/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No: 1700019448
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SJM14245 Insured Vehicle No : SJL180G
Date of Loss: 19M11/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 285484345056
1 FICAT F I
Reg No: SJM14245
Make & Model: OPEL ASTRA, 998cc HB (A) Engine No: B1171487HRXX05601
Reg. Dale: 17/10/2017 (Man. Year. 2017) Chassis No; WOLBEBEA4HG 1800685
Colour Green Cdometer; 17027 km
Engine Capacity 889 cc
Market Value/New Car NJA
Price:
Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/45 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225/45 R17
Front Left Side: Michelin 8 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 8 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 6 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin & mm
The above valbes represant the semaring tyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 7,262.55 4 548 60 2.713.95 37.37
Miscellaneous llems D.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,680.00 910.00 770.00 4583
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) B,942.55 5,458.60 3,483.95 38.96
Approved Total (Overridden) (5$) 4,300.00
Nett Amount (5%) B,942.55 4,300.00 4,642.55 51.92
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x $550.00/day) (S%) 200.00
(5%) 4,500.00
Liable Amount (50.00%) (5%5) 2,250.00
+ Doci/Search Fea (S5) 745
Nett Liability (55) 2,257 .45
Global Sum Settlement {5§) 2,300.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 26112018
Date Inspected: 261172018 Inspected AL Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd (HQ)
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #04-01
Singapore 415833
Estimated Perod of Repair: 4.0 days
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Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOITE: This report represants our findings of the time and place of inspection slaked hersin. Such inSpection has been camod oul fo the bear of our
knowladge and abiity bat any ather dabilly under any other circumslances /s hereby erpressly ascluded
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
1 1 *FRT BUMPER Torm 1,004 D0FL *1.864.00FL
2 15 *FRT BUMPER CLIP MNecassary a7 50FL *30.00 FL
i 1 *FRT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH-GUIDE Cracked 138.00FL *138.00FL
4 1 *FRT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH-UPP Mot Necessary 108.00FL “FL
5 1 *FRT BUMPER BRACKET LH Mot Necessary 192 00FL *FL
6 1 *LH HEADLAMP Cracked B20.DOFL *B20.00FL
7T 01 “FRT FENDER LH Dented B82.00FL “B82.00FL
B 1 *FRT FENDER SIGNAL LAMP LH Mot Necessary 146.00FL “FL
g 1 *FRT FENDER BRACKET LH Bent 182.00FL  *192.00FL
0 1 *FRT FENDER INNERSHIELD LH Mot Necessary 138.00FL “FL
11 10 *FENDER INNERSHIELD CLIP Not Necessary B5.00FL *-FL
12 1 *FRT RIM LH Cut 1.200.00FL *1.200.00FL
13 1 *FRT WHEEL BEARING LH-WITH HUB Not Necessary 482 DOFL =FL
14 1 *FRT KNUCKLE ARM LH Mot Necessary 414 0OFL “FL
15 1 *FRT LOW ARM LH Not Necessary BE7.00FL “FL
16 1 *FRT SHOCK ABSORBER LH Not Necessary 528.00FL “FL

F=Franchise part L=ListhemnDisc

Sub Total (S$) 8,069.50 5,054.00

- List Item Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (58%) B0& 85 505.40

Total Parts (S§)  7,262.55 4,548.60

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellansous items selected

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO DISMANTLE /RENEW THE ACCIDENT DAMAGED MNew 600.00 400.00
PORTION ,TO PANEL
BEATING ,RESHAPE ,STRAIGHTEN ,ORIENTATE AND
ALIGN REPAIR /[REPLACEMENT PARTS

2 CARRY OUT SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREA ,FRT  New 600.00 400.00
BUMPER ,FRT FENDER LH,FRT DOOR LH

3  TODISCONNECT FRONT WIRE HARNESS OF New 120.00 30.00
ELECTRICAL COMPONENT TO FACILITATE
REPAIRS RECONNECT AND CHECK ELECTRICAL
FUNCTION AFTER REPAIR

4 TO REMOVE AND REPLACE LHF UNDER CARRIAGE New 200.00 0.00
PARTS

5 TOCONDUCT 4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT New 160.00 BO.0OO

Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,680.00 910.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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