Asher Sng (LKKAuto) .

From: Yong Shun Tien <yongshun@lexbuild.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 13 February 2019 1:53 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: claims@lexbuild.com

Subject: RE: Estimate quotation & SAS Report for SBS5M
Attachments: ATA.pdf; LBE201901-121.pdf; Search Fee.pdf
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Good Afternoon Sir/Mdm,

We are authorized by Go Ahead Singapore Pte Ltd to negotiate and derive an amicable direct settlement with
your prestige company.

The repair on the said bus has been done.

We hereby quantify our client’s intend claims as follow:

1. Final repair bil (LBE201901-121) S 4,333.50 (inclusive 7% GST)

2. LOU (4 days @ $350/day) :$  1,400.00

3. Search Fee S 2.00 (inclusive 7% GST)
Grand Total :$ 5,735.50

Enclosed please find the documents for your necessary action:
1) Authorization to Act

2) Tax Invoice LBE201901-121
3) Search fee invoice

Thank you

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 5:32 PM

To: Yong Shun Tien <yongshun@lexbuild.com>

Cc: claims@lexbuild.com .
Subject: RE: Estimate quotation & SAS Report for SBS5M

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 4:51 PM

To: 'SADDAM_94@HOTMAIL.COM'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBM 6417A AND SBS 5M ALONG UPPER CHANGI ROAD

BEFORE MRT TRACK ON 02/11/2018

23 JAN 2019

SADDAM BIN HUSSAIN

Dear Sir/ Mdm

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18021387/K1eb3

YOUR REF :FBM 6417A

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBM 6417A AND SBS 5M ALONG UPPER CHANGI ROAD BEFORE MRT TRACK
ON 02/11/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We have received third party claim(s) against your motor insurance policy.

We have received a claim from M/S LEXBUILD INTERNATIONAL PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of
SBS 5M against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your
policy. We also wish to advise that there is an excess of S$500.00 attached with Third Party Claims.

AXA shall keep you informed of when to make the excess payment, which cheque is to be made in favor of
“AXA Insurance Pte Ltd". Please indicate your vehicle registration number and the date of accident on the back
of the cheque.

As Insurers, AXA shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the
rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct



of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days
from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to AXA and acknowledged by AXA.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
ashersng@lkkauto.com if not provided at AXA’s reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and
further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep
us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge
and consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection
with this accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may email it to ashersng@Ilkkauto.com or deliver it
by hand to AXA’s Customer Care Centre.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Service Team at 1800-880 4888 at our
operating hours 9:00am to 5:30pm (press 1 for Gl and option 3 for claims) or ashersng@lkkauto.com. Please
quote our claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Yours sincerely,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com

c.c.  AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)
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Go-Anhead Singapors sin P &
Go head

Tatephone:
Website: nttpilfwww.go-aiteadsingapora.com

AUTHORISATION TO ACT

We, GO AHEAD SINGAPORE PTE LTD of 2 Loyang Way, Singapore
508776, owner of SBS5M hereby authorize LexBuild International Pte Ltd to
act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs for my vehicle no. SBS5M
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 02/11/2018
(date) JALAN ANGIN LAUT / UPPER CHANGI ROAD (location) involving
vehicle no. _ FBM6417A .

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a
manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to
negotiate and receive payment further to settlement of our claim with
payment cheque/s being made in favor of the workshop. Our authorized
workshop will separately reimburse GO AHEAD SINGAPORE PTE LTD for
any Loss of use claim for the said bus.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my

behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability insofar as
the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this 26 (day) of November (month)_2018 (year)

TIEN YONG SH
0PS . EXECUT]
@ 90296574 ( /

Signed by LexBuild
Signed by Go-Ahead Singapore Pte Ltd International Pte Ltd
(With chop if applicable) '

tsavaarl: oopies U, Reglstmten Number: (¢
Registered Addresz: ;L *3v o Uoplo-



A

x redefining / insurance

CLAIM REF :58M011QA
INSURED : SADDAM BIN HUSSAIN

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We/l [GO AHEAD SINGAPORE PTE LTD, NRIC NO. 201541500C] hereby agree to accept the sum of
[FIVE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED THIRTY FIVE AND CENTS FIFTY ONLY:] [5$5,635.50] to us/me by
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as full and final settlement of all claims of whatever kind including
damages for personal injuries and damages to property and all costs and expenses that we/l have or
may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured or the driver of motor vehicle
no. [FBM 6417A] as a result of an accident at [JLN ANGIN LAUT X UPP CHANGI RD] on [02/11/2018)]
of which we/l were/was the hirer/owner/driver/pillion/Passenger/ insurer of motor vehicle [SBS

SML.

We/I hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for all claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l have or may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. [FBM 6417A] in connection directly or
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l are/am the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlement.

It is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. [FBM 6417A]

Dated this § day of, [Mareh, . 2019

¥
/ 4D G
L/ (=
Claimant’s Signature : M/_\’I’
n m
R
NRIC no./ Company Stamp : e
oo Cog
. . Publie  Trom
Occupation/ Business : Yookt
Address v ijam b‘v JSe3t7é
Y d 7
Telephone No. ; g-??lf?/", [SM')
7] (e
Witness’s Name : ( /Q/JM- Waa Yo
Witness’s Signature . ¢ J
Witness’s NRIC No. : &3z

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (Company Reg. No. 198903512M)

8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811

Customer Centre #8101

Tel: +65 6880 4888 Fax: +65 6338 2522 Website: www.axa,com.sg



TAX INVOICE

Invoiced To :
AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd Invoice No. LBE201901-121
8 Shenton Way #27-01 Date 31/01/2019
AXA Tower Your Ref.
Singapore 068811 Our Ref.
Vehicle No. SBS5M
Tel. : Fax Issued By Yong Shun, Tien
Attn : Motor Claims Department Terms C.0.D.
Page No. 10of1
Item Code Description Qty Unit Price Amount
Being Third Party Claims for SBS5M
- Policy Holder : GO AHEAD SINGAPORE PTE LTD
- Policy No  : D-16083754MFBP
- Vehicle No : SBS5M
- Accident date: 02/11/2018
-TPC: FBMG417A
- Our Ref: AC18/042
JOB Lump sum repair cost 1JOB 4,050.00 4,050.00
E. &O.E. Sub-Total S$ 4,050.00
GST7% S% 283.50

Our bank details:

Account Name LexBuild International Pte Ltd

Bank Name Standard Chartered Bank
Account No. 010-2075727
SWIFT Code SCBLSG22XXX

Please indicate invoice number on reverse side of the cheque or
send the remittance advice to finance@lexbuild,com,

Claim for damage or shortage shall not be considered unless we
are notified in writing within seven (7) days of this invoice date.

Interest of 1% per month is chargeable on overdue account.

LexBuild International Pte Ltd

2 Woodlands Sector 1, #05-12 (Woodlands Spectrum 1), Singapore 738068
Tel: (65) 6456 3533, Fax: (65) 6456 3353

Website: www.LexBuild.com, Email: sales@lexbuild.com

Total Inc. GST /S\$

4,333.50

nternational Pte Lid

LW{SGU Signature

k=) bAHTE

ROC / CR GST Reg. No. 200004370R



Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operatinq Hoqrs: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-183350
Date of Request: 26/11/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

LexBuild International Pte Ltd
2 Woodlands Sector 1 (Woodlands Spectrum 1 )

#05-12

Singapore 738068

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 26/11/2018

Enquiry By Tien Yong Shun

TP Vehicle No. FBMB417A

Accident Date 02/11/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No, Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
FBMB417A AXA Insurance Pte Lid 29/01/2018-28/01/2019 6338 7288
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or thelr Images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://www. giarmc.org.sg/cIaims/index.cfm?ﬁlsebox=MTRSas&fuseaction=dsp_geni... 26/11/2018



Invoice

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANC Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration No: M40001
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE PR ies

Our Ref No: GR-18-183350
Date of Request: 26/11/2018

LexBuild International Pte Ltd
2 Woodlands Sector 1 (Woodlands Spectrum 1)
#05-12

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Singapore 738068

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 26/11/2018

Enquiry By Tien Yong Shun

TP Vehicle No. FBMGE417A

Accident Date 02/11/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$%)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:

Date:

[X] GIRO [] Cash [] Cheque
https://www.giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geni... 26/11/2018



