Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 June, 2019 6:29 PM

To: MG Solution

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SLW4614P-( PRE-INSPECTION: YOUR RE F : SHD462) -DOA ON 24/11/2018 ***
LKK REF: CC4/ASM18021368/Apa3

Attachments: Sketch Plan.pdf

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your Ref: SLW 4614P
Our Ref: CC4/ASM18021368/Awa3

Dear Sir/Madam,

Accident on 24/11/2018 involving SLW 4614P & SHD462]J
We refer to the above matter

Our principal have review on your client’s CCTV, based on the video there is no jerk. Our principal are of the view
that Evidence is not conclusive

We attached herewith our insured’s accident report for your perusal.
We are regret to inform you that we are unable to look into your client claim.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 13 June, 2019 2:07 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>




Subject: Re: SLW4614P-( PRE-INSPECTION: YOUR RE F : SHD462J -DOA ON 24/11/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18021368/Apa3

Your Ref: CC4/ASM18021368/Apa3 (SHD462))
Our Ref: SLW4614P

Dear Vivian,

Please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side on
15/03/2019 and cctv footage on 30/04/2019.

We have not receive any offer from your side.

Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon.

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Thu, Jun 13, 2019 at 1:47 PM MG Solution <mg3solution @ gmail.com> wrote:

Your Ref: CC4/ASM18021368/Apa3 (SHD462))
Our Ref: SLW4614P

Dear Cecilia,

Please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side on
15/03/2019 and cctv footage on 30/04/2019.

We have not receive any offer from your side.

Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon.

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Wed, May 1, 2019 at 2:38 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Hi Su Wong,



Kindly advise if there is any accident scene photos.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed
/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@ gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 April 2019 11:34 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@]Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLW4614P-( PRE-INSPECTION: YOUR RE F : SHD462J -DOA ON 24/11/2018 **%*
LKK REF: CC4/ASM18021368/Apa3

Your Ref: CC4/ASM18021368/Apa3 (SHD462])

Our Ref: SLW4614P

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to below email, please find attached cctv footage for self-explanation.



Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Tue, Apr 30, 2019 at 10:48 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear as our insured driver reported that “No Collision”.

Kindly let us have evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) in order for us to look into the
matter.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution @gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 15 March 2019 5:10 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLW4614P-( PRE-INSPECTION: YOUR RE F : SHD462J -DOA ON 24/11/2018 ***
LKK REF: CC4/ASM18021368/Apa3

Your Ref: CC4/ASM18021368/Apa3 (SHD462])

Our Ref: SLW4614P

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please find attached our LOD for your onward action.
Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further information.
Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933



Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Tue, Nov 27, 2018 at 12:12 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending verification for direct settlement.

Fyi, Ol has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

g Bz cade B Bgpedt

Circumstances of Accident

On 24.11.2018 at about 2055 hours, | was travelling straight along TPE slip road towards Pasir Ris Drive B whan Vehicle B
(SLW4E14P) in front of me suddenly jammed brake. | immediately applied brake to avoid collision and | was able to brake in
tima. Vehicle B's driver alighted and say that | hit onto his vehicle, | alighted to check on it, there's no visible damages and there's
a distance within our vehicle, | wish to claim that there's no collision on my taxi and Vehicle B
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As spoken, we will survey your client’s vehicle on 28.11.2018.

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742
3197.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@ gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November, 2018 8:48 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey @axa.com.sg>; SG AXA
Insurance SM Claims Service Team <cst@axa.com.sg>

Subject: SLW4614P-( PRE-INSPECTION: YOUR RE F : SHD462J -DOA ON 24/11/2018

Dear person in charge,
Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Ms Hong



MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing)
#02-03B Vicom Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tel : 6744 4165

Fax : 6744 4604



