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Autn

Consultants
Pt Lt Company Registration No. 1996071961
LRI ANE om0 28 AN A DI INDIDSTHIAL PARK, SINCGANMIRE JOXU3T TEL « (63 62863561 FAN : (IG5 62560115
Your ref: To Be Advised Date: 27.11.2018

Our ref: CCHLPCI8021323/Tleb3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHB2265
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 26.11.2018
al the premises of M/s _ Ding Auto Ple Lid _and have the following to report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount : 5% 3,950.88

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1,364.46

"Check” Items Amount 1 55 28646

Market Value . 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Mert Value 1 5% -

Description of Damage: o ‘,:_,_—_‘:—r,:‘_,?__,uﬂ -
The vehicle sustained damages al the 11:_| _ - __-__._;'. f
Rear Portion T

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2  days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



™ FAX NO:
ESTIMATE REPORT =~ 15T Cluntation 261172018 1141
JOB-NG: 50111155
OWNER'S PARTICULARS
MaME:  CityCab PTE LTD (Fleat) CONTACT: 65533880 Page 1of 2
ADDRESS: 383 SIN MING DRIVE 64738522
SINGAPORE 575717 0
VEHICLE DETAILS
LICENSE NO:  SHB22565J TRANS, AUTO CHASSIS:  KMHLB41UMCUOS3539
MAKE / MODEL: HYUMDAI | 40 EMGINE; DAFDGLUGTIE1E
OWNER'S INSURER ME First Capital Insuranca Limited
JOB-CODE: TP SA: Ding Auto User 2
CLAIM DETAILS
QUOTED DISCOUNT  DISC PRICE REV
DESCRIPTICON ary. COSTS IND SURDISP  poyce
LABOUR
1 STRAIGHTEN AND PANEL BEAT ACCIDENT 100 1,000.00 0.00 1.000.00 y 2¢°
AREAS
2 RAR SPARE TYRE & CARPET & TRIM 1.00 80,00 0,00 80,00 v o
3 RESPRAY REAR BUMPER 100 23000 0,00 230,00 v 200
4 RESPRAY REAR BUMPER DIFFUSER 100 20000 0.00 200,00 ¥y Jad
5 RESPRAY BOOTLID 100 23000 0.00 230.00 ¥ A
B REMOVE & RE-DRILL REVERSE SENSOR 1.00 BO.00 0.00 BO.00 Y 30
TOTAL: 1,820,00 0.00 1,820.00
MATERIALS
1 REARBUMPER 100 59932 119,86 470 46 L v A "
2 REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 100 43340 87 68 350,72 L ¥ 7 e
3 REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET 1.00 85.63 1713 id.50 L ¥ ,Ii: g
LHS ) ) : ? X
4 REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET 100 8563 1713 68,50 L "
RHS il
5§ REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SPONGE 100 18015 10,03 12042 L ¥y
& REAR BUMPER RETAINER LHS 100 4914 383 39,31 L T
7 REAR BUMPER RETAINER RHS 100 4944 983 30,31 L v % o
& REAR BUMPER DIFFUSER 100 21640 43.68 174.72 E ¥ T:._,
9 REPAR BOOTLID 1.00 0.00 0.00 0,00 L T
10 BOOTLID EMBLEM-LOGO 1,00 3355 &7 2884 L v R/ T
11 BOOTLID EMBLEM-| 40 1.00 36.50 7.30 20.20 L Y o |
12 BOOTLID EMBLEM-CRD 1.00 3650 7.0 2020 L ¥ oo
13 REAR BUMPER RUBEER PROTECTOR PAD 100 46000 0,00 160,00 g ¥ Ad
14 REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR 100 230.00 0,00 230,00 5 ¥ Zug X el
15 BOOTLID STICKER-COMFORTDELGRO 1.00 120,00 0.00 120.00 5 ¥ “.-_C ke
BOOKING 65521111 T
16 REAR BUMPER CLIP SET 1.00 35.00 0.00 35.00 g W Al "ff
17 REAR BUMPER ADS STICKER 100 180.00 .00 160.00 vy a7
TOTAL: 2487 .35 35646 2.130.88
TOTAL PARTS & LABOUR 4,307 36 35648 3.050.68

0.00

oL

EXCESSLOADING:SS
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G-5TAR-WI-ET-001-02-Rev00




‘CLAIM DETAILS

QUOTED DISCOUNT  DISC PRICE REV
IND SURDISP oo
DESCRIPTION aTy COSTS
oateoFsurvey: 20 ML ’ :
T Guv @ (ML anfo s
SURVEYED BY:

CONTACT NO: 42}‘—{51 'ﬂiﬁmx NO: TP

NOTE: LUMP SUM AMOUNT WOULD BE REVISED IF SUPPLEMENT REPAIR 13 REQUIRED
Diutolnz
Ding Auta User 2

ESTIMATOR
STA AUTOCENTRE
TEL: FAX:

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey beloralafer spray painting
= To display damaged part{s) during resurvey
= Parts prices are subjoct i confirmation
* Third party survey 15 on a“Without Prejudice” basis
* No fllegal modificationis) i= aliowed
. _Su::plemen'. 105) must be resuréeyed and
I8 subjet o final apniroval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Renzirar
Signature

Date:

G-STAR-WI-ET-001-02-Revid




Mivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 9.05 AM

To: taxiscs@stengg.com; MT_Claim_5G; assignments@lkkauto.com; 'Admin-D
(LKKAuto)'

Cc: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.5G; ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG;
carlor.chan@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB2265) AND SJUS350B ON 18/11/2018 ARRANGE
SURVEY Our Ref: TBA

Attachments: 5A452507587.pdf; SHB2265)-5JU93508.HTML q-0tam (328 /n ] '

Vehicle In
Dear Catherine/Nivitha
/ RISON® Alex

Please arrange TP survey. QR ﬁUM

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: taxiscs@stengg.com [mailto:taxiscs@stengg.com]

Sent: Friday, 23 November, 2018 5:40 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG; CHEW BENG KEE

Cc: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.S5G; ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG; carlor.chan@dingauto.sg
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB2265] AND 5JU9350B ON 18/11/2018 ARRANGE SURVEY

Dear Officer
Flease arrange survey SHB2265J ASAP

The vehicle SHB2265J already in 31 Corporation Road 649825 .

Thanks

Best Regards

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Alex Khong
Hp . 83039588 /62657130

NOTE 11!

All mailed letter & chegue payment is to be mailed to our main office address :

BLOCK 10 #01=-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPCRE 3735¢45

[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify
us immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank
you]



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

e e ——r—
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh®@lonpac.coms>
Sent: Thursday, 27 December 2018 3:04 PM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuUtD)
Ce: MT Claim_SG
Subject: RE: ACCIDEMT INVOLVING SHB2265) AND SJU9350B ON 18/11/2018 ARRANGE
SURVEY Our Ref: TEA
Attachments: 27122018150104 pdf

Dear Shu Pei,

Attached copy of insured’s report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
[} = [ 2

The all @& lonpac.com.sg

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 10 December, 2018 9:09 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHBZ2265] AND SJU9350B ON 18/11/2018 ARRANGE SURVEY Our Ref: TBA

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action,

Thank you,

Besi Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phane: 6366-0055 | emai’: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $[408933)



From; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 9:10 AM

To: Shu Pei [LKKAuta) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com=

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB2265) AND 5JU33508 ON 18/11/2018 ARRANGE SURVEY Our Ref: TBA

Our Ref : 18/18/18/VP05/021149
Dear Shu Pei,

Our insured driver has yet to lodge a report and we are making enquiries.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com ]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November, 2018 6:02 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB2265] AND SJUS350B ON 18/11/2018 ARRANGE SURVEY Our Ref: TBA

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHB 2265] at M/s Ding Auto Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settlement.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Our case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051,
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Censultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 9:14 AM

To: 'ONG LI L' <llongi@lonpac.coms; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=

Ce: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB2265) AND SJU93508 ON 18/11/2018 ARRANGE SURVEY Our Ref: TBA

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 68q1-1072 | email: assignments@ kkautocom | fax: hagh-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | 5{408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Moncay, 26 November 2018 9:05 AM

To: taxiscs@stengg.com; MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; assignments @lkkauto.com; ‘Admin-D (LKKAuto)'
<admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Ce: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.5G; ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG; carlor.chan@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB2265) AND SIU93508 ON 18/11/2018 ARRANGE SURVEY Our Ref: TBA

Dear Catherine/Nivitha
Please arrange TP survey,

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: taxiscs@stenga.com [mailto:taxiscs@stengg.com]

Sent; Friday, 23 November, 2018 5:40 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG; CHEW BENG KEE

Cc: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.5G; ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG; carlor.chan@dingauto.sg
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB2265) AND SJU9350B ON 18/11/2018 ARRANGE SURVEY

Dear Qfficer ,
Please arrange survey SHB2265J ASAP

The vehicle SHB2265J already in 31 Corporation Road 649825 .

Thanks

Best Regards

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd



Alex Khong
Hp : 83039588/ 62657130

NETE 111
211 mailed letter & chegque payment is to be mailed to ocur main cffice address
BLOCK 10 #01-20

$IN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAFCRE 5735643

[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify us
immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you]

— 3 This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
4 www.avg.com




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

300 BEACH ROAD

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 193555

Ref : CC4/LPC18021323/T1eb3n2

Date: 11-03-2019

MMM

Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJU 93508 Veh, Inspected SHB 2265)
Policy No. Z1B8VPD5018238 Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. 18/18/18/VPD5/021149 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From GERALD Assign Date 26/11/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI |40 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMGU093539 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 323093 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R1& TRIANGLE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/60 R16 TRIANGLE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 TRIANGLE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 TRIANGLE 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/11/2018 Inspection Date 26/11/2018
Survey held at DING AUTO PTE LTD
BLK 10 #01-20 SIN MING IND EST SEC C SINGAPORE 575645
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 LIbl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 15-5607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHB 2265
Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::L':;;?;H Our ""{‘;3,"“““
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 594 32 569,32
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 438 .40 E
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET LHS MOT MECESSARY 85.63 -
1IREAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET RHS NOT NECESSARY 85.63 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SPONGE MOT NECESSARY 150.15 -
1|REAR BUMPER RETAINER LHS MOT NECESSARY 459.14 -
1|REAR BUMPER RETAINER RHS NOT NECESSARY 4914 -
1|REAR BUMPER DIFFUSER TO REPAIR SEE 218.40 -
LABOUR
1|REPAIR BOOTLID (MNPA) NOT NECESSARY - -
1|BOOTLID EMBLEM -LOGD NOT MECESSARY 33.55 =
1|BOOTLID EMELEM -1 40 NOT NECESSARY 36.50 -
1|BOOTLID EMBLEM -CRDH NOT NECESSARY 36.50 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -356.48 -110.86
1,425.B8 479 46
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER RUBBE PROTECTOR PAD (SN) MECESSARY 160.00 160.00
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN} MNOT NECESSARY 230.00 -
1|BOOTLID STICKER -COMFORTDELGRO BOOKING NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
65521111 (SN)
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 35.00 35.00
1|REAR BUMPER ADS STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 160.00 160.00
T05.00 355,00
LABOUR
STRAIGHTEN AND PANEL BEAT ACCIDENT 1,000.00 200.00
AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR BUMPER
DIFFUSER .
R&R SPARE TYRE & CARPET & TRIM . NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
RESPRAY REAR BUMFER, 230.00 200.00
RESPRAY REAR BUMPER DIFFUSER. 200.00 100.00
RESPRAY BOOTLID . MOT NECESSARY 230.00 -

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18021323/T1eb3n2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

BdE B B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3661 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No' 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REMOVE & RE-DRILL REVERSE SENSOR 80.00 30.00
1,820.00 530.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,950.88 1,364.46
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,100.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18021323/T1eb3n2
0
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor




