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Consuitants

Iy

Aia ma m Ple Ltd Company Registration Ho. 199607198R
ST TR AVE 1, #0225 PAYA URLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAN s (63h HESA431E
Your ref: YP 7908E/SL/pl
Our ref: CS/EGII8021293/Avd3 Date : 21/12/2018
The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice

M/s: ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.YN 4097A
We thank you for your instruction on 26/11/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
vehicle on 27/11/2018 at the premises of M/s NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD

Workshop Estimate Amount : §%32,003.00

Revised Estimate Amount - 559,800.00 (LUMP S5UM)
"Check" Ttems Amount 1 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Yalue (5%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
rear portion.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAL PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTEAMSAE-AMMATAIL
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAUtD)

Sent: Friday, 21 December 2018 1:13 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)’

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: YP790BE / TP : YN4D9TA/LKK / DOA : 23/11/2018
Attachments: YN 4097A PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Pei L1

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle YN 4097A
Date of survey: 27/11/2018
Number of days : 8 days

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 2:04 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP7908E / TP : YN4097A/LKK / DOA : 23/11/2018

Dear Pei Li,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle YN 4097A on 27/11/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 10:22 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <surfdlkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP7908E / TP : YNAO97A/LKK / DDA : 23/11/2018




Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignmentsé kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 10:02 AM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Ol : YP7908E / TP : YN40O97A/LKK / DOA : 23/11/2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,
In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016”" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD,

ADDRESS 1 1KAKIBUKIT AVEG
#01-43 BLK C AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
PERSON TO CONTACT :  REENA /SUKYI @ 6747 9241
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVELIM

Note: To survey on WITHOUT PREJUDICE basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third
party vehicle and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned
to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report{@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and third party’s SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Hegards,
Yee Pai L

Claims Assistant (Motor)
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

& Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suniec Tower Fiva
Singapore 0358985

DID.. +65 68299194
Tal - +B5 6825 3166
Bax : +055 GB2f




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 2:04 PM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: YPTO0BE / TP : YN4OSTA/LKK / DOA : 23/11/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle YN 4097A on 27/11/2018,

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 10:22 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP7908E / TP : YN4OS7A/LKK / DOA :23/11/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: G256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 10:02 AM

To: 'admin-d@Ikkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Ol : YP7908E /TP : YN4097A/LKK / DOA : 23/11/2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,



In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be

the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD,

ADDRESS ¢ 1 KAKIBUKIT AVE B
#01-43 BLK C AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
PERSON TO CONTACT . REENA /SUKY! @ 6747 9241
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE ¢ STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on WITHOUT PREJUDICE basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third
party vehicle and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned
to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and third party’s SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee Pei L
Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038585

DID.; +55 6AZ8 9154

Tel © +55 6629 3153

Fax ;. +G5 6329 5247

ERGO

ERGO Iz one of the major insurance greups in Gemany and Europe Worldwide, ERGO is represanted in more than 30 countries and concentrales
on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re {Graup), one of the world's leading risk carriers

WWW Ergo. Com. 50

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
L WWW.ave.com




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 10:02 AM

To: ‘admin-d@Ikkauto.com'

Ce: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com)

Subject: Ol : YPTI08E / TP ; YNAOSTA/SLKK / DOA : 23/11/2018

Attachments: YP7O08E - SAS.pdf; YN409TA - SAS pdf; YNAD9T7A - PRS FORM.pdf

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD
ADDRESS » 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE B
#01-43 BLK C AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
PERSON TO CONTACT : REENA /SUKYI @ 6747 9241

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE  : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on WITHOUT PREJUDICE basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third
party vehicle and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned
to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and third party’s SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
‘ee Pei L

Jdaims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd

ERGO

rldwide, ERGC is represented in more than 30 countries and concentrates
ld's leading rick carriers
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Date:
Our Relerence:

Your Relerence;

Toi

26.11.2018

i +86 @741 FaTva

Ingurance Fre, Ltd, To!947417376 B Y- 1-T-

ERGO

Sent via Fax

YP T908E/SL/pl

67417276

YN 40574

NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD

Emall

Repair Survey (PRS] Acknowled .I:
Wehicle For laspection: YN 405T7A

Insured's Vehicle

Date Of Accidant:

We acknowledgs

¥P 7908E

23.11.2018

recelpt of your request for FAS on:

23112018

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directicns Amendmeant Ne,1 af 2016", do select an assessor from

the list belaw and Indicate your selection in the box marked *. ot LKK
AlS Autemobile Inspection Services Pte Lid 1B5 L.B.5 Aulo Consultanls Ple Lid
FTA FormTeam Consullancy Ple Lid LKK LK Aulo Consullanis Ple Lid
A% Infindi Appraisal Service P Prioiity Services
Pk P Knights Ple Lid VAC Vicom Lid

v Your iequest for Inspection does nod have your cllenl’s cost el repalr estimate, kindiy forward a copy.
our request for Inspection does nol have your cllent's Gla repart, kind Iy forweard 3 copy.
We acknewled ge your Interest for direct settbement, we will assess & revert soan upen receipt of estimate,
Qur Insured"s driver bas net reperled the aceident 1o us lodate,
V |others:  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE
Praparad by: Q_é’\-/ Pelli G819 5154 ﬂiitﬂiﬂﬂmﬂﬂﬂm-iﬂ
Slgnature: ! FAX : 68295247
¥ Asswsscr attanded workshop en:
Assignment Date: Dale:
Asslgnment Tima: Time
Inspector:
Remorks: [:l Vehicla not avallable at the appolntad date and tima.

Klndly acknow|edge our Assassor prasence for the above Job .

Warkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp,
Nete: Our Inspection Ir en o without admission to licbifity basls,



[k

D Belerence

¥Your Beference

26.11.2018

YFP 790BE/SL pl

YN 4087 A

NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD

Pre-Repair Sury PRS] Acknowledgement

Vehicle For Inspection: YN 409TA

Insured's Vehicle

Date Of Accident:

¥P 7908E

23.11.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on

23.11.2018

ERGO

Sent via Fax
6741 7276

ar

Email

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

T

i
the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *. * KK
Al% Automabile Inspection Services Ple [td LBS LB.S Auto Consultants Ple (1d
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Ple Lid LKE LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
1A% Infiniti & ppraisal Service PS Priority hervices
IPK IF Knights Pte Lid WAL Vicom Ltd

v Your request for inspection does not hawe your client’s cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy
Your request for inspection does not have your client's GUA report, kindly forsarnd a copy,
We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of estimate
Our Insured™s diiver bas not reported the accident 1o us todate.
V¥ |others OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE
Prapared by: Q‘ Q Peili 6A29 9194 clai :
T ™ -
Sgnaturs: & FAX : 68299247
Assessor use only; Workshop use only:

Azsignmen] Drate
Assignment Time:

Remarks

Assessor attended workshop on:

Date:
Time
Inspecton;

Dvehkle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presance for the above job |

Workshop Acknowledgement B Stamp,
Note: Our inspection Is on o without admission to lability bosis.
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i e ok Used Cars EI‘.“_Mjli_ﬂir mrlldﬂrr Products Insurance Alﬂdﬂi Forum - Resources

FREE VALUATION

Let us tell you how much your car can sell for! How much is my car worth?

No obligations and it’s FREE!

Post an Advertisement 2009 Model And Jan 2010 Registration.

Sell it yourself! Adverlise it at just g _. ell Maintained And With Super

$58 until it's SOLD! | Nl

StarAd

€ rost en ad E" Advemiser Logn ﬂ'w'.-_‘:-.-s of Salling

Search Seloction  mitsubishi faf3 Ay Aoy 2013 Ay fury Ay Avallable

[ Mitsubishi Fuse Canter FEB3 §35, 800 $8,710 fyr 07-Jan-2013 2977 ¢ - Truck Available
Fuel Type: Masal
LTA Approved Full Canegy, Class 3 License, VPC Not Required, Viehicle In Tip Top Condition, Low Dawn Payment.

|:| Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB3 $43,800 $9,860 fyr DB-May-2013 2,977 e . Truck Availabile
Fuel Type: Diesel
Bock Your Vehicke With Us Now! And Get Insurance Rebate From List 14 Ft Mitshubishi Loy With Open Metal Deck With Sliding Canogy, 1 Cwner ;
Oinly, Very Low Mileage, Do Mot Need VPC, Class 3 Driver Able ... [ rrtnin oo
KSL Automative Pre Ltd
A 2013 Mkl anl Fisn, 2017 mibddighl fuso, Missubis Furse, fritsubisni Busa, Mitsubisn; |
< = |: Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FER3 $41,800 $9,290 fyr 28-May-2013 2,877 oo " Truck Availahle
g W 1_ W Fual Type: Diesel
: —=Mey  High Deck, Wooden Body With LTA Approved Full Canopy, No VPC Required, Class 3 Able To Orive, New Paint, New Seat, All Repair Done Up. Door
[ —— Step Viewing Can Be Arranged. Call Us Now To Arrange For Vi,

ABWIN [ 1994) Pre Lid

D Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB3 540,800 £58,950 fyr 19-Jun-2013 2977 205,000 kbm Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diescl
Lowest Price Tn The Market. No Further Discount, Serious Buyer Are Welkome!

Thirk One Autoemobile & Trading
Tags: 2013 Misubishi Fuse, 2013 mitsubishi fuss, Mitsubich Eialn, mitsubenl fok Mitsubshl, Fisa, fuan

Rapid Autemobile Repair Pte Ltd - Tyres & Rims

Weith more than 15 years in autemobile repair & mairtenance, Rapid Autornalile Repair e Ltd i the placa where you will be guaranteed customer
satisfa

Fore info abouk this shap

[] Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB3 $42,800 8,960 fyr 06-Sep-2013 2,977 ec - Truck Available

Fuel Type: Diesel

Oty 1 Qrwnier, 14ft Deck With Freezer Box, Tip Top CondRicn, Low Mileage, No VPC, Flexbie In Housa And Bank Loan Awallaible With Low Interest.
100% Loan Can Be Arrange. Trada Tn Weicome. Frice Negolia,..

e, PO Mitmibishy Fisd, 2014 mimiobish T mrgabisk Fusd, mitseibishe Tusg, Fsobns Tl TR,

For old advertisements, view Expired ads 20 7 results/page

TR T HEITORY

CUUNAE  ome | New Cars | Used Cars | Sell My Car | Directory | Products | Insurance | Article | Forum |Resources



PARF COE Rebate Enguiry

1of

> Back to OneMotoring

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Chamner 1D Type:

Onwener 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Na.:

Vehicle ta be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vighicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year

Engine No.

Chassis No.;

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Company
0396K

¥ NAOSTA

Mo

23 Nov.2018
MITSUBISHI
FEBIBEASRDEA
White

2013
AMAZATLITIT
FEA3BEAZ108&

52773200
01 Jul 2013
01 Jul 2013
0
$1,387.00

Mo

£0.00

30 Jun 2023

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$5%,001.00

$27.156.00

$27,156.00

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 23 Now 2018

OK

hitps: vl lagovesgia vrl action enguireRebatcByPublicBelore

23/11/2018, 3:25 PM
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NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD.

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C #01-43 Autobay@Kaki Bukit, Sizgapore 417883

Email: admin@nhtmaotor.com
Tel. 6747 9241
UEN: 201718370K
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-43 g3t
Si .
ingapore 417883 heti

Accident date: 21/11/2018

Website: www.nhtmotor.com
Fax: 6741 7276

23/11/2018

Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: YN4097A MITSUBISHI FUSO FE83BE

CHASSIS: FE83BEA21086 3.0M'13
S/n Qty Items / List U/price Amount
1 2 Rear Tail Lamp el $262.00 $524.00 <
2 2 Rear Tail Lamp Bracket | S188.00 $376.00 '
3 1 Rear Number Plate Lamp el-ed $83.00 ~
4 1 Front R/H Seat Cushion ewrrild $1,800:00 % 7005

T 994 SA1900
S8, 45 Subtotal :- $2,783.00
S/n Qty Items / Special Nett U/price Amount
5 1 Rear R/H Ice Box Tailgate ©-..4e0 53.500.00 /692
6 2 Rear R/H Ice Box Tailgate Hinge /¢ rét $280.00 $560.00 ©
7 1 Rear R/H Ice Box Tailgate Centre Bar 2 $950.00 2¢
8 2 Rear R/H Ice Box Tailgate Centre Bar Lock " $280.00 $560.00+
9 1 Rear R/H Ice Box Tailgate Centre Bar Handle B¢ $1.250.00° 40
10 3 Rear R/H Ice Box Tailgate Centre Bar Bracket ,»¢ .~ 5380.00 $1,140.00 ~
11 1 Rear L/H Ice Box Tailgate o<t $3,500.00 /{00
12 2 Rear L/H Ice Box Tailgate Hinge v~ $280.00 $560.00
13 1 Rear L/H Ice Box Tailgate 70km/H Sticker /it $20.00 '
14 1 Rear L/H Ice Box Tailgate Centre Bar =+ $950.00 “ -~
15 2 Rear L/H Ice Box Tailgate Centre Bar Lock  7~*#- 5280.00 $560.00 .
16 1  Rear L/H Ice Box Tailgate Centre Bar Handle &~ $1.250:00~+ L0
17 3 Rear L/H Ice Box Tailgate Centre Bar Bracket M~ 5380.00 $1,140.00 +
18 1 Rear Ice Box Tailgate Body Logo woe $2,500.00 {évo.
19 1 Rear Ice Box Lower Member £, $1,850.00 +
20 1 Rear Ice Box Lower Member Cover r¢ su— $1,200.00 -~
21 1 Rear Number Plate Eek $50.80 2V
22 1 Rear Number Plate Member teod $680.00 «
23 1 Rear Bumper ©ed $1,200.00 009
24 2 Rear Bumper Bracket Sa 5220.00 $440.00- 250
25 2  Rear Chassis Frame Stopper Rubber v. & ~ I30- L ET
2 R°

32,0



Labour charges

To remove & refit ice box tailgate & member cover

Panel beating & repair chassis frame, replace number plate

member & bumper

Spray painting

Date:

Signature:

Subtotal :- $23,936.00

$1,200:00
52.5097@ 820
A0
$1,000-00 ¥00
Subtotal :- $5,000.00
Total:- $31,719.00
3), o003
F 4, ageLs
e ¢
/ l'r}-f !.“j."--/' e



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubs Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg No: 199607138R GST Reg. No. 19-0607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PFTE LTD Ref - CS/EGI1B021283/Avd3n2
QI
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 24-12-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code : EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. ¥P TS0BE Veh. Inspected YN 4087A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No, YPTO08E/SLpl Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  YEE PEILI Assign Date 26/11/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI CANTER c.C 2877
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2013
Chassis No. FEA3BEAZ1086 Colour WHITE
Odometer 320350 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IM ORDER Modification NIL
General GooD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |7.00 R16C CONDOR & mm
L/H Front Tyre 7.00 R16C CONDOR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre 7.00 R16C CONDOR 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 7.00 R16C CONDOR & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE WEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/11/2018 Inspection Date 2711172018
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTELTD
1 KAK| BUKIT AVENLUE & #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

8 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YN 4097A
et Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {;]} “J}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
2|REAR TAIL LAMP @$262.00 CRACKED 524 00 524.00
2|REAR TAIL LAMP BRACKET @$188.00 N/S DAMAGED 376.00 188.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP CRACKED 83.00 83.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -198.75
983.00 596.25
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT R/H SEAT CUSHION (SN) DAMAGED 1,800.00 500.00
1|REAR R/H ICE BOX TAILGATE (SN} DENTED 3,500.00 1,800.00
2|REAR R/H ICE BOX TAILGATE HINGE @$280.00 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 560.00 ‘
1|REAR R/H ICE BOX TAILGATE CENTRE BAR (SN) BENT 950,00 350.00
2|REAR R/H ICE BOX TAILGATE CENTRE BAR LOCK NOT NECESSARY 560.00
@$280.00 (SN)
1 RBE;'\R R/H ICE BOX TAILGATE CENTRE BAR HANDLE BENT 1,250.00 350.00
[SM)
3|REAR R/H ICE BOX TAILGATE CENTRE BAR BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 1,140.00 -
@$380.00 (SN)
1|REAR L/H ICE BOX TAILGATE (SN) DENTED 3,500.00 1,B00.00
Z|REAR L'H ICE BOX TAILGATE HINGE @3$280.00 (SN) MOT NECESSARY 560,00 =
1|REAR L/H ICE BOX TAILGATE 70KM/H STICKER (SN} NECESSARY 20.00 10.00
1|REAR L/H ICE BOX TAILGATE CENTRE BAR (SN} BENT 950.00 350.00
2|REAR L/H ICE BOX TAILGATE CENTRE BAR LOCK NOT NECESSARY 560.00 =
@3$280.00 (SN)
1|REAR L/H ICE BOX TAILGATE CENTRE BAR HANDLE (SN) |BENT 1,250.00 350.00
3|REAR L/H ICE BOX TAILGATE CENTRE BAR BRACKET  |NOT NECESSARY 1,140.00 -
@3380.00 (SN)
1|REAR ICE BOX TAILGATE BODY LOGO (SN) NECESSARY 2.500.00 1,200.00
1|REAR ICE BOX LOWER MEMBER (SN} TO REPAIR SEE 1,850.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR ICE BOX LOWER MEMBER COVER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,200.00 -
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) BENT 50.00 30.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE MEMBER (SN) BENT £80.00 680.00
1|REAR BUMPER (SN) BENT 1,200.00 1,000.00

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18021293/Avd3n2
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
oty P Workshop (§))]  (5)
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKET @$220.00 {SN) BENT 440.00 200.00
2|REAR CHASSIS FRAME STOPPER RUBBER @$180.00 DAMAGED 360.00 240.00
1SN}
26,020.00 9,260.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT ICE BOX TAILGATE & MEMBER 1,200.00 800,00
COVER,
PANEL BEATING & REPAIR CHASSIS FRAME REPLACE 2,800.00 800.00
NUMBER PLATE MEMEBER & BUMPER.INCLUSIVE OF THE
REPAIR OF REAR ICE BOX LOWER MEMEBER
SPRAY PAINTING 1,000.00 800.00
5,000.00 2,400.00
GRAND TOTAL 32,003.00 12,256.25
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 9,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION}

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18021293/Avd3n2

‘g‘
ADRIAN LING WA| PING

E.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE. AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser
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