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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 7:57 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); Chloe

Subject: RE: YN4097A CLAIMING YP7908E DOA 21.11.18

Dear Chloe, 

 

Please refer to ERGO for settlement. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 6:23 PM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: YN4097A CLAIMING YP7908E DOA 21.11.18 
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From: Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>  

Sent: Monday, 14 January, 2019 2:55 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> 

Subject: YN4097A CLAIMING YP7908E DOA 21.11.18 

 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Motor Claims Department, 
 
Please find attached LOD for your reference. Hope to receive offer soon. Thank you.  

 
 

 


